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BR-2774 "B" is for Bad at Getting into Harvard    Rue, Nancy 
     7 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Raise the Flag Series; 
     Book 2 of 6 

Norie's story involves pressure from her father to get good 
grades to get into Harvard, plus be active in school.  She 
confronts a cheating ring and deals with the pressure to join 
them or turn them in to the principal. 

 
BR-3493 1 And 2 Thessalonians           Dunker, Gary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

Paul expresses his caring and concern for the fledgling 
congregation and further instructs them on the Lord's second 
coming, the Anti-Christ and Christian discipline. 

 
BR-2746 1 Timothy, 2 Timothy, Titus       Schuetze, Armin 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
NIV text and commentary passages are paired together for 
quick reference. 

 
BR-1061 100% Beyond Mediocrity        Hartley, Fred 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Advocates total obedience to Christ as the only way to have 
effective, power-packed faith.  Deals with Bible reading, prayer, 
commitment, temptation, the Holy Spirit, persecutions, and 
faith. 

 
BR-3420 2 Corinthians              Dunker, Gary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

Bible Study on 2 Corinthians, learn about Paul's reason for 
delayed visit to Corinth, the wondrous glory of the new 
covenant ministry of reconciling sinners to a gracious God, how 
God's power is perfected in our weakness. 

BR-3489 25 Most Treasured Gospel Hymn Stories 
   Osbeck, Kenneth 

     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 
Each story contains all the verses of the hymn, a Scripture 
passage, and a reflection to give greater meaning. 



 
BR-2845 2nd Helping of Chicken Soup for the Soul/A 
                 Canfield, Jack/Hansen, Mark Victor 

3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Chicken Soup for the Soul; Book 2 
of 12 
Life-affirming stories to warm your heart, soothe your soul and 
buoy your emotions. 

 
BR-2692 3rd Serving of Chicken Soup For the Soul/A  
                Canfield, Jack/Hansen, Mark Victor   

4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Chicken Soup for the Soul; Book 3 
of 12 

     101 More Stories in the Chicken Soup Series 
 
BR-2928 501 Practical Ways to Love Grandkids & Their Parents   
                      Sonnenberg, Roger 

2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; 501 Practical Ways Series; 
Book 2 of 5 
Share your parenting wisdom as you develop positive 
relationships with your grandkids and adult children. 

 
BR-2224 501 Practical Ways to Love Your Husband and Kids  
                       Baker, Jennifer 

4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; 501 Practical Ways Series; 
Book 4 of 5 
Find unique ways to say "I love you" to your family. Broken 
down into 12 months and weekly actions to use. 

 
 
 
BR-3018 501 Practical Ways to Love Your Wife and Kids 
                       Sonnenberg, Roger 

2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; 501 Practical Ways Series; 
Book 1 of 5 
Christ-centered suggestions packed with fun to express your 
love for your wife and kids every day. 

 
BR-1478 52 Stories & Poems for Children    Various Authors 
     4 Volumes; Primary, Children 

Through thought-provoking stories and poems about various 



aspects of Christian living. Helps parents encourage the 
strengthening of their child's faith and character. For children 
ages 7-10. 

 
BR-2157 Abducted                 Stahl, Hilda 

4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Amber Ainslie Detective Series; 
Book 4 of 4 
Amber Ainslie, private detective, accepts a case involving 
Annie, a young girl, kidnapped from in front of her school. For 
Annie's family, this crisis forces them to depend upon God and 
helps them find grace to forgive. 

 
BR-975  Abide in Christ            Murray, Andrew 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

32 heart-searching readings to daily bring you into closer 
communion and fellowship with the Son of God. 

 
BR-2925 Abiding Hope               Benson, Angela 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heart Quest 

Marvin and Shay Taylor's marriage fell apart after the death of 
their 6-year-old son. Now reconciled they determine to start 
fresh in a small Mississippi town. 
 

 BR-998 Abigail                    Henderson, Lois 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Story of Abigail, wife of King David.   
BR-1362 Abolition of Man/The             Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 
 
BR-3575 Abundant Life/The              Krenz, Dianne 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Devotions by various authors will bring you inspiration, 
encouragement, and comfort as you are led by God. 

 
BR-830  According to the Pattern      Hill, Grace Livingston 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 6 of 14 
The story of Miriam Winthrop and her struggle to keep her 
family together. 

 



BR-162  Acres of Diamonds           Conwell, Russell 
     1 Volume; Devotion 
 
BR-1845 Acts                   Balge, Richard 

8 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study of the Book of Acts (NIV). 
 
BR-1614 Adopted and Loved Forever    Dellinger, Annetta 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-3410 After Anne             Henke, Roxanne 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Coming Home to Brewster; Book 1 of 
5 
This novel will touch your heart on many levels as it weaves 
together the joy of friendship, the agony of loss. 

 
BR-930  Again Calls the Owl          Craven, Margaret 
     1 Volume; Biography; Third in series   

The story of a woman who has realized her dreams by 
overcoming many obstacles. 

 
BR-1635 Against the Night            Colson, Charles 
     3 Volumes 
 
BR-2611 All About Angels              Hartman, Jill 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study 

Four sessions to help you take a careful look at what the Bible 
says about angels. 

  
BR-3002 All Done with the Dashing        Dowd, Pamela 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; All Jingled Out; Book 1 of 2 

Maggie wants to make things perfect for others at Christmas. 
But after learning a valuable lesson, she decides to teach her 
family the truth about giving and receiving 

 
BR-1717 All Is Well                    Peretti, Frank 
     1 Volume; Children 

Poverty stricken and low on hope. A divorced mother and her 
daughter prop up their sagging spirits and keep the flames of 



faith alive by clinging to a phrase first heard on a previous 
Christmas "all is well." 

 
BR-2899 All Rivers to the Sea    Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Galway Chronicles Series; Book 2 of 
3 
October 1844, Joseph Burke is hiding in London, Kate awaits 
the birth of a child, British invaders undermine Irish 
independence and the potato famine strikes. All these change 
the face of things in Galway. 

 
BR-3026 All That Glitters               Morris, Gilbert 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction  

Afton Burns joins her estranged father on his movie shoot. 
 
 
BR-1535 All That Was Ever Ours              Elliot, Elisabeth 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A collection of thoughtful essays that invite us to "interpret the 
meaning of the visible in terms of the invisible."  

 
BR-1922 All the King's Horses           Nesbit, Jeffrey 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

Two very different sophomore boys learn to love a younger 
sister who is dying. 

 
BR-3111 All the King's Horses              Mackall, Dandi Daley 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; Book 8 
of 8 
Scoop stumbles on a chance to do something involving horses 
and kids. But some faulty thinking hurts the friends and makes 
it difficult to work together until they realize in Christ they can 
overcome anything. 

 
BR-17  All the Women of the Bible          Deen, Ethel 
     8 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2639 All Things Bright and Beautiful 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 



BR-1532 All Things Heal in Time        Gilge, Jeanette 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer; Book 3 of 3 

Emma's constant struggle to keep her family fed and thriving in 
their rural northern Wisconsin community is complicated with 
the death of her daughter Emmie. 

 
BR-997  All Things Wise and Wonderful      Herriot, James 
     10 Volumes; Devotion 

Sequel to "All Things Bright and Beautiful". (Removed from our 
library) Author recalls his early days. 

 
BR-3317 All Together in One Place       Kirkpatrick, Jane 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When disaster claimed their husbands' lives, 12 pioneer women 
faced the frontier on their own. 

 
BR-3112 Almost Home              Lawton, Wendy 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Church; Daughters of the Faith; 
Series; Book 3 of 3 

        Mary Chilton was one of 102 passengers that sailed on the 
Mayflower.  

 
BR-89  Alone, Alone, All Alone          Belgum, David 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 
 
BR-1696 Always a Springtime             Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 

Reverent poems. 
 
BR-2255 Always Daddy's Girl         Wright, H Norman 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Your relationship with your father influences the rest of your life, 
no matter how old you are.  

 
BR-3528 Amanda               Smith, Debra White 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Austen Series/The;  
     Book 5 of 6 

Amanda Priebe is a great friend to have until the matchmaking 
bug bites. Deciding that her secretary, Haley, needs a beau, 
Amanda dreams up the perfect match—Pastor Mason Eldridge. 



Never mind that Haley is seeing Roger, a respectable dairy 
farmer. And it doesn’t really matter that Mason might be 
attracted to someone else. When it comes to her own heart, 
Amanda can’t seem to make up her mind what she wants to do. 
The handsome and debonair Franklyn West is available so is 
the ever-present Nate Knighton. 

BR-90 Amazing Grace             Byrant, Anita 
    2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2156 Amazing Grace            Osbeck, Kenneth 
     21 Volumes; Devotion  

A daily devotional highlighting Biblical truths drawn from 
true-to-life experiences behind the writing of the well-known 
hymns. Each story includes a portion of the hymn as well as 
suggested Scripture readings and meditations. 

 
BR-2151 Amber Room/The           Bunn, T. Davis 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Priceless Collection Series; Book 2 
of 3 
Jeffrey Sinclair's adventures continue as he searches for 
treasure that was confiscated by the Nazis. 

 
BR-3311 America Looks Up            Lucado, Max 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Faith 

9/11 has shaken our nation, why would God allow this?  
 
BR-3347 Amethyst Snelling,               Lauraine 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Treasures;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Amethyst travels west to find her father's heir, but finds 
shocking news and decides to stay out west. Major J. McChury 
returns from war to settle and soon finds himself enchanted 
with Amethyst. 

 
BR-2914 An Easter Alleluia          Stohs, Anita Reith 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

This book offers beautiful pictures and a delightful rhyme based 
on Matthew 28:1-10 that can be read or sung. 

 
 



BR-3459 An Echo in the Darkness        Rivers, Francine 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mark of the Lion Series; 
     Book 2 of 3 

Continues the story of Hadassah and her work as a healer in 
Ephesus after she is saved from the lion's den. 

 
BR-1590 An Uncommon Gift            Evans, James 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

A dyslexic refuses to accept defeat and shows how to turn a 
handicap into an unexpected blessing. 

 
BR-1231 An Unwilling Guest        Hill, Grace Livingston 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 2 of 14 
During a dull summer in a small Ohio town, Evelyn Rutherford 
finds romance. 

 
BR-3604 Anchored in Love           Cash, John Carter 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

John Carter Cash gives an intimate perspective of his mother's 
musical heritage and devotion to family. He reveals how the 
mountains pulled his mother to her roots, her faith, and her 
family. 

 
BR-1859 And God Came in             Dorsett, Lyle 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The life of Joy Davidman and her marriage to C. S. Lewis. In 
her early childhood she declared herself to be an atheist. She 
joined the communist Party and then had a remarkable 
conversion to Christianity.  

 
BR-136  And God Gave Women Talents!      Taege, Marlys 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-163  And Heaven and Nature Sing       Bjorge, James 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
BR-2095 And the Angels were Silent        Lucado, Max 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Follow the steps of Jesus and stand in His shadow during His 
final week's journey here on earth. 



 
BR-1919 And There was Light        Lusseyran, Jacques 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

The author was blinded at age eight. He was a general 
participant in the French Resistance during WWII and was 
taken prisoner and sent to a German Concentration camp at 
Buchenwald.  

 
BR-2022 And We Have Touched          Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Poetry 
 
BR-2891 Angel Behind the Rocking Chair   Vredevett, Pamela 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The Vredevett family is given God's gift of a son with Down's 
syndrome. He turns out to be the child who perceives the 
unseen angels behind the nursery rocking chair. 

 
BR-1006 Angel of His Presence/The     Hill, Grace Livingston 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

A self-possessed young man's life changes by the needs of 
some young boys. 

 
BR-35  Angel Unaware           Rogers, Dale Evans 
     1 Volume; Biography 

Introduction by Norman Vincent Peale. The story of the Rogers 
daughter born with Down's syndrome. 
 

BR-2830 Angel! Angel!           Dittmer, Cherie Pless 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print  

Follow Mary and Joseph, the donkey, the innkeeper, a spotted 
cow, shepherds, and more to discover.  

BR-2444 Angels among Us             Rhodes, Ron 
3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

     Covers the myths and the truths about angels. 
 
BR-2385 Angels and Demons           Schuetze, John 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

Good versus evil. This conflict is not only evident in the world 
where we live, it is being waged in the spirit world 

 



BR-2886 Angels in the Snow           Carlson, Melody 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Looking for solace after the deaths of her husband and son, 
artist Claire Andrews flees to a cabin in the mountains. On her 
daily walks she encounters footprints in the snow, adult and 
child. 

 
BR-3434 Angels of Morgan Hill/The       Van Liere, Donna 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jan Gable, growing up in Morgan Hill, TN discovers that angels 
are all around us, every day. 

 
BR-2010 Angels on Holiday            Sorenson, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Katie Hooper Series 
     Book 6 of 8 

The weeks leading up to Christmas are filled with bustling 
holiday activities for Katie and her family who plan to spend the 
special day with friends who are without family of their own. 

 
BR-1663 Angels: Mighty Servants of God   Warnke, Richard 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

Bible teachings about the evil angels as well as the 
characteristics and activities of God's good angels. Informative 
and uplifting as you see how God's angels watch over us. 

 
BR-18  Angels-God's Secret Agents       Graham, Billy 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 

Evangelist Billy Graham believes that angels are our 
watch-guardians sent by God and are more important. 

 
BR-1710 Angel Walk               Elwood, Roger 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The angel Darien believes Lucifer shouldn't have been thrown 
out of heaven. God's answer is to let him go to earth and see 
for himself what Lucifer has been up to.  

 
BR-1365 Anger                 Swindoll, Charles 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 
   
BR-1549 Angry Gymnast/The           Jenkins, Jerry 



2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series;  
Book 8 of 8 
Dallas and his friends hope to learn gymnastics from an 
Olympian who promises to train then and make them 
champions. They know it may take years to really become good 
at the difficult sport. 

 
BR-2473 Animals and Me ABC        Horn, Connie Beyer 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Fiction 
 
BR-190  Annalisa                Hunter, Christine 
     4 Volumes; Missions 
 
BR-2486 Another Homecoming    Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kyle Story/A Series; 
     Book 1 of 2 

This book unfolds with World War II. Characters come to life 
through heartbreak and hope and discovery. 

 
 
BR-1946 Another Spring              Bacher, June 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 4 of 6 

As spring returns, the pioneers are willed with anticipation of 
new life. The families work together to solve the mysteries of 
Rambling Gate and overcome the hardships of the Northwest 
Territory. 

 
BR-164  Answers to Anxiety          Gockel, Herman 
     4 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-1514 Answers to Life's Problems        Graham, Billy 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-1598 Answers to Tough Questions 

McDowell, Josh/Stewart, Don 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The authors give answers to tough questions skeptics ask 
about the Christian faith. 

 



BR-1445 Ants in the Sugar Bowl         Boehr, Karren 
3 Volumes; Preteen, Christian Faith; Christian Reader 
Series/The 
Not only will preteens find Trish's plight interesting and 
entertaining, they will also gain insight. 

 
BR-2871 Anything You Can Do I Can Do Better  
                  Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 3 of 20 
An exciting adventure that shows Willie that God loves each 
and every person individually. 

 
BR-3339 Apostles' Creed/The   
       Gimbel, Jim/Gimbel, Abby/Gimbel, Andy/Gimbel, Jo 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Explanation of the Creed to make clear to children. 
 
BR-1641 Applause of Heaven/The          Lucado, Max 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Helps readers deal with fears that rob sleep, bitterness, 
arrogance and insecurity. A built-in study guide provides 
resources for a ten-week small group series. 

 
BR-3530 Apple a Day/An            Boeshaar, Andrea 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; As American as Apple Pie Book; 1 of 
4 
A medical doctor takes offense when health claims are made 
after a health food store owner adds sugar-free. 

 
BR-3531 Apple Annie             Livingston, Joyce 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; As American as Apple Pie; 
     Book 3 of 4 

Brad is a bachelor and a favorite customer at Apple Valley 
Farm Restaurant. He loves Apple Annie but doubts a serious 
relationship will ever develop between them. 

 
BR-3532 Apple Pie in Your Eye           Sattler, Gail 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; As American as Apple Pie;  
     Book 4 of 4 



The pastor's daughter, Lynette, won't date anyone from her 
father's congregation.  

 
BR-3398  Ark of Love               Bliss, Lauralee 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Tails of Love; Book 1 of 4 

Brian is indebted to Bob for helping him start a pet store. In 
gratitude, Brian hires Rachel, Bob's sister, but her skills leave 
much to be desired and could cost Brian his business and 
reputation. 

 
BR-159  Ark on Ararat/The             La Haye, Tim 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
BR-2595 Armed and Dangerous            Fryar, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

You will learn how prayer works, the importance of prayer, the 
nature of praying for others, praying in the will of God, praying 
for all your needs, and how to do it all with greater power. 

 
BR-1477 As For Me and My House        Wangerin, Walter 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Helps you better understand and happily live-out the vows you 
made on your wedding day. 

 
BR-2365 As in a Mirror         Alden, Isabella MacDonald 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction, Originally published in 1897 
     A man's search for truth and the price he pays to find it. 
 
BR-2794 As Sure As the Dawn         Rivers, Francine 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mark of the Lion Series;  
     Book 3 of 3 

Atretes, a German gladiator, won his freedom but his life is 
changed forever when he learns his son is alive. 

 
BR-2439 As the Lily Grows             Kirby, Susan 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Libby Watson Series 

This story continues Libby Watson's journey of faith and love. 
Her life is busy and full. Free from running the general store 
and delivering mail, Libby can devote more time to writing for 
the local paper. 

 



BR-2206 As Time Goes By              Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Californians Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 

The Taylor and Donovan families lives are twined together and 
the story continues as the young people grow in faith and learn 
to cope with life and each other. 

 
BR-3612 Ashamed of the Gospel        MacArthur, John 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

MacArthur warns that the church is being "pragmatic" focusing 
on "success" rather than communicating. 

 
BR-2591 Ashes of Remembrance  Thoene, Brock/Thoene, Bodie 

9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Galway Chronicles Series; Book 3 of 
3 
On his wedding day Joseph is arrested for treason, thrown in 
jail, and shipped across the sea to prison. Kate tries to preserve 
the Burke lands in Joseph's absence. 

 
BR-2793 Ask Willie         Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 12 of 20 

 
BR-2215 At Home Away              Berner, Carl 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Devotion 

Devotions for students, pertaining to problems they will face. 
 
BR-2432 At Home in Mitford             Karon, Jan 
     16 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 1 of 9 

Father Tim begins to feel overwhelmed in his parish, but an 
orphan, a dog, and a neighbor help him. 

 
BR-1868 At Home in North Branch      Richardson, Arleta 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
8 of 10 
Happy with Len in their little house by the river, Mabel is 
content with her life as schoolteacher and minister's wife. Then 
a storm begins to brew as she meets Rowland Brewer and his 
ten-year-old daughter and gets re-acquainted with the Lawton 



Clan who still hold a grudge against Mabel.  
BR-1496 At Wit's End              Bombeck, Erma 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Based on six predictable depression cycles that beset a woman 
during a twelve-month span, these chapters will not tell you 
how to overcome, not how to cope with them, but will help you 
laugh your way through. 

 
BR-191  At Your Age, Miss Russell       Heermann, Lydia 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Romance. Could John and Paula (his old friend) make a new 
life with his children after Amy's death? 

 
BR-3435 Augsburg Confession and It’s Apology/The 
                       Knippel, Charles T. 

1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Confession Series 
An in-depth study of the Augsburg confession focuses on a 
theme, informs how addressed in confession, connects to the 
Apology and gives vision to how it affects daily lives. 

 
BR-119  Augsburg Confession/The        Schroeder, Red 
     1 Volume; Christian Faith 
 
BR-2373 Augsburg Today: This We Believe, Teach and Confess 
                    Mahsman, David (Editor) 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

A look at the Augsburg Confession and how the articles speak 
to us today. 

 
BR-1005 Aunt Crete's Emancipation    Hill, Grace Livingston 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 7 of 14 
Aunt Lucretia receives a visit from her nephew and life begins 
to change for the better. 

 
BR-3118 Awakening/The          Smith, Debra White 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seven Sisters Series;  
     Book 2 of 7 

Supermodel Kim Lan has it all but must face God's ultimate test 
"Will you give it all up for me?" 



 
BR-2734 Away in a Manger          MacKinnon, Debbie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Retelling of the Christmas story as children prepare for the 
Christmas play. 

 
BR-3407 Away in a Manger              Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print  
 
BR-1039 Awesome Power - Listening Heart     Drakeford, J. 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-3037 Baby in a Manger          Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Based on Luke 2:1-19  

In rhyme helps young children learn the story of Jesus' birth. 
 
BR-2489 Baby Jesus is Born            Truitt, Gloria 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2353 Baby Jesus Prince of Peace         Greene, Carol 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Bible Study 

For ages 4-8, reading level grade 2. Luke 2:1-16 for children. 
 
BR-2738 Baby Love Comes to the Rescue   Holdsworth, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Life; Heartland Series/The 
A parable about love that teaches about the fruits of the Spirit. 

 
BR-1774 Back to the Drawing Board         Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 6 of 9 

When a new boy comes to Nick's school and shows his talents 
in drawing, Nick and McGee learn that jealousy causes a lot of 
hurt, anger, and frustration especially for the one who is 
jealous. 

 
BR-2461 Ballistic Bugs       Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 4 of 20 
Willie develops his own "insect attractor" to catch a 
prize-winning locust for the Glenfield Bug-Off contest. When 
Willie stores his concoction in an old shampoo bottle, the 



results are hair-raising. 
 
BR-2820 Bamboo and Lace             Wick, Lori 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Lily Walsh never imagined anything like America. Raised in a 
remote Asian village by a strict disciplinarian father, her life 
changes drastically on a trip to visit her brother in Hawaii. 

 
BR-2932  Baptism                Rossow, Robert 

1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study;Lutheran Difference Series 
Shows how Lutherans differ from other Christian 
denominations. 

 
BR-3576 Barefoot Bride/The       Goodnight, Linda 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Brides Book; 
     Book 2 of 4 
 
BR-1183 Baronets Song/The      MacDonald, George 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of Scotland's "Wee Sir Gibbie," the destitute orphan 
who was unable to speak. 
 

BR-1376 Baron's Apprenticeship/The   MacDonald, George 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2804 Basket in the River/The  

Stockstill, Gloria McQueen 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-820  Battle Manual for Christian Survival/A  Brandt, Leslie 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

For the concerned follower of Christ, who has taken up his 
cross after his Master, and who has been placed and left in this 
world for a purpose greater than mere survival. 

 
BR-2716 Battle of the Bands    Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 5 of 20 
Willie and his friends persuade a great guitar player to join their 
band but that starts a chain reaction to crazy mix-ups. They 



discover that God is in control even in the craziest situations. 
 
BR-1557 Be Alert                Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

Based on 2 Peter, 2 and 3 John, and Jude. This book will help 
you sharpen your spiritual discernment. Join Dr. Wiersbe as he 
uncovers the disguises of today's religious impostors. Religious 
deception is on the rise.  

 
BR-1295 Be Alive                Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Dr. Wiersbe presents the basic teachings of the first 12 
chapters of John's Gospel and urges readers to approach its 
truths with the hearts and minds of worshipers. 
 
 

BR-1543 Be Compassionate           Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

A Bible Study of the Gospel of Luke, 1 - 13. A call to be more 
compassionate. 

 
BR-1218 Be Complete             Wiersbe, Warren 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Bible Study of Colossians. As he did with the Colossians, the 
Apostle Paul calls the reader to be complete. 

 
BR-1275 Be Confident             Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-1711 Be Courageous            Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Take heart from Christ's example. A Bible Study taken from 
Luke 14-24. 

 
BR-1767 Be Daring               Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 

Bible Study of Acts 13-28. God calls ordinary people to do 
extraordinary tasks in His power. 

 
BR-2279 Be Diligent              Wiersbe, Warren 



     6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
Bible Study of Mark. Discover the joy of serving others as you 
walk with the Master Servant. 

 
BR-1829 Be Dynamic              Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Study of Acts 1-12.  Experience the same power that 
motivated early Christians.  
 

BR-1305 Be Encouraged            Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2148 Be Faithful              Wiersbe, Warren 

5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
A Bible Study of 1 Timothy, 2 Timothy, Philemon and Titus. 

 
BR-1332 Be Free                Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-1163 Be Hopeful              Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-1205 Be Joyful              Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     Study of Philippians. 
 
BR-1315 Be Loyal               Wiersbe, Warren 
     5 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-1219 Be Mature               Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     Study of James; Growing in Christ. 
 
BR-1904 Be Patient               Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

As you study the Book of Job you will learn about suffering and 
how to be patient in your trials. 

 
BR-1233 Be Ready               Wiersbe, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 



     Study of 1 and 2 Thessalonians. 
 
BR-1285 Be Real                Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

1 John invites the reader to take a realistic look at love and right 
living. 

 
BR-1306 Be Rich                Wiersbe, Warren 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

Ephesians. A study of each Christian's responsibility, in light of 
his or her wealth in Christ. 

 
BR-1282 Be Right               Wiersbe, Warren 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

Romans. A practical guide to discover how to be right with God, 
yourself, and others. 

 
BR-1872 Be Satisfied              Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Ecclesiastes is an inspired road map that guides you through 
the problems of living and shows you the source 

 
BR-1815 Be Transformed            Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Christ's triumph means your transformation. John 13:21. 
 
BR-1307 Be Wise                Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2123 Be Your Mate's Best Friend    Bly, Janet/Bly, Stephen 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     Applies Biblical principles to marriage. 
 
BR-3586 Beach House/The              John, Sally 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Beach House Series 

A book full of God's faithfulness, The Beach House warmly 
portrays the love, comfort, honesty and support friendship can 
offer women in the face of vulnerability, loss, change and 
self-discovery. 

 



 
 
BR-1274 Beauty for Ashes         Hill, Grace Livingston 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Gloria Sutherland moves to Maine to escape the scandal of her 
previous fiancée. 

 
BR-3357 Because I Said So            Madson, Dan 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Fathers will especially relate to the 36 real-life vignettes of 
being a dad in an often hilarious Christian home. 

 
BR-2355 Because of Stephen        Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Margaret moves out west to help her older brother Stephen 
reform his evil ways.   

 
BR-3023 Because of Winn Dixie         DiCamillo, Kate 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction 

Ten-year-old Opal Buloni describes her first summer in the 
town of Naomi, Florida and all the friends she makes because 
of her big ugly dog, Winn Dixie.  

 
BR-3349 Becoming a Vessel God Can Use     Partow, Donna 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

God accomplishes extraordinary things through ordinary people 
who believe God can and will use them. 

 
BR-1888 Becoming a Woman of Excellence    Heald, Cynthia 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study 

A motivating Bible Study for both single and married women.  
Discover what you should be striving for as you look to God's 
excellence as a model.  

 
BR-1952 Becoming a Woman of Freedom   Heald, Cynthia 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study 

A Bible Study to help you identify and lay aside the burdens 
that can make you feel "stuck". 

BR-3046 Becoming Family  Lauer, Robert H/Lauer, Jeanette C. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 



Advice on how to deal with the major challenges in a step 
family. 

 
BR-2778 Beginners Bible/The  
     9 Volumes; Primary, Braille/Print 
     95 Timeless children's stories 
 
BR-2509 Behind the Locked Door        McCusker, Paul 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 4 of 12 
After reading thriller comic books, Mark's imagination goes wild. 
When his friend Whit forbids Mark to enter a locked attic, Mark 
decides to get past the locked door. 

 
BR-2872 Being a Child of God          Wiersbe, Warren 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Don't be satisfied to remain a spiritual baby. God's ultimate goal 
for His children is maturity. 

 
BR-1752 Beirut Diary                 Levin, Sis 
     4 Volumes; Autobiography 

Sis Levin tells the account of the capture of her husband, Jerry 
Levin, a journalist, held captive for over a year. 

 
BR-1116 Believing God when You Are Tempted to Doubt  
                         Getz, Gene 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     Study of James I. 
 
BR-2770 Beloved       Francisco, Adam/Francisco, Rachel 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography; Heroes of the Faith;  
     Book 2 of 8 

Highlights men and women in the Bible who overcame 
extraordinary difficulties. 

BR-2330 Beloved Enemy                Lacy, Al 
12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Battles of Destiny Series; Book 1 of 
6 
Jenny Jordan's allegiance lay with the Confederate Army. Her 
heart belonged to the enemy. What happens when she is 
caught and ordered executed because she is a spy? 



 
BR-193  Beloved Invader/The           Price, Eugenia 
     5 Volumes; St. Simons Trilogy; Book 3 of 3 

A Northerner goes to war ravaged Georgia on business and 
falls in love with St. Simon's Island. 

 
BR-3096 Beloved Land/The     Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Song of Acadia; Book 5 of 5 

Nicole returns to America where an old family diary reveals an 
extraordinary piece of information. 

 
BR-2741 Beloved Stranger            Pella, Judith 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A spur-of-the-moment wedding leads into a shadowed past. 
 
BR-3055 Best Bible Stories   Doyle, Christopher/Fereday, Roger 
     1 Volume; Primary, Bible Study 

Old and New Testament Bible stories written for young children 
and their understanding. 

 
BR-1269 Best Friends                 Parrish, A. J. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The authors present a case for God as your best friend.  They 
base their position on the Bible, focusing on obedience as the 
key to growing intimate with God. 

 
BR-1426 Best Man/The           Hill, Grace Livingston 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
BR-2964 Bethlehem Night           Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

How this tiny babe's birth brought salvation to earth on that 
Bethlehem night so starry and bright. 

 
BR-2806 Bethlehem Town           Hoffman, Patricia 
     1 Volume 
 
BR-3285 Bethlehem Town           Hoffman, Patricia 

1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
     Based on the Christmas story as revealed in Luke 2:1-19 
     This book tells about the birth of Jesus. 



 
BR-1837 Beyond Mormonism           Spencer, James 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author tells of his experience as an elder in the Mormon 
Church, of how he and his family were persecuted when they 
began to question some of the teachings. 

  
BR-1493 Beyond the Barriers           Morris, Harold 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author writes about God and grace, life and love, as only 
an ex-con can, and how he overcame incredible barriers.  

 
BR-2691 Beyond the Gathering Storm        Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Canadian West Series; Book 5 of 6 

Another story about the Delaney family, first introduced in The 
Canadian West series. Story of Henry Delaney in service of 
RCMP and Sister Christine. 

 
BR-2714 Beyond the Picket Fence           Wick, Lori 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A collection of eight short stories. After each story Lori shares 
personal comments about the characters. 

BR-3   Beyond Today             Thomassen, Rolf 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
 
BR-1450 Bible Heroes, Kings and Prophets 
               Christian, Mary/Woerkom, Dorothy 
     2 Volumes; Children 
 
BR-52  Bible Picture ABC Book        Egermeier, Elsie 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-2356 Bible Promise Book/The         Scripture KJV 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

Over 1,000 Bible promises arranged alphabetically by subject. 
 
BR-3485 Biblical Antidotes to Life's Toxins 
         Gunderson Jr., Glenn K./Gisi, Kathy Zimmerman 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Apply healing scriptural antidotes that release you from the 



crippling tyranny of stress, worry, loneliness. 
 
BR-1959 Bicycle Hills                 Bibee, John 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series; Book 4 of 
7 
Secret bicycle games in a new amusement park lead the young 
cyclists into an adventure of magic. 

 
BR-1758 Big Lie/The           Myers, Bill/Johnson, Ken 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 1 of 9 

Nicholas and McGee discover that telling lies is not convenient. 
 
BR-194  Bit of Christmas Whimsy/A       Edman, David 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3439 Bitter Thistle, Sweet Rose         Glover, Ruth 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Wildrose Series; Book 2 of 6 

When Linn's love is spurned her longing for love turns to 
heartache. 

 
BR-2931 Bittersweet Bliss              Glover, Ruth 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saskatchewan Saga Series; Book 5 
of 5 
Ellie Bonney and Birdie Wharton are very different, but both 
carry secrets. Both must learn to embrace both the sweetness 
and the pain of life on the Canadian frontier. 

 
BR-2286 Blackmail                 Stahl, Hilda 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Amber Ainslie Detective 
Series; Book 2 of 4 
Fighting back her anger, private detective Amber Ainslie must 
find several children trapped in the deadly world. 

 
BR-3345 Blessed are the Merciful      Lacy, Al/Lacy, Joanna 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mail Order Bride Series;  
     Book 4 of 5 

Adam runs away to begin a new life after several heartbreaking 
encounters. He hopes a mail order bride will help him, but the 
bride's arrival brings complications instead. 

 



BR-1215 Blessing/The        Smalley, Gary/Trent, John 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Parents' approval, "the blessing," affects how one views oneself 
and how one relates to others. This book addresses those who 
no longer have any hope of receiving their parents' "blessing." 

 
BR-3428  Blessings and Prayers for College Students 
     4 Volumes; Young Adult, Devotion 
 
 
BR-3517 Blessings by the Handful       Tacke, Rachel 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Examines such things as using our talents for God, taking 
advantage of education over coming fears. 

 
BR-4   Blind and I See           Weller, Robert 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-2803 Blind Man by the Road/The  

Stockstill, Gloria McQueen 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2533  Blind Trust              Blackstock, Terri 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Second Chance Series;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Two weeks before he was to marry Sherry, Clint Jessup 
disappeared without a trace. Suddenly, eight months later, he's 
back with no word of explanation only an impossible request: 
trust him. 

 
BR-2268 Blossoming Love              Stahl, Hilda 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Series; Book 1 of 3 

Laurel Bennett, a rural Nebraska schoolteacher is kicked out of 
her teaching position on rumor. She has nowhere to go until the 
father of one of her students, a recent widower, asks her to 
marry him and take care of his mother-less children. It follows 
the story of how a marriage of convenience turns into love. 

 
BR-3504 Blue Night       Martinusen, Cindy McCormick 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



Kate Porter's husband disappears when the two are vacationing 
in Venice. 

 
 
 
BR-2186 Bluebird and the Sparrow/The      Oke, Janette 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 10 
of 12 
Berta decided that she would be everything her little sister 
Glenna was not. Glenna is sparkling, vivacious, outgoing and 
adored. Berta is serious, dependable, and feels plain and 
ordinary. 

 
BR-3044 Bold Beauty            Mackall, Dandi Daley 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler; Book 3 
of 6 
Winnie has confidence around horses. If only that would 
happen around school. 

 
BR-1934 Bondage of the Will/The         Luther, Martin 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Translated by James I. Packer and O. R. Johnston. This book 
is fundamental to an understanding of the primary doctrines of 
the Reformation. 

 
BR-2331 Boning Knife/The             Shahl, Hilda 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Offering more than the solution to a crime, this book reveals the 
source of power and wisdom for all of life. 

 
BR-2076 Book of Concord/The        Author Unknown 
     22 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

The confessional writings of the Lutheran church, translated 
into English by four respected scholars. 

 
BR-2972  Book of Hours/The          Bunn, T. Davis 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When Brian Blackstone comes to Castle Keep to confront an 
inheritance he doesn't want, he must solve a series of riddles 
about the old estate which his departed wife hopes will lead him 



to spiritual peace. 
BR-20  Book of Revelation/The           Phillips, J. 
     1 Volume; Bible Study 
 
BR-2744 Bookends               Higgs, Liz Curtis 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The hilarious story of two people, same age, same faith, same 
small town, but opposite personalities.  

 
BR-2099 Boomtown               Morris, Gilbert 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Reno Western Saga Series; Book 4 
of 4 
The miners of Virginia City face a mysterious gang of cutthroats 
called the Innocents, who are bent on terrorizing the people into 
giving up their claims. 

 
BR-2988 Born on Christmas Morn     Busch, Melinda Kay 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of Jesus' birth. Luke 2:1-20 for children 
 
BR-2713 Brain Freeze       Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 15 of 20 
Willie and his friends enjoy winter camp, but the "friendly 
competition" is leaving them cold. The results are hilarious as 
they learn important lessons about winning, losing, friendship, 
and God. 

 
BR-3483 Bread upon the Waters         de Graaf, Anne 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Hidden Harvest Series; 
     Book 1 of 3 

Hanna Muller, German by nationality, must work with the 
Germans while helping her Polish neighbors. She falls in love 
with Tadeusz Piekarz who works for her father and their lives 
become entangled with an American spy. 

 
BR-2200 Breaking of Ezra Riley/The         Moore, John 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Johnny Riley, Ezra's father, had been one of the last real 
cowboys. Ezra returns home after his father's death determined 



to make something of the old homestead and remove the 
stigma of past failures. 

 
BR-3484 Brian's Footsteps            Gorman, Carol 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; I Witness Series; Book 2 of 4 
 
BR-2087 Bride for Donnigan/A           Oke, Janette 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 7 
of 12 
Kathleen O'Malley responds to an ad and crosses the ocean to 
meet a total stranger. 

 
BR-3603 Bride So Fair/A               Cox, Carol 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Fair to Remember/A; 
     Book 3 of 3 

Set at the World's Columbian Exposition in Chicago, 1893, 
where Emily Ralston is working at the Children's Building. One 
of the guards brings in a lost boy until they find his mother. 

 
BR-3577 Bride's Song/The              Ford, Linda 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Brides Book; 
     Book 1 of 4 
 
BR-310  Bridge of Buttonwood             Beers, V. 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-1355 Bright Conquest                Hill, Ruth 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
 
 
BR-3058 Bright Easter Day          Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children  

In poetry and art, narrates the story of God's great mercy and 
love unfolding through our Savior's death. 

  
BR-2271 Bright Red Sports Car and Other Stories/The  
                        Deffner, Donald 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 

Ten short stories each posing its own questions for your 



personal reflection or for group sharing. Many of the discussion 
questions reference Bible texts and are designed to lead you to 
apply Scripture to your own life. 

 
BR-56  Brighty of the Grand Canyon     Henry, Marguerite 
     3 Volumes; Children 

A freedom-loving burro befriends a kind old prospector and one 
day watches a vicious stranger kill him. 

 
BR-3389 Broken on the Back Row          Patty, Sandi 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

The story of Sandi Patty, renowned vocalists' tumultuous 
journey from devastating sin through healing forgiveness and 
into God's incredible grace begun on the back row of a church 
balcony. 

 
BR-195  Brother Beloved/A           Arnold, Francena 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1610 Brown Ears             Lawhead, Stephen 
     2 Volumes; Children 

A toy rabbit becomes separated from his young owner and has 
many adventures from which he learns a great deal before 
finally beginning a very worthwhile new life. 

 
 
 
BR-2976 Bryson City Tales            Larimore, Walt 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Bryson City Tales; Book 1 of 3 

The story of Dr. Wal Larimore and his first medical practice 
experiences in the small town of Bryson City, North Carolina. 
He is now President of Medical Outreach for Focus on the 
Family. 

 
BR-1361  Building Stronger Families        Money, Royce 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2466 Building Your Mate's Self-Esteem 
                 Rainey, Dennis/Rainey, Barbara 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 



Gives ten essential building block, such as accepting 
unconditionally, planting positive words. 

 
BR-1124 Burden is Light/The           Price, Eugenia 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The story of darkness before and the light after Miss Price's 
conversion to Christ. 

 
BR-1440 By Hook or By Crook            Briscoe, Jill 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-3478 By the Way              Devantier, Paul 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A collections of 100 messages from one of America's most 
loved devotional radio programs. 

 
BR-3479 By the Way-Encore          Devantier, Paul 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
 
BR-1198 C. S. Lewis had a Wife        Peterson, William 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

An intimate look at the marriages of great Christian leaders 
including C. S. Lewis, John Knox. 

BR-1264 C. S. Lewis, Through the Shadowlands  Sibley, Brian 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

The story behind the movie "Shadowlands" and the relationship 
between C. S. Lewis and Joy Davidman. It is a biography but 
also a love story and a tribute to a couple whose faith, hope 
and love grew through adversity. 

 
BR-2494 Caleb, God's Special Spy         Baden, Robert 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-196  Call Back the Years         Shank, Margarethe 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Siri Gabrielson, a young Norwegian immigrate girl to the 
American Northwest in the early 1900's, learns to lean on a 
source infinitely greater than herself.  Her blind-friend Brigit 
gives her counsel she will never forget. 

 



BR-2927 Call/The                  Guinness, Os 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     Discover the ultimate reason for your life. 
 
BR-2449 Called To Be            Various Teen Authors 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Devotion 

Devotions by teens for teens. Identifies teen problems, offers 
encouragement, and spiritual insights. 

 
BR-3336 Called to Testify            Kremer, Kenneth 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

The testimonies of nine unnamed individuals whose lives 
intersected with the Savior's. Reminds us all that we are also 
called to testify to our Christian beliefs. 

 
 
 
BR-1674 Calling Of Emily Evans/The         Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 1 
of 12 
Were the struggling years of training in bible school sufficient 
preparation for the responsibilities and challenges of running a 
parish? Emily Evans accepts God's call into full-time Christian 
service.  

 
BR-1884 Camouflage Christians             Houtz, E. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Have you ever tried to hide from God? Do you know the 
consequences of hiding versus the consequences of seeking 
the adventure of living for Christ? Offered are some real-life 
illustrations and real-life 

 
BR-3477 Campout Capers        Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
8 of 12 

     Value: Trust 
 
BR-122  Can I Forgive God?            Brandt, Leslie 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 
 



BR-3496 Candle in the Darkness          Austin, Lynn 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Civil War times and Caroline Fletcher is torn between the world 
of slavery she was raised in and the abolitionist stance her 
heart and conscience are awakened to by her faith. 

 
BR-2363 Candy Cane Christmas          Haidle, Helen 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Fiction 
     Enjoy a candy cane and celebrate Jesus' birth. 
 
 
 
BR-1956 Cannons of the Comstock 
                  Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 5 of 
7 
Tom Dawson is the middleman in a bold attempt to infiltrate and 
expose the conspiracy to raise and equip an army that would 
engulf California in the Civil War and break the Union blockade 
that is strangling the South. 

 
BR-2030 Capital Punishment            Bailey, Lloyd 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Straight talk about the death penalty. Focuses on what the 
Bible says. 

 
BR-3363 Captain's Bride/The         Bergren, Lisa Tawn 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Northern Lights Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 

People travel to America in search of freedom - from the 
mountains of Norway to the rocky coast of Maine. 

 
BR-2112 Captive Bride/The            Morris, Gilbert 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 2 of 
13 
The enthralling sequel to "The Honorable Imposter," vividly 
portraying the forces that shaped early American history and a 
family divided by more than the sword. 

 
BR-2393 Captive Set Free                Lacy, Al 



     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Angel of Mercy Series; 
     Book 3 of 10 

Breanna Baylor is kidnaped and ordered to save a labor camp 
from scarlet fever. 

 
BR-197  Captive's Return/The          Gosselink, Sara 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     The story of Onesimus, the runaway servant. 
 
BR-2482 Captured by a Spy               Travis, L. 
     4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ben and Zack Series 

Two boys are kidnaped from their home by Confederate spies 
and taken north along the Hudson River.  

 
BR-198  Captured!                Berkebile, Fred 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2837 Carefree Play Summer Day     Hendrickson, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Simple rhymes and catchy rhythms trumpet a little boy's many 
energetic--and some not-so-energetic activities. 

 
BR-1891 Caretakers of Creation         Slattery, Patrick 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author traveled across the Midwestern United States and 
interviewed Christian farmers from a wide variety of 
backgrounds. 

 
BR-2549 Caring, Values to Live By      Moncure, Jane Belk 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Values to Live By; 
     Book 5 of 5 
 
BR-2675 Cari's Secret               Coyle, Neva 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Cari learns that secrecy casts a shadow, which can only be 
removed by the truth and love and forgiveness. 

 
BR-2743 Carnival of Secrets/A         McCusker, Paul 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 12 of 12 



When Patti wins a stuffed bear at a carnival it leads to a series 
of strange events and a mystery. 

 
BR-3429 Carol for Christmas/A        Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Carol gave up a singing career to marry Jonathan but now all 
he does is work. But an opportunity to sing again makes her 
question what she really wants. Can God heal her crumbling 
hopes? 

 
BR-3294 Case for Christ/The       Strobel, Lee/Vogel, Jane 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Faith 

Looks at Who is Jesus? How reliable is the info about Christ? 
Can a dead man come back to life? 

 
BR-3101 Case for Faith/The        Strobel, Lee/Vogel, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Faith 

Sound Biblical answers to the major questions that challenge 
faith. Evolution, if God is loving why do people suffer, how can 
God send people to hell if he is merciful.  

 
BR-2198 Case of the Disappearing Dirt/The   
                      Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries; Book 2 
of 8 
When the tagalong member of their club disappears, Molly and 
the other members begin a search which gets scary and 
causes them to question their responsibility in the matter. 

 
BR-2523  Case of the Kidnaped Kid     Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
3 of 8 
A rivalry on the baseball field becomes serious when one of the 
players is kidnaped. Read along as three detectives follow a 
trail of ransom notes and mysterious footprints. 

 
 
BR-2788 Case of the Missing Memory    Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
8 of 8 



Chris loses his memory and is accused of robbing a store. 
 
BR-2070 Case of the Mystery Mark/The    Hunt, Angela Elwell 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Nicki Holland Mysteries; Book 
1 of 6 
Nicki is determined to solve the mystery at Pine Grove Middle 
School when a student's research paper is stolen   and 
circumstantial evidence points to her new friend, Kim, a Korean 
American. 
 

BR-2135 Case of the Phantom Friend/The  
                       Hunt, Angela Elwell 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Nicki Holland Mysteries; Book 
2 of 6 
Nicki and four other girls are concerned when their elderly 
friend Mrs. Greaves is threatened. 

 
BR-2229 Case of the Questionable Cousin/The  
                       Erwin, Vicki Berger 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 2 of 6 
Elizabeth's work on blood types for her science fair project 
proves valuable when she becomes suspicious of a young 
woman who is claiming to be Aunt Nan's niece. 

 
BR-2180 Case of the Talking Rocks/The     Palmer, Bernard 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Danny Orlis Series; Book 5 of 
6 
Rumor of a plot that could endanger his sister and brother 
sends Danny to Colorado in search of an old piece of family 
property. From the beginning his mission is plagued by sinister 
threats. 

BR-2259 Case of the Teenage Terminator  
                       Hunt, Angela Elwell 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Nicki Holland Mysteries; Book 
3 of 6 
When Christine Kelshaw's girlfriends congregate in the kitchen 
to give one of the group a permanent, her brother Tommy 
accidentally drinks some of the neutralizing solution and 
undergoes a transformation. 



 
BR-2234 Case of the Terrified Track Star  
                       Hunt, Angela Elwell 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Nicki Holland Mysteries; Book 
4 of 6 
Nicki and her friends try to help their school track team's star 
runner, Jeremy, who has received a mysterious 

 
BR-1297 Catherine Marshall had a Husband  
                        Peterson, William 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

An intimate look at the marriages of great Christian leaders 
including William Jennings Bryan, David Livingstone, John 
Bunyan, and Charles Spurgeon. 

 
BR-2433 Catnapping Caper/The        Erwin, Vicki Berger 

1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 3 of 6 
When 12-year-old Elizabeth sets out to find a prize-winning cat 
which disappears from a used bookstore, she encounters a 
mystery involving rare books, secret messages, and a 
mysterious stranger. 

 
BR-2783 Cats in the Parsonage         Shaffer Jr., Clair 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Taffy and Tiffany, two little furballs, have provided valuable 
lessons and hours of hilarity to their owners Clair and Brenda, a 
country preacher and his wife. 

BR-2836 Celebrate Family            Bratton, Heidi 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Families come in lots of shapes and sizes. God creates each 
family to be very special. Families help us learn, grow, and 
love. In Christ, we are all part of God's family. 

 
BR-2840 Celebrate Feelings            Bratton, Heidi 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

God knows and understands our feelings and He Loves us no 
matter how we feel.  

 
BR-3482 Celebrate Home              Peters, Angie 



     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
Introduces you to the joys and adjustments of caring for your 
children and home. 

 
BR-3390 Celebrate Kids               Peters, Angie 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Great ideas to help you shepherd your flock of loved ones, 
armed with a continued focus on God. 

 
BR-3545 Celebrate Life    Carr, Steven A./Meyer, Franklin A. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Provides accurate information to discuss the myths about our 
world--overpopulated, food shortage, resource shortage, 
abortion, divorce and starvation are nature's solutions. 

 
BR-199  Celia's House              Stevenson, R. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The Dunne family estate on the Scottish border is governed by 
90-year-old Celia Dunne in 1905, and the story weaves thru up 
until 1945 with another Celia in-charge. 

 
 
BR-3328 Centurion at the Cross/The       Bohnet, Eric C. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of Good Friday and Easter Sunday. 
 
BR-2863 Chain Reaction       Scott, Darrell/Rabey, Steve 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Rachel Scott, a victim of the Columbine shooting, believed she 
could change the world one person at a time. She started with 
compassion for the handicapped, those picked on and those 
new in school. 

 
BR-843  Chance of a Lifetime/The     Hill, Grace Livingston  

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
The tender story of faith and love of Alan and Sherrill, each 
offered a chance of a lifetime in different parts of the world, only 
to find that true happiness means being together always. 

 
BR-1786 Chance to Die/A             Elliot, Elisabeth 



     5 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
The life story of Amy Carmichael, an Irish missionary who 53 
years in South India. She founded the Dohnavur fellowship, a 
refuge for children in mortal danger. 

 
BR-1040 Charlotte's Web                White, E. 
     3 Volumes; Children 

The story of a little girl who can talk to animals and her friend 
Wilbur the smug pig, and his friend Charlotte the beautiful 
spider. With the help of Templeton the rat, Charlotte saves 
Wilbur's life. 

 
BR-2497 Chicken Soup for the Soul   

Canfield, Jack/Hansen, Mark Victor 
        7 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Chicken Soup for the Soul;    

 Book 1 of 12 
 
BR-1095 Chickens, Cookies & Cozzin      George  Smith, K. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Five years in a small Arabic village outside Beirut, the author 
and her family made many friends and got to know Cozzin' 
George, who was their driver and mentor. 

 
BR-1883 Child of Adversity              Barr, Jean 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of constant struggle against pain and disability, 
intensified by the privations on the home front during WWII.  

 
BR-2772 Child of Grace              Copeland, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

EJ has a successful career but finds her world threatened by a 
tragic event and she heads home to Cullen's Corner to sort 
things out. 

 
BR-3385 Child of Mine             Winn, Bonnie K. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rosewood Texas Novel 

Danny's mother, Leah Hunter, had been desperately searching 
for her baby for eight years, ever since his father snatched him. 
At last, a clue leads her to the small town of Rosewood, Texas. 

 



BR-857  Child of Rage     Hester, Hygren/Nygren, Bruce 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Glenn Hester's early years as a foster child were abusive and 
he developed into a very troubled adult.  He was able to 
overcome his rage and frustration with Christ's help. 

 
BR-3008 Child Shall Lead Them/A        Komp, Diane M. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Author uses tender stories of her work with children who have 
cancer to illustrate timeless Biblical truth.  

BR-2254 Children at Risk      Dobson, James/Bauer, Gary 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Provides invaluable ideas and suggestions for parents wanting 
to counter negative influences on their children. Reveals how 
children are impacted by television, classrooms, popular 
culture, church and family. 

 
BR-2265 Children of Promise            Tedrow, T. L. 
     5 Volumes; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder Series; 
     Book 2 of 8 

In 1905 Laura's assignment to write an article for the 
newspaper about the new school teacher leads her to start an 
unpopular crusade to get the farm children into school. 

 
BR-1466 Children's Daily Bread            Weiss, Noel 
     3 Volumes; Children 
 
BR-1135 China as I Saw It            Warnke, Mabel 
     2 Volumes; Biography 
     A traveler’s view of China while vacationing. 
 
BR-2134 China Cry         Lam, Nora/Schneider, Richard 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Living in mainland China, Nora Lam faces persecution by the 
Communist regime. When she becomes a Christian she must 
make the life or death choice to leave the country, send her 
children out, or try to survive. 

 
BR-1227 Choices Changes               Tada, Joni 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 



The story of Joni Eareckson as she becomes a woman, making 
decisions that will change her life.  Recounts her meeting and 
marrying Ken Tada, and the beginning of their life together. 

 
BR-2299 Christ Esteem               Matzat, Don 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

People today are trying to find answers to life's difficult 
questions. Going against the tide of psychology, Matzat says to 
forget self-esteem and instead learn to love, honor, and esteem 
Christ Jesus. 

 
BR-21  Christ of the Gospels/The         Beck, William 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-2256 Christian Caregiving, Way of Life    Haugk, Kenneth 
     2 Volumes 

Caring for others in a distinctively Christian way. 
 
BR-2377 Christian Freedom          Fischer, William 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 

Christian freedom refers to sanctification that flows from 
justification. It is a possession for Christians only. 

 
BR-2512 Christian Perspective on Creation vs. Evolution/A 
                                 McCoy, Michael L. 

1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Christian Perspective Series 
For individual or group study, this book contrasts the beliefs of 
the evolutionist with the Biblical teaching. 

 
BR-2479 Christian Perspective on Euthanasia/A 
                      Hartwig, Raymond 

1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Christian Perspective Series 
Questions about life and death  

 
BR-302  Christian View of Abortion        Klotz, John 

2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith; Contemporary Theology 
Series 
Christian look at the problem of abortion. 

BR-971  Christians in the Marketplace        Hybels, Bill 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 



Christian influence into a secular profession. 
 
BR-3388 Christkindl's Gift/The         Morgan, Kathleen 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When an injured stranger shows up one snowy December night 
just before Christmas in 1871, young widow Anna Hannack 
wishes he hadn't. 

 
BR-3467 Christmas Always Comes        Mindrup, Darlene 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Letters; Book 3 of 4 

Kenshin's brother wrote a letter saying he planned to marry a 
girl he met in France instead of Mitsu, whom he was engaged 
to.  

 
BR-2948 Christmas Blessing/The        Van Liere, Donna 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Shoes Book 2 of 2 
 
BR-1665 Christmas Bride/The        Hill, Grace Livingston 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Collector's Choice Series  
     Book 1 of 4 

A wealthy young man saves Margaret McClaren's life and falls 
in love. Then she disappears. 

 
BR-2867 Christmas Candle/The        Evans, Richard Paul 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction 

A fable about charity. 
 
BR-3591 Christmas Flower           Reece, Colleen L. 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Old Fashioned Christmas/An; Book 4 
of 4 
Shana Clifton cannot ignore the feeling God is leading her away 
from Alaska to the Great Smoky Mountains of North Carolina. 
But what about her childhood friend, Wyatt Baldwin, who insists 
on following.  

BR-3449 Christmas Homecoming          Worth, Lenora 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Davis Landing 

Jeremy Hamilton has returned home, possible to rejoin the 
family business. Perhaps the spiritual life of Gabi Valencia will 
help create a Christmas homecoming for Jeremy. 

 



BR-3290 Christmas Hope/The           Van Liere, Donna 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of love in the face of loss, joy when all seems 
hopeless and how light can shine. 

 
BR-3015 Christmas in the City          Mayne, Debby 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Snowbound for Christmas; Book 2 of 
2 
A man with a shady past seeks shelter from a snowstorm. 
Kathryn is running her aunt's city house during December and 
isn't sure whether to give the man help. 

 
BR-3323 Christmas Message/The         Miller, Claire 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The Savior's birth and the angel's message. 
 
BR-2791 Christmas Mystery         Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
1 of 8 
It is two days before Christmas and the detectives need to 
solve four mysteries. 

 
BR-3077 Christmas Necklace/The         Langer, Maryn 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Christmas/A 

The great Chicago fire destroys the home of widower Lucinda, 
so she takes employment in the country. Will a law student help 
her after she is wrongly accused of theft and thrown out at 
Christmas? 

BR-2926 Christmas Quilt/The         Davis, Thomas J. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Follows seven months of a mountain family in Georgia from the 
time Uncle Joe says he might come home for Christmas and 
how the family prepares for him, even though it's been many 
years since he has really come. 

 
BR-2975 Christmas Shoes/The         Van Liere, Donna 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Shoes; Book 1 of 2 

If we're open to it, God can use the smallest thing to change our 
lives even a pair of shoes. 

 



BR-3038 Christmas Story According to Luke/The  
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Christmas story as taken from King James Version of the Bible. 
 
BR-141  Christian Encounters Drug and Drug Abuse 
                                          Cassens, James 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2809 Church Ladies/The             Samson, Lisa 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Poppy Fraser is a pastor's wife with a dark secret. She would 
run away if she could until she gets involved in Mildred LaRue's 
prayer group with other local pastors' wives. 

 
BR-116  Church of the Catacombs/The      Oetting, Walter 
     3 Volumes; Church History 
 
BR-3359 Church Signs across America 
                  Paulson, Steve/Paulson, Pam 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

Church bulletin board signs from across America. 
 
BR-3486 Cinnamon Lake-Ness Monster Mystery/The 
                      Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries; Book 7 
of 8 
While solving the mystery of a monster in Cinnamon Lake, 
Mollie and Dirt learn the value of courage. 

 
BR-2748 Circle of Fire                 Lacy, Al 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 5 of 7 
In the fifth installment of the Journeys of the Stranger series, 
legendary hero John Stranger works to break up an eight-man 
band of night riders who are terrorizing local ranchers near 
Billings, Montana. As he works to bring justice to the outlaws, 
John remains unaware that another "stranger" has adopted his 
identity and is robbing and murdering people in the area. 
Ultimately, the Stranger brings in the last night-riding bandit, 
only to find himself 



 
BR-2812 City Girl                   Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Rose Trilogy;  
     Book 3 of 3 

City girl Reagan Sullivan may know her way around New York 
City, but is unprepared for armadillos and tall Texans. A gentle 
story of learning to trust and discovering joy along the way. 

 
BR-2619 City Not Forsaken/A     Morris, Gilbert/Morris, Lynn 

        4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series;    
 Book 3 of 8 

Cheney goes back to New York to set up a society medical 
practice where people will appreciate her. But a cholera 
epidemic soon draws her back into a call to help the poor. 

 
BR-1303 City of Fire/The          Hill, Grace Livingston 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3381 Close Your Eyes              Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 4 
of 12 
Sierra experiences a sticky situation when Paul comes over for 
dinner and Randy shows up at the same time. Will she learn to 
trust God with her feelings for them? 

 
BR-1953 Closer Look at the Reality of the Resurrection/A 
                          George, Bob 
     1 Volume; Bible Study 

Explores the truth that Jesus gave His life for us. 
 
BR-2061 Closer Look at the Word of God      George, Bob 
     1 Volume; Bible Study 

A Bible Study to help Christians look for answers by 
understanding the truth of Scripture in day-to-day living. 

 
BR-3520 Closer than Ever             Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 
11 of 12 
When Paul doesn't show up for graduation and news comes 
that a flight from London crashed, Sierra frantically worries 



about the future. 
 

BR-3000 Cloth of Heaven               Hoff, B. J. 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Song of Erin 

A saga of tragedy and triumph of thunder and grace.   
 
BR-1874 Cloud of Witnesses/A         McGrath, Alister 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

The ideas of ten leading Christian thinkers presented, along 
with information about their lives and times. 

BR-2858 Clouds                  Gunn, Robin 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series; 
     Book 5 of 8 

Shelly Graham's job as a flight attendant transfers her to her 
home town, where she realizes how much she misses and 
loves childhood sweetheart Jonathan. 

 
BR-2621 Clubhouse Surprises      Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
5 of 12 
Fergus helps the other members see how they can all work 
together to make a clubhouse everyone can enjoy. 

 
BR-2851 Cobra Threat            Brouwer, Sigmund 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series; 
     Book 3 of 6 

After discovering tainted water, Roy Linden uncovers the 
connection between the high school's new star quarterback, his 
own football future and the source of the pollution. 

 
BR-2447 Coffee Break Meditations         Grube, Edward 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Bible-based meditations which offer spiritual nourishment in a 
lighthearted format.  
 

BR-2935 Colder than Ice               Stengl, Jill 
2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christmas Sleigh Ride; 

     Book 1 of 2 
Estelle's fiancé died in the Civil War, and now she thinks 
Christmas is no longer worth celebrating. 



 
BR-170  Collection of Meditations 
                  Brenneman, /Drescher, John 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-2799 Colors I See in Church        Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1873 Come As You Are             Johnson, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

55 short devotions to help teens discover answers to questions 
they have about themselves. Encourage them to know Jesus 
cares about them "just the way they are". 

 
BR-1391 Come Before Winter ... and Share My Hope 
                        Swindoll, Charles 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Daily readings to help you face the "winters" of life, endure 
them, and then find renewal in God's grace. 

 
BR-1920 Comeback         Dravecky, Dave/Stafford, Tim 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

A look at the life of baseball players, at Dave's faith and 
courage, at his coming back against all odds after his battle 
with cancer, and his testimony to the faithfulness. 

 
BR-2742 Common Life/A               Karon, Jan 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series; 
     Book 6 of 9 

The story of Father Tim Cavanaugh's wedding to Cynthia 
Coppersmith. Involves all the Mitford characters. 

 
BR-3432 Community              Masaki, Naomichi 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Spirituality Series/The 
Bible Study on our spiritual relationship to community - to 
church, our giving and receiving. 

 
BR-1325 Complete Fairy Tales of George MacDonald 
                       MacDonald, George 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



BR-2977 Confession                Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

This charming book for young children teaches the importance 
of confession and the gift of forgiveness. 

 
BR-3392 Confession                Pless, John T. 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Spirituality Series/The 
Bible Study covering sin, the law, repentance, Jesus, the friend 
of sinners. 

 
 BR-2557 Confession/The             Lewis, Beverly 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heritage of Lancaster County; Book 
2 of 3 
Shunned by the Amish community where she grew up, Katie 
sets out to find her birth mother. 

 
BR-3598 Confronting Life Threatening Illness    Packo, John 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Biblical and practical! Within the pages of this book the reader 
will find transforming truths for body, mind and soul. Learning to 
think positional, act with authority and stand on the foundation 
of God's love. 

 
BR-1474 Contest/The             Matranga, Frances 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Children 

Randy finds it difficult to obey Christ's teaching when his project 
for the class craft contest is stolen. 

 
BR-2410 Contrary to Popular Belief        Hower, Stephen 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-1757 Coping-Spiritual Power        Schroeder, Paul 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Helps us learn to cope with ourselves, with others and with 
God.  

BR-868  Corrie's Christmas Memories Ten      Boom, Corrie 
     1 Volume; Biography 
 
BR-1869 Cote of Many Colors/A           Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 



Mark and Timmie longed for a pet of their own. They loved all 
the animals on the farm, but they loved carrier pigeons most of 
all.  

 
BR-64 Cottage by the Sea             Harrell, Sara 
    2 Volumes; Children 
 
BR-2455 Countdown to Christmas       Zimmerman, Laura 
     1 Volume; Primary, Devotion 

For families with children ages 3-10. Devotions and ornament 
crafts help explain Advent, Christmas. 

 
BR-1753 Counterattack                Carty, Jay 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Counterattack will help you learn why your prayers sometimes 
seem powerless and how you can resist temptation.  

 
BR-2163 Counterfeit Christ of the New Age Movement 
                                        Rhodes, Ron 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

An expose of the New Age movement and how their beliefs 
compare to Christianity. Takes individual teachings of the New 
Age movement and refutes them with Scripture. 

 
BR-1809 Courage to Pray           Brownson, William 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

The importance of prayer and its possibilities.  Encourages one 
in regular prayer. Each chapter has Scripture passages and 
questions for thought. 

BR-2546 Courage, Values to Live By      Moncure, Jane Belk 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Values to Live By; 
     Book 2 of 5 
 
BR-2870 Courtship of the Vicar's Daughter/The 
                       Blackwell, Lawana 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Gresham Chronicles/The;  
Book 2 of 3 
Andrew's daughter Elizabeth is being courted by a young 
curate, when a man she once loved appears at the door.  

 



BR-2293 Covenant of Love/A           Morris, Gilbert 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Appomattox Saga Series  
     Book 1 of 4 

The Rocklin family stands at the edge of emotional and 
financial ruin during the Civil War. Cousins Clay and Gideon 
Rocklin both love Melanie Benton. That love would spur one to 
greatness and one to self-destruction. 

 
BR-1938 Covenant/The               Stahl, Hilda 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; White Pine Chronicles Series Book 1 
of 3 
The White Pine Chronicles begins the story of Jennet Cordell 
and Freeman Havlick in 1863. Sold by her father Jennet 
dreams of escaping but Freeman has his own plans for her.  
The great White Pines of Michigan are being harvested at great 
speed and as their story unfolds they will try to save the 
vanishing 

 
BR-2875 Covenant/The              Lewis, Beverly 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Abram's Daughters 
     Book 1 of 5 

Secrets threaten the serenity of their cloistered world as the 
Covenant unveils the layers of deeply rooted Amish tradition as 
seen through the eyes of Leah and Sadie Ebersol, two 
courting-age sisters. 

BR-1142 Cowslip                 Haynes, Betty 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     Devotions for a husband and wife. 
 
BR-1358 Crimson Mountain         Hill, Grace Livingston 
     3 Volumes 
     Continues the story Jeff Lymann and Marion 
 
BR-1649 Crimson Roses           Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Each week when Marion went to the concert she found a 
beautiful crimson rose in her seat. She had no idea who was 
giving her this rose until she met Jeff Lyman.  

 
BR-2375 Crimson Snow             Kritlow, William 



     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Lake Champlain Mysteries 
When the assistant pastor is found dead in a snow bank, Win 
Brady is sent from the seminary to replace him. Win finds 
himself in the midst of trying to help solve the mystery of the 
murder and trying to help the church. 

 
BR-1730 Cross and the Crescent/The        Parshall, Phil 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Living as a missionary among Muslims, Phil Parshall 
understands the Muslim heart and mind.   

 
BR-98 Cross and the Switchblade/The      Wilkerson, David 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

The account of a minister’s attempt of helping seven boys 
indicted for the murder of a crippled teen. 

 
BR-2708 Crossroad/The              Lewis, Beverly 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Amish Country Crossroads Book 2 of 
3 
The journalist who helped Rachel discover the secret of the 
postcard may be able to help her regain her sight. 

BR-2847 Cruisin' the River of Light        Various Authors 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Devotion 

Teens from across the country share honestly about relying on 
Christ for strength and direction. 

 
BR-2448 Cry on Desert Winds            Carlton, Bea 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

How a vacationing family gets involved in the mysterious goings 
on of illegal aliens, kidnaping, Satan worship, and drug running. 
They are surrounded by fear and know that only God can save 
them now. 

 
BR-2395 Cup of Wrath/The            Glazener, Mary 
     18 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A novel based on Dietrich Bonhoeffer's resistance to Hitler and 
the impact Bonhoeffer had on the German Resistance during 
World War II. The account is based on biographical facts of his 
life. 

 



BR-1167 Curate's Awakening/The       MacDonald, George 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Young Thomas accepts the responsibility of his first parish with 
deep sincerity and commitment. 

 
BR-3072 Daddy Loves His Girls           Jakes, T. D. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

It explores the fatherly love God has for his daughters. Offers 
healing for women with painful pasts and gives men the 
courage to speak the healing power of love to their daughters. 

 
BR-2969 Daddy Promises            Arquette, Kerry 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

Promises of love, protection, teaching, sharing, listening and 
playing that a dad makes to his child. 

 
BR-1648 Daily Pathways              Rice, Helen 
     2 Volumes; Poetry 

Day by day, we venture onto pathways that are unknown. 
 
BR-2815 Daily Prayer             Pfotenhauer, Patra 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
A study of the Lord's Prayer.  

 
BR-855  Daily Rate/A            Hill, Grace Livingston 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 4 of 14 

     Romance. Celia Murray, a beautiful young woman, rents a 
room to an educated young man (Horace Stafford) and conflict 
and love abound.  First published in 1900. 

 
BR-1579 Daily Stepping Stone           Rice, Helen 
     2 Volumes; Poetry 

Daily Stepping Stones is a collection of day-starters in three 
parts, each beginning with a Scriptural verse followed by a 
poem and closing with a thoughtful prayer. 

 
BR-2569 Dakota Dawn            Snelling, Lauraine 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Book; Book 1 of 4 

Nora Johnson comes from Norway to marry Hans in the Dakota 



Territory. But promises turn into uncertainties. 
 
BR-2570 Dakota Destiny           Snelling, Lauraine 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Book; Book 4 of 4 
     Mary and Will have been best friends since childhood. 
 
BR-2568 Dakota Dream            Snelling, Lauraine 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Book; Book 2 of 4 

Clara Johnson comes from Norway to marry the American of 
her dreams. 

BR-2567 Dakota Dusk           Snelling, Lauraine 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Book; Book 3 of 4 

Jude helps rebuild teacher Rebekka's school which has burned 
to the ground. 

 
BR-2860 Dale Evans Rogers - Rainbow on a Hard Trail 
 Rogers, Dale Evans/Rohrer, Norman B. 
  3 Volumes; Adult Autobiography  

Dale Evans Rogers reflects on her life from her early career 
through 50 years of marriage to Roy Rogers, his death and 
dealing with her own rehabilitation after her stroke always 
reflecting God's hope even in affliction. 

 
BR-2585 Damaged but Not Broken        Burkett, Larry 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Financial advisor Larry Burkett tells about his own cancer 
experience. 

 
BR-2768 Dana's Valley      Oke, Janette/Logan, Laurel Oke 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The story of Dana and the trials and fears they face as a family 
in times of adversity. 

 
BR-2128 Dance with Deception/A         Colson, Charles 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Commentaries from Colson's radio program, this book covers 
topics of current events. Tells how the public is being misled 
because we fail to look from a Christian point of view.  

 
BR-1743 Danger at Half-Moon Lake         Biggar, Joan 



2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Adventure Quest Series; Book 
2 of 4 
Thirteen-year-old Billy, visiting his pastor Uncle in Alaska, 
befriends an orphaned native Alaskan boy.  

 
BR-2508 Danger Lies Ahead             McCusker, Paul 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 7 of 12 
After the new kid at school has ensnared Jack in a web of lies, 
Jack turns to his parents. 

 
BR-3454 Dangerous Marriage      McDill, S. R./McDill, Linda 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Provides help for women victims of domestic violence.  How it 
affects the abused, the abuser, the children. 

 
BR-2005 Daniel                    Jeske, John 

6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
The People's Bible Commentary. A Bible Study commentary 
written for the layman. 

 
BR-3588 Danzig Passage      Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Zion Covenant Series;  
     Book 5 of 6 

Opening in 1936, the Zion Covenant series tells the courageous 
and compelling stories of those who risk everything to stand 
against the growing tide of Nazi terrorism that is sweeping 
through central Europe under the dangerous and deceitful 
guise of Hitler's Third Reich. As the net of Hitler s Third Reich 
begins to close around the Jews in prewar Europe, two families 
face the grim reality of life in the New Germany. 

 
BR-202  Daphne Deane          Hill, Grace Livingston 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1620 Darcy                    Tada, Joni 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

Darcy is disabled.  She must use a wheelchair. She is tired of 
being different.  



BR-1639 Dare To Discipline            Dobson, James 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

This forthright, practical, reassuring guide explains why children 
crave firm control, how the best parent-child relationship is built 
on respect and ultimate loyalty to God, and why discipline is the 
key to real love. 
 

BR-2929 Dark Passage               McCusker, Paul 
1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 9 of 12 
While the boys were searching for a lost ball they stumbled 
upon a hidden trap door. 

 
BR-1897 Dark River Legacy             Hoff, B. J. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Daybreak Mystery/A;  
     Book 4 of 4 

When Gwynevere Leigh, mystery writer, returns to her 
hometown, she finds herself snared in a mystery more terrifying 
than any of her books. A vicious battle between the power of 
God and the forces of evil. 

 
BR-3547 Dark Sun Rises/The         Williamson, Denise 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Roots of Faith; Book 1 of 1 

Joseph is the favored manservant of Abram Callcott, owner and 
master of Delora plantation in antebellum Charleston. But when 
Brant, the master's son, discovers that Joseph can read, he 
becomes a serious threat to the ingrained societal laws of the 
South. 

 
BR-2011 Dating                  Kirby, Scott 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Provides answers to questions asked by young Christians 
exposed to almost no Biblical teaching in the area of love, sex, 
and dating. Each chapter is followed by discussion questions 
and Scripture references. 

 
BR-2014 Dating Dilemma/The         Stone, Bob/Palmer, Bob 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Deals with dating behavior and teenage sexuality in a tastefully 
hones manner. 



 
BR-2298 Daughter of Grace    Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 2 of 9 
When Corrie Belle Hollister and her brothers and sisters found 
their father in Miracle Springs, their reunion was tentative at 
best. This journal shows the developing relationships between 
the reunited Hollisters. 

 
BR-203  Daughter of Nazareth          Bauer, Florence 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1558 Daughter's Devotion/A        MacDonald, George 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A splendid story about the life of a simple merchant's daughter. 
Mary Marston's unswerving commitment to love God and others 
is seen against a backdrop of diverse characters. 
 

BR-2825 David and Goliath       Jander, Martha Streufert 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-3078 David and His Friend, Jonathan       Dietrich, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Based on 1 Samuel 19-20. The story of two Old Testament 
friends. 

 
BR-1258 David I                Keller, W. Phillip 

4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
     A biography of King David of Israel. 
 
 
BR-919  David Livingstone            Worchester, J. H. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The life of David Livingstone is one of the most inspiring and 
fascinating Christian stories ever told. 

 
BR-204  Dawn of the Morning       Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of a runaway bride in 19th century upstate New York. 
 



BR-2846 Dawning of Deliverance/The        Pella, Judith 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Russians Series; Book 5 of 5 

Mariana, the daughter of a princess and a count, is raised in a 
peasant village. When thrust back into the elite society she 
determines to do something meaningful with her life. 

 
BR-3613  Dawn's Light             Blackstock, Terri 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Restoration Book/A;  
     Book 4 of 4 

As the worldwide power crisis ends and the world slowly 
emerges, the Bannings face their toughest crisis yet. Will God 
require more than they're prepared to give? 

 
BR-2334 Day by Day We Magnify Thee      Luther, Martin 
     14 Volumes; Devotion 

Readings which concentrate on Christ and Christian life.  
 
BR-66  Day God Made It Rain/The        Kolbrek, Loyal 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Children 
 
BR-2055 Day of the Fire Storm          Hilliard, Susan 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Decide Your Own Adventure 
Series 
The reader returns to the time of Elijah. Why did he order the 
execution of all priests of Baal?  

BR-1870 Daylight Intruder/The          Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 2 of 8 

Karlyn's apartment has been broken into. The intruder left some 
strange hints of his visit. Karlyn seeks Margo's help in solving 
some of the mysterious happenings. 

 
BR-2642 Daytime Prayers            Browne, Yolanda 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2161 Deadline                 Stahl, Hilda 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Amber Ainslie Detective 
Series; Book 1 of 4 
Carla is a fiction editor whose world is shattered by a 
mysterious story that appears on her desk. The story accuses 
Carla of murder and threatens revenge. Amber Ainslie, private 



detective, must unravel the mystery. 
 
BR-3108 Deadly Chase/The          Hunt, Angela Elwell 
     4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Colonial Captives 

A ship taking children to America meets up with a whaling ship. 
Abigail tries to stop the whalers, Ethan tries to live his Jewish 
laws and Kimberly tells all about the love of Jesus. 

 
BR-2411 Deadly Deception            Morris, Gilbert 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Danielle Ross Mystery Series; Book 
3 of 6 
Danielle Ross is approached by the terminally ill patriarch of an 
organized crime syndicate to investigate the murders of his son 
and daughter-in-law. 

 
BR-1898 Dealing with Your Discontent       Steinke, Peter 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Ideas to help you come to terms with daily and long-standing 
disappointments, ranging from a flat tire, losing a job promotion 
or feeling unappreciated. 

BR-2773 Dear Lady              Hatcher, Robin Lee 
7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Coming to America Series; Book 1 of 
4 
Set in the 1800's, this is the story of Beth Wellington who 
comes from England to the U.S. to escape her past. But secrets 
come into the open and bring hearts together in faith. 

 
BR-1994 Dear Mister Missionary         Wendland, E. H. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Letters to and responses from Pastor Wendland while he 
served in Central Africa. 

 
BR-206  Dear Papa                 Bjorn, Thyra 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A heart-warming chronicle of a lively, loving family as 
remembered by Mama herself. 

 
BR-1596 Dear You              Robertson, Donald 
     4 Volumes; Devotion 
 



BR-2379 Dear Zoe                 DePree, Max 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

DePree struggles to understand his own feelings during the 
premature birth of his granddaughter and the special closeness 
that develops as he watches her struggle for survival. 

 
BR-1276 Dearest Anna               Rau, Deborah 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     Story of friendship, love, family ties, and faith. 
 
BR-2503 Dearest Debbie           Rogers, Dale Evans 
     1 Volume; Biography 
 
 
BR-2227 Deborah of Nazareth           Cutting, Edith 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

Deborah dreamed of having a husband and children and 
suddenly a marriage offer comes from a wealthy man who can 
offer her silk robes and a beautiful home. Are riches what 
Deborah wants? 

 
BR-3089 Deep Harbor           Bergren, Lisa Tawn 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Northern Lights Series;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Elsa and Tora are now in Washington Territory and plan to ship 
across the Pacific. 

 
BR-207  Deepening Stream/The        Arnold, Francena 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1270 Deeper Christian Life/The       Murray, Andrew 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Describes Christian spiritual life. The author tells how to have 
daily fellowship with God, how to receive the fullness of the 
Holy Spirit, and how to lead others to God. 

 
BR-1744 Defender of the Faith         Ludwig, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     A powerful biographical novel of Queen Victoria. 
 



BR-2905 Defense Never Rests/The       Parton, Craig A. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Powerful critique of American Christianity provides a defense of 
the pure Gospel. Believers and skeptics will both benefit as 
they evaluate honestly the Christian Gospel. 

 
 
 
BR-3610 Delirious Summer/A           Blackston, Ray 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

In this sequel to Flabbergasted, Neil Rucker takes a vacation in 
Greeville, S.C., hoping to find his dream girl before returning to 
teach Spanish to missionaries in Ecuador.  

 
BR-2623 Desert Detectives       Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series Book 
6 of 12 
Myra discovers a strange animal sleeping in the Desert Critter 
Clubhouse. 

 
BR-3580 Desert Star               Chaiken, Linda 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1751 Destined To Mature          Derstine, Gerald 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Listen for God's voice, share the joys of faith, minister the "good 
news", advance in your prayer life, and mature into Christian 
adulthood. 

 
BR-1044 Devil on the Deck              Dick, Lois 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Fictionalized account of events that led to John Newton's 
acceptance of God's amazing grace, including his six years on 
sailing ships in which he caused trouble, deserted, and even 
became enslaved in Africa. 

 
BR-1905 Devotional Thoughts on Favorite Hymns 
                        Robinson, James 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

The devotions in this book were derived from the rich 



theological truths expressed in favorite hymns, and from related 
Bible text. Each hymn is followed by a prayer and background 
of the hymn. 

 
BR-3463 Diamond Place           Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Hart's Crossing; Book 3 of 4 

Lyssa wants to make the boys baseball team. She needs to 
impress the coach.  

 
BR-1309 Diapers & Dishes or Pinstripes           Tchividjian, Gigi 
     5 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1105 Diary of a Loving Heart          Bacher, June 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Is A Gentle Stranger Series; 
Book 3 of 6 
 

BR-1049 Dietrich Bonhoeffer-Martyr           Brown, J. 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

The young German pastor executed by Nazi's. 
 
BR-2500 Different Kind of Courage/A 
                   Horskey, Jim/Cutshall, Mark 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

A top-rated Blue Angel pilot finds that being the best is not 
enough. 

 
BR-2196 Disappearing Card Trick/The     Erwin, Vicki Berger 

1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 1 of 6 
When the most valuable baseball card of Elizabeth's collection 
disappears, her mother's first new date and a suspicious 
baseball card dealer are likely suspects. 

 
BR-1501 Disappointment with God        Yancey, Philip 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

A large measure of comfort is offered to those who have 
suffered loss. In this book the author advances a carefully 
reasoned explanation of why God allows such losses to occur 
in the first place. 

 



BR-1546 Disciplines of the Beautiful Woman   Ortlund, Anne 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Young and old, homemakers and career women can all profit 
from sound advice on how to live beautifully. Sections on 
prayer, meditation, and disciplining combine practical "how’s" 
with thoughtful and considered whys. 

 
BR-171  Discoveries                Price, Eugenia 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-2884 Distant Beacon/The    Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Song of Acadia; Book 4 of 5 

Anne and Nicole once again find themselves facing divergent 
futures. Anne settles in England and Nicole heads to the 
colonies to manage her uncle's land holdings.  

 
BR-1645 Divine Footprints           Kauffeld, Eugene 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

A detailed study of many of the passages of the Bible that refer 
to the reincarnate Son of God during the centuries before he 
assumed human flesh and lived visibly on earth. 

 
BR-2146 Divine Footprints Fulfilled       Kauffeld, Eugene 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

The first part of this book is an account of the fulfillment of 
God's promised Messiah. The second part is a chronological 
listing and description of teachers.  

 
BR-1526 Divorce Recovery             Brock, Anita 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Helpful advice for problems like: erasing the resentment; 
controlling mental flashbacks; forgiving yourself and your 
former mate. 

BR-2295 Dixie Widow/The            Morris, Gilbert 
6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 9 of 
13 
Belle Wickham, daughter of Sky and Rebekah, becomes a 
widow when her husband becomes a casualty for the South. 
She becomes a spy for the Confederacy and is taken into the 
home of her grandfather. 



 
BR-2769 Do I Have to Paint You a Picture?       Rue, Nancy 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Raise the Flag Series; Book 4 
of 6 
Breanna and her mother moved from Oakland to Reno to 
escape racial tensions. Suddenly she is back in the middle of 
black/white violence, but this time she has the flagpole girls 
praying for and supporting her. 

 
BR-1785 Do the Bright Thing             Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 7 of 9 

Take a look inside Nick's brain and see how decisions are 
made. He gets input from his family, friends, the Bible and, of 
course, McGee.  

 
BR-38  Doctor Bessie             Rehwinkel, Alfred 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The story of Dr. Bessie is a true account of the life of a pioneer 
lady doctor on the western and Canadian frontiers during the 
horse and buggy days. It is an eyewitness account of what life 
actually was like when these parts of the US and Western 
Canada were opened for civilization.  

 
BR-22  Does the Bible Contradict Itself     Arndt, William F. 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
 
 
BR-2561 Dog Days         Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 14 of 20 
Willie befriends an elderly neighbor and his friends make fun of 
him. Willie learns that some of God's most valuable treasures 
are the people He puts into our lives. 

 
BR-833  Dog for Joey/A              Gilbert, Nan 
     3 Volumes; Children 

Everything for Joey changes for the worse when his family 
moves to town from the farm he loves.  When Joey gets a 
chance to raise a puppy for Guide Dogs for the Blind. 



 
BR-3400 Dog Park            Koehly, Dina Leonhardt 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Tails of Love; Book 3 of 4 

Lynne's dog bites Matt's dog and Matt demands she pay the vet 
bill. 

 
BR-1659 Domino Image/The             Hoff, B. J. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Daybreak Mystery/A; 
     Book 2 of 4 

A Daybreak Mystery.  Daniel and Jennifer meet two strangers 
on their honeymoon.  One a Christian music star and the other 
a hauntingly familiar composer with a shadowy past.  

 
BR-2520 Donovan's Daughter             Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Californians Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

When an angry snowstorm forces Marcail Donovan to seek 
shelter for the night at Dr. Alexander Montgomery's house, the 
schoolteacher is thrust into a small-town scandal that threatens 
her career. 

 
 
BR-1903 Don't Check Your Brains at the Door 
                  McDowell, Josh/Hostetler, Bob 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Faith 

Myths about God, religion, and life. 
 
BR-2889 Don't Count on Homecoming Queen     Rue, Nancy 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Raise the Flag Series; Book 1 
of 6 
Six girls meet at "See You at the Pole" to pray and form a 
Christian friendship. Tobey's story involved suspicions of sexual 
abuse by the track coach on a teammate. 

 
BR-39  Don't Forget             Wedge, Elizabeth 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-2787 Don't Rock the Float  

Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 
1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 



Series; Book 17 of 20 
Willie and Felix agree to head the float committee for Founder's 
Day.  

 
BR-3431 Don't You Wish              Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 3 
of 12 
Sierra is excited about visiting Christy Miller in California during 
spring break, until her sister Tawni decides to go with her. Will it 
help their troubled relationship? 

 
BR-1720 Door in the Dragon's Throat/The     Peretti, Frank 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cooper Kids Adventure 
Series; Book 1 of 4 
As Jay and Lila Cooper embark on another adventure with their 
father, they can't help wondering about the other people who 
have tried to open the door.  All fled in panic or died horrible 
deaths.   

BR-1088 Dorie                  Van Stone, D. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2723 Double Dare                Byrd, Sandra 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Secret Sisters; Book 5 of 8 

Tess wants to be noticed. But making her mark has a high cost.  
 
BR-2211 Double Life              Hood, Sheila Jean 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Sheila had no idea when she married Bill that he would deceive 
her, rob her, and finally leave her for other men. The story of 
how this woman's courage handled the situation with God's 
help. 

 
BR-3356  Downhill Challenge     Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game On 2 Timothy 1:7 

Beth is an awesome snowboarder, but her father favors her 
sister, a skier headed for the Olympics. Will Beth give up her 
dreams to win her dad's approval? 

 
BR-695  Dr. Anne         Swanson, Gloria/Ott, Virginia 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 



The inspiring story of Anne Carlsen, who overcame great 
physical handicaps to become a nationally renowned educator. 
Anne Carlsen serves a testimony to God's love and purpose for 
our lives.  

 
BR-1420 Dr. Dobson Answers Your Questions   Dobson, James 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-3409 Dream a Little Dream          Kelly, Theresa 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Aloha Cove;  
     Book 7 of 8 
     Cass and Tabitha try to find God's way to help friends. 
 
BR-2441 Dream Fulfilled/A               Lacy, Al 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Angel of Mercy Series;  
     Book 4 of 10 

Stefanie Andrews moves to Denver to work in the hospital with 
Breanna Baylor. 

 
BR-1964 Dream/The                Stahl, Hilda 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; White Pine Chronicles Series; Book 3 
of 3 
The Chronicles continue on Lower Michigan circa 1922 as 
Jannet, matriarch of the powerful Havlick clan, tries desperately 
to fulfill her dream for the majestic White Pines. 

 
BR-1187 Dreams Beyond Tomorrow         Bacher, June 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journey to Love Series;  
     Book 2 of 5 

The story of pioneers Rachel and Cole and their hopeful 
journey to love and faith. Sequel to Journey to Love. 

 
BR-2679 Dreams on Ice              Lewis, Beverly 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Girls Only; Book 1 of 4 

Eleven-year-old Olivia Hudson eats, breathes, and dreams of 
becoming an Olympic skater.  

 
BR-1735 Dream-Teller               Bolliger, Max 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Biography 
 



BR-3030 Driven           Sims, Carolyn/Simms, Lynn 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography; Heroes of the Faith;  
     Book 6 of 8 

Highlights men and women of the Bible who overcame 
extraordinary difficulties. Their stories show that God chooses 
ordinary people to do His extraordinary work. (Leader's guide 
included) 
 

BR-1047 Dropping Your Guard         Swindoll, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Guidelines for a continual, faithful walk with God for those who 
experience a "new life" in Christ. 

 
BR-2392 Drums of Change             Oke, Janette 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 12 
of 12 
Running Fawn is sent to the white man's school. How can she 
adjust to this strange world? 

 
BR-1992 Ducktails                 Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Enjoy this heartwarming story of the adventures of Quackery, 
the duckling who knew he was different, but who had to swim 
faster, dive deeper and be smarter than any other duckling in 
his family. 

 
BR-1201 Duskin              Hill, Grace Livingston 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 12 of 14 
A Mid-western construction site is no place for a young and 
pretty girl, as Carol Berkley soon discovered. 

 
BR-1831 Dying of Embarrassment & Living to Tell About It 
                       Peterson, Lorraine 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Squarely faces the primary issues confronting teens at school, 
on the job, with friends and family.  

 
BR-1913 Dying to Come Home          Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 8 of 8 



Timothy Bemis was one of the last prisoners released from 
Hanoi. During the years he was away someone was using his 
name committing robberies and a murder. Margo and Philip try 
to prove Tim's innocence.  

BR-2127 Each Day with Jesus          Norden, Rudolph 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

This inspiring collection of daily devotions draws you closer to 
Jesus through short reflections on His person, preaching, 
teaching and especially His loving work of redemption for you. 

 
BR-3020 Eager Star           Mackall, Dandi Daley 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler; Book 2 
of 6 
Winnie wants to be a horse gentler and she is already caring for 
one. Now she has to train another before an important race. If 
she succeeds she may become part of the "in" crowd at her 
new school. 

 
BR-2640 Early Easter Morning  

Beuschlein, Marti/Hoffmann, Patricia 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2911 Easter ABCs               Anders, Isabel 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 
     Easter story told using ABCs for each event. 
 
BR-2843 Easter Adventure         Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
7 of 8 
Buzz and a cat are missing. Tobias becomes very sick. Easter 
is only a few days away. Can the club solve the mystery without 
Tobias and before Easter arrives? 

 
BR-2912 Easter Cave/The             Wedeven, Carol 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 
      
BR-3426 Easter Gift/The        Jander, Martha Streufert 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Story of Easter Resurrection. 
BR-3351 Easter is for Me!          Mackall, Dandi Daley 



     1 Volume; Preschool, Biography 
As little ones listen to this book, they will learn about Easter and 
why we celebrate it. 

 
BR-3321 Easter Story According to Matthew/The 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 
     The Easter story told in Matthew 26. 
 
BR-3309 Easter Surprise       Howie, Vicki/Macleon, Moira 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

At first light on Sunday morning, just as Mary comes into the 
garden, she sees the stone rolled away from the tomb. Lift the 
flaps and discover the special surprise that she finds on Easter 
morning! 

 
BR-3059 Easter Victory/The           Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book 
     The story of Easter Matthew 26-28. 
 
BR-2000 Eat Well Live Well            Smith, Pamela 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Book of nutrition helps for a healthier diet. Tells what to eat, 
when to eat, and how much to eat for more stamina and higher 
performance. Also includes a recipe section. 

 
BR-2060 Ecclesiastes and Song of Songs       Ehlke, Roland 

5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study commentary written for the layman. 
 
BR-2372 Echoes                  Gunn, Robin 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series; 
     Book 3 of 8 

Lauren Phillips is recovering from a broken engagement when 
she meets K.C. on the Internet. 

BR-2973 Echoes of Mercy               Cote, Lyn 
6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Blessed Assurance Series; Book 3 of 
3 
Date 1920's Meg Wagstaff, Del Dubois and Gabe St. Clair all 
carry secret pain from World War I. They face racial prejudice 



and the disillusionment of lost hope.  
 

BR-2620 Edge of Paradise/The          Anderson, Ken 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A tale of man's struggle to understand God's essential nature 
and the meaning of life.  

 
BR-1827 Ehrdman's Book of Christian Poet    Alexander, Pat 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Poetry 

A treasury of poems and the stories of their writers.  It brings 
together many of our best-loved hymns. With each hymn is a 
story about its writer, its settings, or its meaning to a particular 
individual. 

 
BR-1850 Eighteen and On Her Own      Richardson, Arleta 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
6 of 10 
Cold stoves, scarlet fever, and a break-in at the schoolhouse 
are only part of the problems Mabel must face in her first year 
of teaching.  

 
BR-1471 Elect Lady/The           MacDonald, George 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The Elect Lady shows that neither earthly happiness nor earthly 
suffering are everlasting.  As you read, you will decide who the 
elect lady is.   

 
BR-3291 Elixir                  Bunn, T. Davis 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When Kerra Revell, heiress of Revell Pharmaceuticals, goes 
missing, Taylor Knox sets out to find her. 

BR-1961 Elizabeth Gail & the Dangerous Double   Stahl, Hilda 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Elizabeth Gail Series; 
     Book 4 of 18 

When Elizabeth Gail arrived at her foster grandparents' town 
she met trouble while walking down the street.  Who was 
posing as Libby's double and getting her into trouble with the 
Law?  

 
BR-2064 Elizabeth Gail & the Mystery at the Johnson Farm 



                          Stahl, Hilda 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Elizabeth Gail Series;  
     Book 1 of 18 

Elizabeth Gail loved her foster parents. Just as Libby started to 
relax and accept their love, some strange things began to 
happen. The mystery deepens and so does Libby's faith in the 
Johnson's God. 

 
BR-2029 Elizabeth Gail & the Strange Birthday Party 
                          Stahl, Hilda 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Elizabeth Gail Series; 
     Book 6 of 18 

Who was hiding on the Johnson's farm and spying on Libby and 
her family? It took a strange birthday party and a family of nosy 
guests to bring the answers. Another Elizabeth Gail mystery. 

 
BR-1930 Elizabeth Gail & the Teddy Bear      Stahl, Hilda 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Elizabeth Gail Series;  
     Book 3 of 18 

Why did Grandma always keep a worn teddy bear in a chair by 
her table?  Libby found herself right in the middle of a mystery 
when she was given responsibility of protecting Teddy from a 
menacing stranger. 

 
 
 
BR-2077 Elizabeth Gail and the Trouble at Sandhill Ranch 
                          Stahl, Hilda 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Elizabeth Gail Series;  
     Book 5 of 18 

Elizabeth Gail looked forward to her vacation, but found trouble.  
Who was Holly Davis and what was her secret? Why was 
everyone afraid of Nolas Brown? 

 
BR-2983 Elizabeth's Christmas Story          Dede, V. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Luke 1:5-66  
Story of Elizabeth, mother of John the Baptist. 

 
BR-2390 Elton Trueblood: Believer, Teach     Newby, James 



     5 Volumes; Biography 
Biography of the noted Quaker educator, scholar, writer, and 
apologist. 

 
BR-2816 Emerald Windows           Blackstock, Terri 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Brooke Martin is a stained glass artist who was wrongly 
accused of having an affair with her art teacher. Now she is 
back in town to design the windows for a church and must work 
with her teacher, Nick Marcello. 

 
BR-996  Emotions...Can You Trust Them?     Dobson, James 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Practical guidelines and simple steps to help us understand and 
control our emotions. 

 
BR-2408 Empire Builders             Chaiken, Linda 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Great Northwest Series; 
     Book 1 of 1  

Set in the 1870's, the Building of the Trans-continental Railroad 
and western expansion. 

 
BR-2587 Emptiness and Abundance        Schulz, Susan 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Under His Wings;  
     Book 1 of 5 

Emptiness is a study of Psalm 63; Abundance is a study of 
Psalm 66. 

 
BR-1629 Enchanted Barn/The        Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Shirley Hollister was forced from her home and had only a short 
time to find a place for her mother, little brothers and sisters to 
live.  

 
BR-913  Encourage Me             Swindoll, Charles 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 
     The Lord can and will lift you up! 
 
BR-211  Enduring Hills/The             Giles, Janice 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



 
BR-3466 Engagement of the Heart        Paul, Kathleen 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Letters; Book 4 of 4 

Betsy Anderson wrote many letters to soldiers in the service. 
She receives one from a soldier in an army hospital saying that 
her fiancé died. But Betsy was never engaged. 

 
BR-173  Epistles Now               Brandt, Leslie 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-1810 Escape from the Island of Aquarius    Peretti, Frank 

        2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cooper Kids Adventure   
 Series; Book 2 of 4 

When Jay and Lila travel with their father to a South Sea island, 
they find some strange things happening. As they attempt to 
solve the mystery they encounter many deadly perils. A thrilling 
adventure tale. 

BR-2380 Escape into the Night           Johnson, Lois 
5 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 1 of 6 
In 1857 twelve-year-old Libby joins her father aboard the 
Christina and proves that she can be trusted. 

 
BR-2313 Escape to Freedom           Phillips, Michael 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Secret of the Rose Series; Book 3 of 
4 
Matthew, Sabina, and the Baron must find an escape route 
from the East to the West. They are stalked by evil men who 
get closer with every move. How will they ever escape to 
freedom? 

 
BR-2096 Eternal Passage             Schulte, Elaine 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; California Pioneer Series; 
     Book 3 of 4 

Louisa Setter is fleeing her abusive husband. If she can make it 
to the California Territory, her relatives will take her in. 

 
BR-1615 Ethel Barrett's Bible Stories Book 1    Barrett, Ethel 
     2 Volumes; Children 
 



BR-1616 Ethel Barrett's Bible Stories Book 2    Barrett, Ethel 
     2 Volumes; Children 
 
BR-1544 Euthanasia          Spring, Beth/Larson, Ed 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Provides an eye-opening overview of the debate over 
euthanasia. The author's helpful assessment of current 
theological, medical, social, and legal attitudes toward the 
dying, graphically illustrated by actual case studies. 

 
 
 
BR-3539 Eve, Sarah, Rebekah, Leah, and Rachel  

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Great Women of the Bible; Book 
1 of 4 
In this four-session, small-group Bible Study series, participants 
will look at the lives of only the most familiar women in God's 
Word. From Eve, the first woman, to those women who helped 
Jesus' apostles, participants will see God's grace in action as 
He calls and leads these women in their daily lives. 

 
BR-3120 Even Now               Kingsbury, Karen 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Lost Love Series; Book 1 of 2 

A man and woman separated by lies and long years. A young 
woman seeking answers to heart's deep questions. A tapestry 
woven of lives, losses, love and faith and the miracle of 
resurrection. 

 
BR-3361 Ever After               Kingsbury, Karen 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Lost Love Series; Book 2 of 2 

Emily Anderson is so happy that her parents will finally get 
together and she suddenly meets the "right" one. But the war in 
Iraq may be what tears the whole family apart. 

 
BR-3007 Every Day is Saturday 
                 Harvey, L James/Harvey, Jackie 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This Christian guide can help you find great opportunities and 
practical information about your new life. 

 



BR-3298 Every Day with the Savior       Norden, Rudolph 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
     Daily devotions for use throughout the year. 
 
 
BR-2649 Every Little Thing about You         Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Rose Trilogy; 
     Book 1 of 3 

Liberty Drake is the deputy sheriff of Shotgun, Texas. Slater 
Rawlings is a former Texas Ranger. Their first meeting is hardly 
ideal. 

 
BR-2978 Every Storm                Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A World War II love story, where characters face every 
challenge through faith which helps weather any storm.  From 
downed aircraft on deserted island to battle on the seas. 

 
BR-1595 Everyday Discipleship for Ordinary People 
                         Briscoe, Stuart 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

A collection of "parables to people." More than a hundred letters 
and anecdotes ranging from pigeons to parking tickets, from 
salmon to sandals, and roosters to ropes.  

 
BR-1456 Everyone Needs Someone          Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Poetry 
 
BR-3346 Everything I Long For          Carlson, Melody 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Whispering Pines Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Maggie Carpenter settles in to run the newspaper in Pine 
Mountain and tries to help a young runaway girl. 

 
BR-2288 Everything You've Heard is Wrong 
                       Campolo, Anthony 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Campolo suggests that in a world where things are measured 
by dollar signs, we can do well by doing good. 

 



BR-2527 Evidence of Mercy           Blackstock, Terri 
11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sun Coast Chronicles Series; Book 
1 of 4 
Young lawyer Lynda Barrett can no longer afford her plane. 
Jake Stevens is a potential buyer. They embark on a test flight 
that ends in a crash which shows clearly that someone is out to 
see Lynda dead. 

 
BR-1063 Exit Betty             Hill, Grace Livingston 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 8 of 14 
Betty Stanhope is the victim of a secret plot to wrest away her 
fortune through a forced marriage to one of her stepmother's 
wicked sons.  Can his efforts be thwarted by someone who 
knows the truth? 

 
BR-2233 Exodus                Wendland, Ernst 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study commentary written for the layman. 
 
BR-2222 Experiment/The               Myers, Bill 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Journeys to Fayrah Series; 
Book 2 of 5 
Cross-dimensionalized to the land of Fayrah, where they are 
confronted with realities that science cannot explain, Joshua 
and Denise discover the meaning of God and His love. 

 
BR-2607 Ezekiel             Kuschel, Kieth Bernard 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

 
BR-3616 Ezra/Nehemiah/Esther           Brug, John 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

BR-3004 Face the Music      Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 
1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 18 of 20 
When a teacher's stolen purse is found in Willie's locker, he has 
to serve detention. 



 
BR-2684 Facing Cancer Together         Brown, Pamela 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Ways you can help when a friend faces the cancer crisis. 
Includes Bible readings and prayers to share. 

 
BR-1515 Facing Death and the Life After      Graham, Billy 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author calls us to confront the sobering fact of death 
realistically, but always with the confidence that through our 
relationship with Christ we can conquer this final enemy. 

 
BR-2588 Faith                  Copeland, Lori 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of the West 1872 Series; Book 
1 of 6 
Faith, who lives in Michigan, answers an ad to become a 
mail-order bride of a wealthy Texas rancher. 

  
BR-1527 Faith of Our Founding Fathers       LaHaye, Tim 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Were the men who carved this nation of out of the wilderness 
and drafted its founding documents God-fearing, Bible-believing 
Christians?  

 
BR-3611 Faith of the First Ladies  MacGregor, Jerry/Prys, Marie 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Short vignettes about first ladies from Martha Washington to 
Laura Bush. 

 
 
BR-2669 Faithful Heart                 Lacy, Al 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Angel of Mercy Series;  
     Book 2 of 10 

Breanna Baylor travels to San Francisco to visit her younger 
sister. Breanna, her sister, and children struggle to save the 
man they love but can no longer trust because of a Civil War 
post-traumatic stress disorder. 

 
BR-149  Faithful Rebels              Blumhorst, Roy 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 



 
BR-3518 Faithfulness, Gentleness, Self-Control   Burgland, Lane 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Bible Study on three of the fruits of the spirit. How the Christian 
can bear fruit in the Lord's service. 

 
BR-2397 Fall of Jerusalem/The           Wise, Robert 

9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; People of the Covenant Series; Book 
3 of 3 

     The story of one family's struggle to survive.  
 
BR-1949 Falling Off Cloud Nine        Peterson, Lorraine 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Addresses teenage concerns and presents spiritual truths in a 
way which intends to be relevant to conduct. 

 
BR-2319 Family Garden of Christian Virtues   Lawrence, Susan 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

A hands-on way to plant God's Word in a child's heart during 
devotion time. For families with children ages 3-10. 

 
BR-41  Family Nobody Wanted/The        Doss, Helen 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

Rev. and Mrs. Doss adopted 12 children.  
 

BR-1537 Famous Hymns and Their Stories    Idle, Christopher 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 

This book brings together the stories behind a selection of 
well-known hymns.  It will both encourage and inspire. 

 
BR-1068 Fanny Crosby              Barrett, Ethel 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

Biography of Fanny Crosby who, though blind since birth, wrote 
more than 8,000 hymns. 

 
BR-1530 Father Who Calls/The           Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Devotional Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 

The four captivating books in Janette Oke's Canadian West 
Series are filled with honesty, warmth and spiritual insight about 



life, faith, God and things of eternal value.  
 
BR-5   Father, Son, and a Three Mile Run   Leenhouts, Keith 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

The author reveals the special relationship between himself and 
his son. Inspiring, instructive, and practical. 

 
BR-2747 Feeling Guilty, Finding Grace       Weeden, Larry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Shows how you tell the difference between real guilt and false 
guilt. 

 
BR-2141 Feud with God/A           Heerman, Lydia 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

A novel about a young woman who turns her back on God 
when she thinks God has let her down. She is determined to 
live her life on her own, without God, even though her family is 
devoted Christians. 

 
 
BR-1536 Few Things I've Learned since I Knew It All 
                           Cook, Jerry 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This book focuses on the biggest things in life: God, ourselves, 
others, success, guidance, ministry, and mystery. The author 
offers insights to the "basics" that we only glimpsed dimly 
before. 

 
BR-3452 Fiddler's Secret/The            Johnson, Lois 

5 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 6 of 6 
When Libby and Friends meet a violinist on board the 
"Christina" he seems to have a secret, which becomes even 
bigger when they reach St Paul and his violin is stolen. Libby, 
Caleb, Jordan try to help him find it. 

 
BR-2753 Field of Hope        Butler, Brett/Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Just when Brett Butler had it made as a big league baseball 
player, he has to battle cancer. 



 
BR-3495 Fighting Cancer with Faith      Schmieding, Scott 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Faith 
 
BR-2300 Final Adversary/The           Morris, Gilbert 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 12 
of 13 
Barney Winslow walked away from family and bitterness and 
rage. He came to believe the promises of the prizefighter ring. If 
he could only control his drinking he would have all the money 
and women he wanted. His life changed when he was 
confronted on another continent with an adversary he never 
dreamed existed. 

 
 
 
BR-2626 Final Curtain/The            Morris, Gilbert 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Danielle Ross Mystery Series; Book 
2 of 6 
Danielle Ross goes to New York City to investigate death 
threats against arrogant stage actor Jonathan Ainsley. Dani and 
Ben must bring the curtain down on the "Phantom" before he 
strikes again. 

 
BR-2004 Final Touchdown/The         Palmer, Bernard 
     2 Volumes; Children; Danny Orlis Series; Book 1 of 6 

Danny's cousin, Larry, is just out of the reformatory, and the two 
of them are playing on a team that is sure to win.  

 
BR-2850 Final Week of Jesus/The          Lucado, Max 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

If you would truly know the heart of Jesus, consider his final 
days. Retrace Christ's steps to the cross.  

 
BR-3491 Finding Father Christmas         Gunn, Robin 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Miranda Carson's search for her father takes her to England 
with only a few clues as to who he might be. Welcomed by a 
family who doesn't recognize her, she must decide whether to 
reveal the truth or go home. 



 
BR-3526 Finding Marie            Davis, Susan Page 
     10 Volumes; Fiction 

Marie Belanger knows nothing about the covert assignments 
her naval lieutenant husband goes on from time to time, but 
she's pleased that their tour in Japan has ended. Pierre and 
Marie's hopes for the future include a State side posting and 
perhaps even starting a family. While Pierre wraps up his 
duties, Marie plans a brief trip to visit family in Maine. 

 
BR-42  Finding My Way             Dahl, Borghild 
     1 Volume; Biography 
 
BR-3498 Finding Noel             Evans, Richard Paul 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Mark Smart's accidental meeting of Macy Wood during the 
Christmas season sends them on a search for her sister from 
whom she was separated. Only the Christmas ornament with 
"Noel" on it provides the clue. 

 
BR-215  Finding of Jasper Holt/The     Hill, Grace Livingston 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2150 Finding the Love of Your Life     Warren, Neil Clark 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Ten principles for choosing the right marriage partner you can 
love and live happily with for a lifetime. 

 
BR-3377 Finding Your Way 
              Reece, Colleen L/Reece-DeMarco, Julie 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Motivating stories of over comers, practical tips for navigating 
the adult world and spiritual secrets. 

 
BR-2919 Fingernail Moon             Webster, Janie 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

To protect her daughter, Janie Webster took her on a 
pilgrimage around the world.  

  
BR-23  First Christians                Maier, Paul 



     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-3515 First Christmas Present/The     Sommerer, Marilyn 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This charming picture book for young children tells the simple 
story of the best Christmas present. 

BR-24  First Christmas/The           Meier, Dr. Paul 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2329 First Corinthians            Toppe, Carleton 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study commentary written for the layman. 
 
BR-25  First Easter/The             Meier, Dr. Paul 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-151  First Fruits                  Rein, R. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
     God's guide for giving. 
 
BR-1800 First Job                Sorenson, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Christian Life 

Sara and Katie babysit to earn money for skis until Sara 
discovers that God has other moneymaking plans. 

 
BR-1036 Fisherman's Lady/The        MacDonald, George 
     7 Volumes; Fiction 

Romance, danger, and intrigue.  Malcolm, a fisherman by 
trade, discovers the secrets of his past. 

 
BR-2024 Fit To Be Tied         Hybels, Bill/Hybels, Lynne 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

An honest book about marriage and relationships and how 
Christians live their faith in marriage. Combines Biblical advice 
and reality. 

 
BR-1486 Five Silent Years of Corrie Tenboom    Rosewell, P. 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

A moving story of the last five years in the life of Corrie Ten 



Boom.  
 
BR-3470 Flabbergasted              Blackston, Ray 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A quirky look at singles, dating and the church. How the Holy 
Spirit catches the hero even when he is not looking for anything 
but a girl but ends up with faith and commitment. 

 
BR-926  Flames of Rome/The             Maier, Paul 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Church History 

How Christianity reached Rome. Accurate historical novel. 
 
BR-1893 Flight from Stonewycke 
                   Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Stonewycke Trilogy Series; Book 2 of 
3 
It continues the sweeping saga of three generations in the lives 
of an aristocratic family. 

 
BR-1580 Florence Nightingale           Dinger, Sandy 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Florence Nightingale believed God called her to become a 
nurse. The system of nursing that she developed would 
revolutionize medical care. 
 

BR-3050 Florian's Gate              Bunn, T. Davis 
5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Priceless Collection Series; Book 1 of 
3 
Jeffrey Sinclair takes on a job in a London Antiques Shop and 
discovers secrets of the trade. 

 
BR-3060 Follow Me                Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Story from the Gospels from the time of Jesus calling Peter to 
discipleship through the resurrection. 

 
BR-2680 Folly's Bride                 Peart, Jane 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of Montclair;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Sara Leighton's unusual beauty and independent spirit places 



her on a collision course with romance, frustration, 
disappointment and finally true love as the newest bride of 
Montclair. 

 
BR-133  Fools for Christ            Pelikan, Jaroslav 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 

Jesus is the connecting link for men between earth and heaven. 
Probes the language of worship, the meaning of faith, the ethics 
of love, and the value of the super-natural to the Christian 
message. 

 
BR-2137 Footprints in the Snow         Various Authors 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
     Stories about God's mysterious ways. 
 
BR-2108 Footprints: The Story behind Poem   Powers, Margaret 
     4 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-3523 For Better or for Worse          Hunt, Diann 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

She's a wedding coordinator, he's a divorce attorney. She 
begins marriages, he ends them.  

 
BR-3589 For the Love of a Child            Laity, Sally 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Old Fashioned Christmas/An; Book 1 
of 4 
The plaintive cry of a child in the cold Philadelphia night 
summons Angelina Matthews as she limps home from a long 
day at the dress shop. An orphan herself, Angelina swiftly 
seeks refuge for the girl at a nearby church, the bailiwick of 
confirmed bachelor Reverend Gabe Winters. 

 
BR-1597 For Those Who Hurt          Swindoll, Charles 
     1 Volume; Devotion 
     A meditation to comfort those who are suffering. 
 
BR-3464 Forces of Love              Downs, Susan 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Letters; Book 1 of 4 

Captain Jack Johnson, a fighter pilot in the European theater, 
becomes pen pals with Caroline Harrington of Boston. Will they 



get to meet in person when he is on holiday leave? 
 
BR-1775 Foreign Devil in China/A         Pollack, John 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The story of Dr. L. Nelson Bell, a medical missionary to China 
for 25-years.  He is the father of Ruth Bell. 

 
BR-3541 Forever Christmas                  Lynxwiler, Christine 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When a big corporation says they'll come to Jingle Bells, 
Arkansas to help the economy, but the town must change its 
name to Summer Valley, Kristianna decides to fight the town 
board and the corporation. 

 
BR-1125 Forgive, Forget and be Free     Lockerbie, Jeanette 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

Explains how to overcome bitterness, hatred, anger, and 
remorse. 

 
BR-3568 Formula of Concord/The      Moorhead, William G. 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Confession Series 
 
BR-3567 Formula of Concord/The      Moorhead, William G. 

1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Confession Series 
 
BR-2687 Fortune's Bride               Peart, Jane 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of Montclair;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Avril Dumont, a young heiress and orphan, comes to terms with 
her lonely adolescence and her undaunted love. 

 
BR-2328 Four Centuries Before Christ/The    Kauffeld, Eugene 
     5 Volumes; Bible Study 

Historical account of the time between the Old Testament and 
New Testament. What happened, who lived, what was going on 
in the world in the years before Christ was born. The silent time 
of Scriptures. 

 
BR-3084 Four Hearts                 Laity, Sally 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Sewing Circle Book;  



     Book 4 of 4 
Diana tries to keep friends at a distance. But Mrs. T's truthful 
words and a new friend make Diana realize the needs of her 
heart. 

 
BR-3295 Fourth and Long     Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game on 2 Timothy 1:7 

Alex Rogers doesn't make the team and begins to doubt his 
abilities. 

 
BR-1756 Foxe's Book of Martyrs        Berry, W. Grinton 
     8 Volumes; Biography 

Stories of men and women who faced torture rather than deny 
their vision of truth and God.  

 
BR-941  Foxworth Hunt/The          Courtney, Dayle 

4 Volumes; Preteen, Children; Thorne Twins Adventure Series; 
Book 9 of 12 
Thorne Twins Adventure. Eric must search through 
shark-infested waters to solve the mystery. 

BR-2754 Freedom and Power of Forgiveness   MacArthur, John 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

There can be no intimacy with God and no love for others in a 
heart where bitterness and un-forgiveness dwell. But where 
there is forgiveness, there is freedom, spiritual power, 
emotional healing and fellowship. 

 
BR-286  Freedom of Forgiveness/The     Augsburger, David 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 
     How to gladly pay the costs of forgiving one another. 
 
BR-1876 Freedom-Fighter            Bolliger, Max 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Pharaoh, the Egyptian King, will not free his Hebrew slaves. 
Even when devastating events force him to change his mind he 
does not give up without a fight.  

 
BR-1918 French Fry Forgiveness         Levene, Nancy 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Alex Series (The); 
     Book 2 of 5 



Alex joins the local swim team and quickly becomes enemies 
with another swimmer named Alexandria. She learns that 
making friends is sometimes harder than making enemies. 

 
BR-2388 French Toast and Dutch Chocolate   O'Connor, Karen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Action Readers Series; 
     Book 3 of 4 

For ages 6-9, each Action Reader has five stories with related 
activities. 

 
BR-2906 Fresh-Brewed Life            Johnson, Nicole 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Nine "yes" principles to help Christian women wake up to their 
lives and to their God and to wake up their souls and walk in a 
manner worthy of a beloved child of God. 

BR-2622 Friendly Differences      Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 
1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
1 of 12 
Bert the roadrunner and Taylor the tortoise know that God had 
a reason for making them the way they are. 

 
BR-1134 From Guilt to Grace             Carlson, D. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Candidly explores the problem of guilt as it affects not only 
persons with emotional and physical problems, but everyone. 
Gives steps to alleviate unnecessary guilt. 

 
BR-1451 From the Heart              Cash, June 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
 
BR-2270 From this Day Forward        Feldhake, Susan 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Enduring Faith Series;  
     Book 5 of 5 

Molly Wheeler agrees to become a mail order bride. But when 
the expected bridegroom fails to appear, Molly finds she has a 
real mission which could only have been arranged by God. 

 
BR-3032 Frontier Lady               Pella, Judith 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Deborah Graham escapes the ravages of Civil War by marrying 



a wealthy Texan, but when he is murdered she stands accused.  
 
BR-1438 Frozen Scream/The         Haughey, Thomas 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-216  Fruit for Tomorrow          Arnold, Francena 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A disillusioned young woman's search for happiness in a world 
of broken dreams. 

BR-3355 Full Court Pressure 
                 Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game on 2 Timothy 1:7 

Basketball theme for girls. A weekend with Kristen helps Joy 
see that God has been watching over her. 

 
BR-958  Funny Thing Happened - Church 
                   Anderson, Dave/Wilcox, Tim 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

A collection of true anecdotes that shows there's a place for 
humor everywhere even in church. 

 
BR-152  Funny Thing Happened - Heaven      Harman, Dan 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2307 Funny Thing Happened - To Heaven    

Breedlove, Connie 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Short stories of the humorous things that have happened in the 
life of the author. 

 
BR-3558 Fusion Food              Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Bible Study 

In Fusion: Food, students learn how the element of food is used 
throughout the Old Testament and in the New Testament to 
communicate the message of salvation. 
 

BR-71  Garden and a Promise/A        Schlegel, Ronald 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-3337 Garden in Paris/A          Whitson, Stephanie 



     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
While daughter Liz seeks to honor her deceased father through 
immersing herself in the family business, her mother Mary 
writes a letter to an old flame in Paris and then steps out to 
reconcile her past. 

BR-1021 Gardener Looks at the Fruits of the Spirit/A 
                        Keller, W Phillip 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A naturalist tells what he thinks the fruits of the spirit mean on a 
practical, day-to-day basis. 

 
BR-3110 Gardenias for Breakfast          Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of Faith 

A mother-daughter journey home becomes an adventure of 
discovery about the importance of family. 

 
BR-2326 Gathering of Memories/A          Wick, Lori 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Place Called Home Series; Book 4 of 
4 
Her heart was fragile from too much pain. Would her defenses 
push Ross away? 

 
BR-3608 Gathering Place/A 
              Kinkade, Thomas/Spencer, Katherine 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cape Light Novel; 
     Book 3 of 11 

Emily Warwick concentrates on her relationship with the 
daughter she gave up for adoption twenty years ago. 

 
BR-2301 Geek Proof Your Faith   Johnson, Greg/Ross, Michael 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Christian perspectives on issues such as evolution/creation, 
abortion, and the reliability of the Bible. Suggests responses 
teenagers may offer in communicating their faith. 

 
BR-3437 General Epistles              Jeske, Mark A. 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
Commentary on the New Testament - General Epistles of 
James, I and II Peter, I, II, III John and Jude. 



BR-2074 Genesis                   Jeske, John 
6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study on the book of Genesis. 
 
BR-28  Genesis in Space and Time       Schaeffer, Francis 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

The book of Genesis is the origins of the universe, life, and 
man. Dr. Schaeffer explains how the first 11Chapeters stand as 
a solid, space-time basis for answering tough questions posed 
by modern man. 

 
BR-1791 Gentle Persuasion           Aldrich, Joseph 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Creative ways to introduce your friends to Christ.  Join the 
author as he explains how cherry pies, hammers, lawn mowers, 
broken-down cars, babysitters, duck hunters and llama farmers 
can draw friends to the Savior. 

 
BR-2306 Gentle Rebel/The            Morris, Gilbert 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series;  
     Book 4 of 13 

Book 4 brings the Winslow family into the American Revolution. 
Nathan Winslow, son of Adam and Molly, opposed the 
revolution. But eventually he becomes an American patriot and 
carries the banner of his family. 

 
BR-1436 Gentlewoman's Choice/The      MacDonald, George 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3555 Gently Love Beckons            Bacher, June 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 6 of 6 

What will Courtney discover as she answers the urgent 
summons to return to her childhood home? 

 
BR-2979 Get Up, Lazarus!            Schkade, Jonathan 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     John 11:1-44. The story of the raising of Lazarus. 
 
BR-3548 Gideon's Gift             Kingsbury, Karen 



2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Red Gloves Collection; Book 
1 of 4  
 

BR-3456 Gideon's Torch      Colson, Charles/Vaughn, Ellen 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Emily Gineen just made it to the top. She's the new attorney 
general of the United States, and it wasn't 
suppose to be like this. A doctor is murdered, a TV network is 
hijacked, and a terrorist bomb takes out a research facility. 

 
BR-3065 Gift Horse             Mackall, Dandi Daley 

        3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler;    
 Book 6 of 6 

A mysterious old horse shows up in Winnie's pasture. With the 
"gift horse" comes the greatest Christmas gift. 

 
BR-1412 Gift of Feeling/The           Tournier, Paul 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Though aimed at women, men and young adults will find 
insight, guidance, and nurture in this book. 

 
BR-217  Gift of Love/A              Magruder, Gail 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3451 Gift of Prayer/The           Schlenvogt, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Encourages women to make the most of God's powerful, free, 
and perfect gift of prayer. Bible passages and stories are 
central to the applications she makes for contemporary 
lifestyles. 

BR-2892 Gift/The               Snelling, Lauraine 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

A lonely horse needs a companion, a young boy hasn't spoken 
since his father died and two adults long to know love again. All 
together they create a loving story. 

 
BR-1448 Gifts of Grace            Schramm, Mary 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-3596 Gilead               Robinson, Marilynne 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
The narrator, John Ames, is 76, a preacher who has lived 
almost all of his life in Gilead, Iowa. He is writing a letter to his 
almost seven-year-old son, the blessing of his second 
marriage. It is a summing-up, an apologia, a consideration of 
his life. 

 
BR-1157 Gingerbread Girl                Fisher, P. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

True story of a family fighting for the love of a foster child. 
 
BR-992  Girl from Montana/The       Hill, Grace Livingston 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 3 of 14 
A collection of devotions for those times in our life when we find 
ourselves suddenly single. 

 
BR-3114 Girl Time             Walker, Laura Jensen 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Sometimes you just need to talk. Who do you call? Your 
girlfriends the women who listen and love you no matter what. 
Women must take and make time for your girlfriends. 

 
 
BR-772  Girl to Come Home To/A      Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1676 Give Your Life a Lift          Gockel, Herman 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

75-brief portrayals of how the Gospel fits people in today's 
harried world.  

 
BR-1588 Givers, Takers and Other Kinds of Lovers 
                  McDowell, Josh/Lewis, Paul 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

This book bypasses generalities about love and sex and gets 
down to basic questions. Whatever happened to sexual 
freedom? What's true love like? Do men respond differently 
than women?  

 



BR-1945 Glimpses of Grace           Upton, Rosemary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Rosemary Upton could not believe her mother was suffering 
from Alzheimer's disease. In diary-like form she documents the 
emotional pressures and frustrations of all the family members. 

 
BR-3537 Glimpses of Heaven          Harris, Trudy RN 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Written by a Hospice nurse, the book gives an intimate look at 
final thoughts, words, and faith of terminally ill and dying 
people.  

 
BR-1658 Glorious Intruder              Tada, Joni 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-2822 God Calls Abraham, God Calls You! 
                       Busch, Melinda Kay 

1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book  
Story of Abraham for children. 

BR-1507 God Came Near              Lucado, Max 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

A fresh and wonderful look at the life of the Savior. A book that 
is not just another volume of information about the life of Christ, 
but one that brings you into an encounter with the Master 
Himself. 

 
BR-2916 God Chose You              Dietrich, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3480 God First           Doyle, Thomas (Editor) 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-3352  God Gave                  Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Colorful, sturdy, well produced little books with simple text and 
lively illustrations that show God's love. 

 
BR-2406 God Helps David            Palmer, Marjorie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Christian Faith 

Designed for the child just beginning to read, my Bible Story 



Reader contains a first-grade reading vocabulary that makes 
the great truth of God's love understandable. 

 
BR-2354 God is Awesome          Monroe, Robin Prince 

1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Faith; Ages 2-7, reading level 2.   
Young children love "est" words biggest, strongest, and 
smartest. 

 
BR-3592 God Jul                Peterson, Tracie 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Old Fashioned Christmas/An; Book 3 
of 4 
Sigrid Larsson of Lindsborg, Kansas, may be resigned to 
spinsterhood, but she is not ready to sell the family homestead 
and move in with well-meaning relatives.  

BR-3353 God Knows                  Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Colorful, sturdy, well produced little books with simple text and 
lively illustrations that show God's love. 

 
BR-2219 God Loves Me, So What         Doud, Guy Rice 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Discusses the reality of God and the importance of maintaining 
belief in Him.  

 
BR-3340 God Made It for You          Lehman, Charles 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

The wonder and beauty of creation focuses on the fact that God 
made it all. 

 
BR-2362 God Made Me               Haidle, Helen 

1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Faith; for ages 2-7, reading 
level, grade 2.   
Rhymed verse which can be sung to the tune of "Twinkle, 
Twinkle, Little Star.” 

 
BR-2469 God Made Only One Me         Robinson, Gail 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 
 
BR-2343 God Makers/The         Decker, Ed/Hunt, Dave 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 



A shocking expose of what the Mormon Church believes. 
 
BR-3374 God Makes Me His Child in Baptism  Wittenback, Janet 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 

Helps explain the concept of infant Baptism to preschoolers.  
 
BR-2993 God Provides Victory through Gideon   Bader, Joanne 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
      The story of Gideon. 
BR-2849 God Said It, Don't Sweat It     Warren, Neil Clark 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Take a minute to hear what God has to say about your 
problems. This book illustrates the truth that it's not so much 
what happens to you but how you react to what happens. 

 
BR-2407 God Saves Noah            Palmer, Marjorie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Christian Faith 

Designed for the child just beginning to read, my Bible Story 
Reader contains a first-grade reading vocabulary that makes 
the great truth of God's love understandable. 

 
BR-2766 God Sent a Man             Haynes, Carlyle 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The story of Joseph, who allowed himself to be prepared by 
God to play a crucial role in the history of Egypt and Israel. How 
his life is an example for us to be used by God. 

 
BR-187  God Speaks Navajo            Wallis, Ethel 
     3 Volumes; Missions 
 
BR-2933 God the Son              Espinosa, Alfonso 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
How Lutherans view Jesus, how it differs from other 
denominations and why Lutherans believe what they do. 

 
BR-2242 God to Call Father/A           Phillips, Michael 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Explores an often overlooked aspect of our spiritual life. Phillips 
uses his storytelling craft to weave through the book a beautiful 
allegory that parallels our spiritual journey to discover the 



intimacy and presence of God. 
 
BR-3354 God Understands               Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Colorful, sturdy, well, produced little books with simple text and 
lively illustrations that show God's love. 

 
BR-1871 God Uses Cracked Pots         Clairmont, Patsy 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Patsy takes events from her everyday life and wisdom turns 
them into lessons on love. 

 
BR-3543 God Words              Various Authors 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

A series of essays on major doctrines of Christian theology 
written by respected Lutheran leaders. 

 
BR-3281 God’s Easter Promise           Barsness, Todd 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This book walks young readers through Holy Week in new 
fashion. 

 
BR-2367 God, I Need to Talk to You       Bagnull, Marlene 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Devotion 

Prayer Diary for Girls.  As you read these prayers and make a 
journal, you will see that God can be closer. 

 
BR-2823 God, My Creator         Gimbel, Jim/Gimbel, Jo 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Explanation of the First Article of the Apostles' Creed taken 
from Luther's Small Catechism.  

 
BR-1613 God, Where's My Daddy?          Furey, Donna 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-1226 God, Why is She the Way She is?      Ware, Linda 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2308 God's Awesome Promises        Scripture Text 
     6 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 



A book for teens which categorizes Bible passages so it is easy 
to find subjects such as anger, drugs, 

 
BR-1584 God's Blueprint for Living       Seamands, David 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The rationalizations and misconceptions show how Christians 
can and should apply the Ten Commandments to their personal 
behavior. 

 
BR-3597 God's Creatures in the Woods    Stuckey, Debra K. 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 

Demonstrates how God cares for His woodland creatures by 
giving them parents to look after them. 

 
BR-153  God's Great Plan for You      Caemmerer, Richard 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-1494 God's Joyful People        Hoffman, Dr. Oswald 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

It takes enthusiasm and conviction in your beliefs to become an 
active, involved Christian. The people need help. They are 
turning to drugs, outlandish religious experience, communes, to 
find some meaning in life. In this book you will see there is 
much more the church can do, and that you can be a part of it. 

 
BR-2257 God's Laws Don't have Loopholes      Benke, David 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

See that through Christ you are accepted by God for eternity. 
Live with perfect peace, honesty, and love. 

 
BR-2841 God's Love at Easter         Davis, Joy Morgan 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

For ages 4 to 7. 
BR-1856 God's No and God's Yes           Walther, C. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     Outlines the distinction between Law and Gospel. 
 
BR-3502 God's Power at Work in You 
                 Anderson, Neil/Saucy, Robert L. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 



Authors contend that the key to real change and real spiritual 
growth is a clear understanding of "what" God does when He 
saves us and "how" He works in our lives to transform us. 

 
BR-3475 God's Word for Today           Hallesby, O. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
 
BR-2612 Gold Flakes for Breakfast 
                  Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 6 of 20 
Secret passages, eerie sounds and strange creatures abound 
when 13-year old Willie sets off in search of secret tunnels filled 
with gold. 

 
BR-1977 Gold Medal Murder           Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 6 of 8 

Erin Gibbons and Larisa are competing for the same gymnastic 
championship. Their friendship becomes strained when a 
murder casts a web of suspicion on the girls. 

 
BR-1975 Gold Rush Prodigal    Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 3 of 
7 
David Bollin, rejecting missionary parents, sets out to a new life 
in Boston. Lured to California fields his life is drawn into a spiral 
of deceit, murder, power and greed. 

BR-219  Golden Acre/The              Bjorn, Thyra 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2058 Golden Dreams             Schulte, Elaine 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; California Pioneer Series; 
     Book 2 of 4 

Her fiancé’s death pushes Rose Wilmington into the arms of his 
twin brother. She knows this is not God's plan.  

 
BR-2991 Good Friday                Ulmer, Louise 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-1673 Good Grief             Westberg, Granger 



     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-2468 Good Neighbors              Tedrow, T. L. 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Days Of Laura Ingalls Wilder 
Series; Book 3 of 8 
During the harsh winter of 1905 Laura, her family, and her 
neighbors help each other survive. 

 
BR-3490 Good News for Kids 
        Friedrich, Elizabeth/Wilke, Jane/Christian,Judy/ 
               Christian, David/Stohs, Anita Reith 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life                

A collection of creative children's messages based on familiar 
Gospel lessons. 

 
BR-2633 Good Shepherd/The 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2421 Goodbye is Not Forever           George, Amy 
     6 Volumes; Autobiography 

A true story of Amy George. As a small girl in Russia before 
World War II, she saw her father taken and exiled to Siberia. 

BR-2737 Goodness the Paramedic and the Oily Rags 
                       Holdsworth, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Life; Heartland Series/The 
A parable about goodness that teaches about the fruits of the 
Spirit. 

 
BR-3476 Goofy Glasses          Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
10 of 12 

 
BR-264  Goosehill Gang Craft Book        Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Goosehill Gang 
 
BR-277  Goosehill--C.B. Convoy Caper      Christian, Mary 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang; 
Book 1 of 12 
Using CB radios the Goosehill Gang uncovers a ring of bicycle 
thieves in their neighborhood. 



 
BR-261  Goosehill--Chocolate Cake Caper     Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 2 of 12 

Four friends look for a cake thief and a way to help a lonely old 
lady feel useful. 

 
BR-1238 Goosehill--Christmas Shoe Thief     Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 3 of 12 

The Goosehill Gang is introduced to Christmas customs from 
Mexico when Juan moves into their neighborhood. 

 
BR-81  Goosehill--Cookbook           Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang 
 
 
BR-272  Goosehill--Ghost in the Garage      Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 4 of 12 

It's not a ghost in the garage after all but a child hiding for 
protection from brutality. 

 
BR-279  Goosehill--May Basket Mystery      Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang; 
     Book 5 of 12 

Pete decides that the family next door are "weirdos" because 
they never speak, but learns along with the other members of 
his gang that the family is not weird but hearing impaired. 

 
BR-262  Goosehill--Mystery of Runaway      Christian, Mary 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 6 of 12 

In solving the mystery of the runaway house, the Goosehill 
gang start a project that benefits the children. 

 
BR-78  Goosehill--Pocket Park Problem      Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 7 of 12 

The Goosehill Gang focuses its attention on such community 



projects as helping an elderly citizen. 
 
BR-79  Goosehill--Shadow on the Shade     Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 8 of 12 

The Goosehill Gang helps find a job for a paroled convict. 
 
BR-276  Goosehill--Stitch in Time         Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang; 
     Book 9 of 12 

The gang helps Marcus' mother, an invalid, be useful by 
involving her talents in a Goosehill clean up. 

 
BR-263  Goosehill--Test Paper Thief        Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 10 of 12 

Tubby is unjustly accused of stealing the answers to a test at 
school.  

 
BR-278  Goosehill--The Disappearing Dues    Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang;  
     Book 11 of 12 

The Goosehill Gang suspect the new boy when their club dues 
disappear. 

 
BR-80  Goosehill--Vanishing Sandwich      Christian, Mary 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Goosehill Gang; 
     Book 12 of 12 

When a classmate appears overly tired and carries an empty 
lunch kit, Beth and the Goosehill Gang take her in. 

 
BR-2226 Gown of Spanish Lace/A          Oke, Janette 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 11 
of 12 
Ariana loves life, but one evening her whole life changes in an 
instant. Will she see her adopted parents again? Will she ever 
wear the wedding dress so carefully saved for her? 

 
BR-1402 Grace Livingston Hill           Munce, Robert 
     2 Volumes; Biography 



 
BR-3430 Grace Notes            Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction 

Gracie prefers blogging anonymously about her high school 
classmates until a new student discovers her identity.  

BR-2336 Grace Notes, Meditations for Women    Koch, Ruth 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Meditations for Women in the Church. Written for female family 
members of church workers, it would lead to better 
understanding of these church partners if all women would read 
of some of their unique situations. 

 
BR-2471 Grace, God's Special Gift        Roberts, Donald 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-2345 Grandma Speaks           Rainwater, Pearl 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Devotional short stories about growing up in small town 
America and how various Scripture passages intertwine. 

 
BR-2909 Grandma, What Is Prayer?     Bohlmann, Katherine 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 
  
BR-2829 Grandpa is There a Heaven?    Bohlmann, Katherine 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

When children ask questions about this sensitive subject, pull 
them onto your lap and read them this gentle book. Full of 
important questions and answers. 

 
BR-2250 Great Debate/The             Tedrow, T. L. 

7 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder 
Series; Book 7 of 8 
Women don't have the right to vote, and Mansfield is divided 
over the issue. Laura finds herself at the forefront of one of the 
most important debates in history. 

 
BR-1354 Great Divorce/The             Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Faith 
     A fantastic bus ride from Hell to Heaven. 
 



BR-3094 Great Expectation/The           Aiken, Ginny 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Strings of the Heart;  
     Book 1 of 4 

Marissa plays upright bass for a quartet and manages their 
schedule. When traveling with the group, she always leaves her 
prized Afghan at the kennel. 

 
BR-2384 Great House of God/The          Lucado, Max 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Using the Lord's Prayer as a floor plan for the Great House of 
God, Max Lucado introduces us to a God Who desires His 
children to draw close to Him, indeed to live with Him. 

 
BR-3334 Great Jesus Debates/The      Johnson, Douglas W. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Church History 

The early church controversies that helped to develop the 
historic Christian creeds that we use today. 

 
BR-2467 Great Meow Mystery/The     Mackall, Dandi Daley 

        1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries;    
 Book 3 of 8 

In order to increase sales of their little paper, Molly decides to 
stretch the truth about missing cats. 

 
BR-2218 Green as In Springtime, a New Life, and God's Will 
                        Niedfeldt, Linda 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A Russian family resettles in Wisconsin and adjustments must 
be made. 

 
BR-1538 Grief for a Season          Tengbom, Mildred 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

A personal manual that guides those who are grieving at their 
own pace through area of shock, expressions of their grief, and 
helps to deal with questions and fears.  

BR-1114 Grief Observed/A             Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The author freely confesses his doubts, rage, and awareness of 
human frailty as he lives through his grief. 

 



BR-47  Growing in Christ               Unknown 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 
      An exposition of Luther's Small Catechism. 
 
BR-2067 Growing in Grace             George, Bob 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Taken from true stories and counseling situations, the author 
aims to give Christians the necessary understanding to grow in 
God's grace as beloved children of God. 

 
BR-1222 Growing Strong in the Seasons     Swindoll, Charles 

10 Volumes; Devotion; Presents 144 readings with 
accompanying passages of Scripture. 

 
BR-2364 Growing Together in Christ 
                  Gronholz, Gene/Zarling, Mark 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

A Scriptural guide for couples which offers a comparison 
between the world's view of marriage and God's. 

 
BR-1460 Growing Wise in Family Life      Swindoll, Charles 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

14 lively chapters show how wisdom from the Bible can fill your 
home with love, laughter and mutual respect. 

 
BR-3416 Guardian/The             Henderson, Dee 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; O'Malley Series; Book 2 of 6 

U.S. Marshall Marcus O'Malley must find out who murdered a 
federal judge and keep his chief eyewitness alive.  She 
teaches him the power of prayer and love. 

BR-3494 Guide Me, Lord            Rottmann, Erik 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Daily Bible centered devotions for meditation. Compiled from 
the best of Portals of Prayer. 

 
BR-2072 Guilt by Association           Morris, Gilbert 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Danielle Ross Mystery Series; Book 
1 of 6 
Danielle Ross is a CPA, turned theology student, who returns 
home to take over her father's private investigation firm after he 



has a serious heart attack. 
 
BR-3368 Haggai, Zechariah, Malachi 
                   Deterding, Paul/Baker, Robert C. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 
  
BR-2592 Hail to the Chump     Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 9 of 20 
When thirteen-year-old Willie runs for class president, he thinks 
he's got the race sewn up. When he takes steps to ensure his 
victory, he learns the value of integrity. 

 
BR-3299 Halfway to Forever         Kingsbury, Karen 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Forever Faithful; Book 3 of 3 

Caught in a desperate battle against all that threatens to derail 
their faith, Matt and Hannah Bronyan and Tanner and Jade 
Eastman struggle to depend daily on God regardless of what 
comes. 

 
BR-2974 Halos                 Heitzmann, Kristen 

9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
The halo she glimpsed around the sun was the first sign that 
Charity might be the place she was searching for. She just 
knows something good is coming, yet darkness sometimes 
lurks where it is least expected. 

BR-221  Hammer of God/The             Giertz, B. 
5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

     A novel about the cure of souls. 
 
BR-2672 Hammering at the Doors of Heaven 
                      Schneider, Christine 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Fires of Faith Series;  
     Book 2 of 2 

Count Raimund discovers that faith in Christ is the only way to 
free his conscience. 

 
BR-3551 Hannah's Hope            Kingsbury, Karen 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Red Gloves Collection; Book 
4 of 4 



 
BR-223  Happiness Hill           Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1675 Happiness is a Choice   Minirth, Dr. R./Meier, Dr. Paul 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-3308 Happy Birthday  
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This special book introduces children up to age three to 
birthday traditions and helps them learn God. 

 
BR-3280 Happy Easter                 Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Invite little ones to rejoice that Jesus rose on Easter. 
 
BR-3098 Harmonized Hearts          Coleman, Lynn A. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Strings of the Heart;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Tyrone plays a cello and dreams of putting psalms for string 
instruments to music. But his work at home disturbs his 
neighbor, Cassy, who doesn't like the noise. 

BR-2630 Harrison Town           Newman, Michael W. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

You will meet Ernest Thorpe, his family, his friends, and his 
pastor. You will laugh; perhaps cry. These stories are not 
ordinary, however. They are stories of grace, God's grace at 
work in the lives of His people. 

 
BR-2090 Harvest of Humanity          Seamonds, John 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

What is the mission of the church in the late twentieth century? 
What are the problems cross-cultural missionaries face in 
bringing the Gospel to the world? 

 
BR-2063 Haunting of Lowell Lanes      Hunt, Angela Elwell 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Nicki Holland Mysteries; Book 
6 of 6 
Nicki and her friends try to find out who is behind the 
mysterious occurrences at the small local bowling alley. 



 
BR-3508 Having a Mary Heart in a Martha World 
                         Weaver, Joanna 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Show the Mary and Martha of today, how to draw closer to 
Jesus, deepen your devotion and strengthen your service with 
less stress and more joy. 
 

BR-1821 Hawk and the Dove/The        Wilcock, Penelope 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Shows the power of self-sacrificing love to reconcile brothers 
who are enemies. 

 
BR-2662 Hawk and the Jewel/The           Wick, Lori 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kensington Chronicles;  
Book 1 of 4 
A rich emir rescues a girl separated from her family at the age 
of one and returns her to her family at age 13. 

BR-1011 He Began with Eve           Landorf, Joyce 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

How five great women of the Bible might have approached life 
today. 

 
BR-3068 He is Risen, Indeed! 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

The story of Jesus' death and resurrection with words of the 
English Standard Version of the Bible. 

 
BR-45  He Sets the Captives Free       Ten Boom, Corrie 
     1 Volume; Biography 

Corrie shares the faith that sustained her during the 
dehumanizing days in a Nazi work camp. 

 
BR-2403 He Still Moves Stones           Lucado, Max 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Bible stories remind us God still speaks and forgives. 
 
BR-224  Head of the House         Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 



BR-255  Heading for Center of Universe       Sauer, Chuck 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life; Perspective 1. 
 
BR-2789 Heads I Win, Tails You Lose 
                  Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 11 of 20 
Willie and his friends learn the value of friendship and 
forgiveness. 

 
BR-1271 Healing for Damaged Emotions    Seamands, David 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Tells how God can help people who are hurting emotionally by 
freeing them from their past. 

BR-1576 Healing Grace             Seamands, David 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Recognize and overcome troublesome areas of disgrace. 
 
BR-2777 Healing Hearts            Wolverton, Cheryl 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Inspired 

Tessa Stanridge knows her life will never be the same after she 
begins caring for accident victim Drake Slater. 

 
BR-1175 Healing of Memories          Seamands, David 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The author believes that God's healing power can free one from 
painful memories. 

 
BR-2879 Healing Quilt/The          Snelling, Lauraine 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction  

When the women of Jefferson City learn of the high breast 
cancer rate, they work together on a quilt and other ways to 
raise funds for new mammogram equipment. 
 

BR-1709 Healing Season/A             Kuhne, Karen 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
     A true story of adultery and reconciliation. 
 
BR-3499 Heart Divided/A                Lacy, Al 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Battles of Destiny Series;  



     Book 2 of 6 
 
BR-2109 Heart Full of Hope/A            Gunn, Robin 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christy Miller Series; Book 6 
of 6 
Sixteen-year-old Christy is swept off her feet by Rick, a 
handsome Christian boy who wants to go steady with her, but 
her friendship with Todd makes her decision a difficult one. 

BR-1291 Heart Gifts                 Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Poetry 

A collection of poetry from one of America's best inspirational 
poets. 

 
BR-1927 Heart of Stone              Haworth, John 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Henry Stanwich leads a dull life as a professor in a British 
University. He accepts an offer to take a trip with an American 
adventurer through Madagascar's pinnacles. 

 
BR-2015 Heart of the Wilderness          Oke, Janette 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 8 
of 12 
Women of the West Series. A grandfather brings his baby 
granddaughter to live with him and raise her in the wilderness. 
As she grows into adulthood will she be able to cope with the 
challenges of the outside world? 

 
BR-2383 Heart's Lonely Secret/The         Pearst, Jane 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Young orphan Ivy Austin dreams of what it will be like to be set 
free from the orphanage. But after adoption, she is abandoned 
again. Ivy finds herself part of a plan to take orphaned children 
by train to new families. 

 
BR-1329 Heartsongs                  Grol, Lini 
     1 Volume; Poetry 
     A mother's book of memories. 
 
BR-1885 Heather Hills of Stonewycke 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 



8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Stonewycke Trilogy Series; Book 1 of 
3 
The story begins in Scotland during the mid-nineteenth century, 
revolving around a prominent, land-owner. 

BR-3274 Heaven and Hell            Becker, Norbert 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Faith on the Edge Series 

This book uncovers common misunderstandings about Biblical 
teaching on life after death. Tells the truth about hell and 
describes the everlasting joy that awaits all believers in Jesus 
Christ. 

 
BR-2075 Hebrews              Lauersdorf, Richard 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
Includes the complete text of the Book of Hebrews from the 
New International Version. The commentary following the 
Scripture sections contains personal applications as well as 
historical background and explanations. 

 
BR-2231 Helen Steiner Rice     Pollitt, Ronald/Wiltse, Virginia 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

A look at the woman whose poetry has become a staple of the 
greeting card world.  

 
BR-1547 Help Lord, My Whole Life Hurts      Mayhall, Carole 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The author carefully explores the measures God uses to strip 
away our dependence on other things. She examines the 
despair, doubt, and numbness that often accompany His 
stripping process.  

 
BR-2739 Help! I'm Laughing and I Can't Get Up 
                        Higgs, Liz Curtis 

8 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Funny stories to fill your heart 
and lift your spirit. 

  
BR-1619 Helper/The             Marshall, Catherine 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

40-inspirational helps for daily devotions. 
BR-1565 Helping Children Cope with Death     Dood, Robert 



     1 Volume; Christian Life 
Written to assist you in helping children deal with their thoughts 
and feelings concerning the death of a friend or relative, or in 
facing their own death from a terminal illness. 

 
BR-2566 Her Choice to Heal      Masse, Sydna/Phillips, Joan 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A book of hope and healing for those who have had an 
abortion. 

 
BR-292  Her Name is Woman           Gien, Karssen 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-1722 Here and Hereafter          Kramer, William 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2303 Hey Lord, Can Angels Type?       Roberts, Faye 

6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Five-minute devotions for the 
working woman. 

 
BR-155  Hidden Art              Schaeffer, Edith 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Each person has some talent which is unfulfilled in some 
hidden area of his being. 

 
BR-3384 Hidden History             Carlson, Melody 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Tales from Grace Chapel Inn; Book 3 
of 47 
The three Howard sisters return to Acorn Hill and turn the family 
home into a bed and breakfast. They rekindle old memories, 
rediscover the bonds of sisterhood and revel in the blessings of 
friendship. 

 
 
BR-1702 Hide or Seek              Dobson, James 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Dr. Dobson exposes the false value system of our society and 
presents twelve comprehensive strategies through which 
parents and teachers can cultivate self-esteem in every child. 

 



BR-7   Hiding Place/The           Ten Boom, Corrie 
     6 Volumes; Biography 

The story of her family becoming leaders in the Dutch 
underground during the Nazi invasion. 

 
BR-765  High Cost of Growing/The        Landorf, Joyce 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-3090 High Desert Secrets            Biggar, Joan 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Adventure Quest Series; Book 
4 of 4 

 
BR-2485 High Flyer with a Flat Tire        McCusker, Paul 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 2 of 12 
After having a fight with the local bully, Mark is falsely accused 
of vandalism. 

 
BR-3438 High Hurdles  
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game On! 
 
BR-1524 His Gifts to Me             Chapian, Marie 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
     Daily meditations for friends of God. 
 
BR-3324 His Name is John!            Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books  
     The story of the birth of John the Baptist. 
 
BR-1539 His Thoughts toward Me         Chapian, Marie 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Heart for God/A 

God is calling Christians to a close, committed walk with Him as 
intimate friends, who are unafraid to pay the cost of 
discipleship. 

 
BR-795  Hobo on the Way to Heaven       Linkletter, Art 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

Mr. Linkletter's early life and his years as a successful 
entertainer. Since the drug-related death of his 19-year-old 
daughter. 



 
BR-3005 Hold High the Cross          Various Authors 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     The history of the Lutheran Braille Workers Inc. 
 
BR-236  Hold Me Up a Little Longer, Lord   Holmes, Margorie 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-3510 Hold on Tight               Gunn, Robin 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 
10 of 12 
Sierra, her brother Wes and other friends head out to look at 
colleges.  

 
BR-2660 Holding Hands             Duerr, Catherine 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Holding Hands captures moments in the day and turns them 
into devotional thoughts. 

 
BR-2818 Holding on to Hope           Guthrie, Nancy 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Framing her own story of staggering loss and soaring hope with 
the Biblical story of Job, she takes fellow sufferers and guides 
them on a pathway through pain straight to the heart of God. 

BR-2725 Holiday Hero               Byrd, Sandra 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Secret Sisters; Book 7 of 8 

Determined to enjoy Spring break, Tess and Erin decide to 
vacation together, but they get into more trouble. 

 
BR-1235 Holiness of God/The            Sproul, R. C. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
 
BR-294  Holy Bible for Children/The      Jahsmann, Allan 
     8 Volumes; Children 
 
BR-2985 Holy Spirit, My Helper    Gimbel, Jim/Gimbel, Andy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2217 Holy Warrior/The            Morris, Gilbert 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 6 of 



13 
Years after the Revolution, Nathan's sons, Christmas and Knox, 
go west. Knox hopes to set up trading posts in Missouri and 
Christmas seeks to escape a future he regards with contempt. 

 
BR-1475 Home Again             MacDonald, George 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Walter Colman who thinks he has outgrown the country farm 
where he was reared, decides London will be more to his liking, 
and is for a while. Rising from struggling poet to respected 
newspaper columnist, he gains entrance to the world of 
charming Lufa Tremaine.  

 
BR-3316 Home Fires Burning          Stokes, Penelope 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Faith on the Homefront Series 

Set in 1943, Link Winsom is assigned to army camp in Eden, 
Mississippi.  He meets and falls in love with Libba Caltrain. 
Soon he is shipped out leaving Libba to wait, pray and hope for 
his return. 

BR-2297 Home for the Heart/A         Phillips, Michael 
5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 8 of 9 
Two years have passed since Corrie Belle Hollister left Miracle 
Springs. Rising up within Corrie is a new feeling that the time 
has come to decide where home really is and where she 
belongs. 

 
BR-3296 Home is Where Your Horse is    Mackall, Dandi Daley 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; 
     Book 6 of 8 

Scoop is determined to find out if Twila is her birth mother. 
Along the way she learns her real home is where her heart is 
with Aunt Dotty, B.C. and Orphan her horse. 

 
BR-33  Home Life in Bible Times         Klinck, Arthur 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-3516 Home to Holly Springs            Karon, Jan 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Father Tim Series 

Father Tim goes home to Holly Springs, MS where he is faced 



with a number of things from his past, where he finds wisdom 
and forgiveness in a trip back home. 

 
BR-3468 Home to the Prairie            Tedrow, T. L. 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder Series; 
Book 4 of 8 
When Pa and Laura set out in search of their old homestead 
they relive many of the special memories. 

 
BR-2732 Home to Willowbrook           Page, Carole 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heartland Memories;  
     Book 2 of 5 

Cath Herrick awakes from a coma and must rebuild her 
shattered life. 

 
BR-3304 Homecoming/The           Gouge, Louise M. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Janice and her son go to L.A. to visit ex-husband/pro 
quarterback and they remarry.   

 
BR-3578 Homesteader, a Bride, and a Baby/A  

Grote, JoAnn A. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Brides Book; 
     Book 3 of 4 
 
BR-2548 Honesty, Values to Live By      Moncure, Jane Belk 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Values to Live By;  
     Book 4 of 5 
 
BR-2368 Honey, They're Playing Our Song    Kennedy, Nancy 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Through personal anecdotes from her own life, Nancy reminds 
the reader of God's presence in marriage. 

 
BR-1447 Honeymoon House/The      Hill, Grace Livingston 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

Beautiful, talented Angela has a problem: her fiancé, a man she 
hardly knows. 

 
BR-2166 Honorable Imposter/The         Morris, Gilbert 



11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 1 of 
13 
Forced to become a minister, Gilbert Winslow is offered a 
dangerous task. It means he must become a spy.  

 
BR-2861 Honor's Disguise           Heitzmann, Kristen 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Legacy;  
     Book 4 of 5 

Cole Jasper is back as foreman until bounty hunters kidnap him 
to take back to Texas. Abbie Farrel and her Comanche guide 
follow to try to save Cole. 

BR-2711 Honor's Pledge           Heitzmann, Kristen 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Legacy; 
     Book 1 of 5 

Abigail Martin is a headstrong young Colorado frontier woman. 
Montgomery Farrel is a refined southern gentleman who 
believes honor is above every virtue even love.  

 
BR-3382 Honor's Price             Heitzmann, Kristen 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Legacy;  
     Book 2 of 5 

With both Abbie and his land to protect, can Monte find the 
strength to surrender it all to the God. 

 
BR-2688 Honor's Quest            Heitzmann, Kristen 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Legacy; 
     Book 3 of 5 

All that Abbie loved lay encircled by the Lucky Star Ranch, but 
what price must she pay to keep it? 

 
BR-2698 Hope                  Copeland, Lori 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of the West 1872 Series; Book 
3 of 6 
Hope Kallahan is kidnaped on her way west to her wedding.  

 
BR-1327 Hope                 Swindoll, Charles 
     1 Volume; Christian Life;  
 
BR-1963 Hope for the Troubled Heart        Graham, Billy 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 



Dr. Graham addresses issues you confront at home, at work, in 
your family as well as on the world scene. Shows how to live in 
the real world, even though it is filled with pain. 

 
BR-2656 Hope when You're Hurting 
                Crabb, Dr. Larry/Allender, Dan B. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

The authors consider four questions hurting people ask. 
 
BR-3348 Horse Feathers' Mystery      Mackall, Dandi Daley 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; Book 7 
of 8 
Scoop needs money to remodel the stable so takes on 
racehorses for boarders.  

 
BR-1986 Horse and His Boy/A            Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series;  
     Book 3 of 7 

How a talking horse and a boy Prince saved Narnia. 
 
BR-3091 Horse Cents            Mackall, Dandi Daley 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; Book 2 
of 8 
The stable now belongs to "Scoop." Scoop and her friends 
learn that life is hard sometimes. 
 

BR-3003 Horse of a Different Color/A   Mackall, Dandi Daley 
2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; Book 4 
of 8 
When faced with the possible loss of Horsefeathers Stables, 
Scoop gets caught up in a series of white lies. 

 
BR-2848 Horsefeathers!           Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Horsefeathers Series; 
     Book 1 of 8 

14 year old Sarah "Scoop" Coop knows horses better than she 
knows herself, especially her horse Orphan. When her 
grandfather becomes ill, his stable becomes imperiled. 

 
BR-1902 Hot Chocolate Friendship         Levene, Nancy 



     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Alex Series (The);  
     Book 3 of 5 

Alex is disappointed when she is assigned to do a special 
studies project with Eric, the slowest student in third grade. She 
learns that friendship is better than first place. 

 
BR-1159 House across the Hedge      Hill, Grace Livingston 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Vignettes of life and love of long ago. 
 
BR-2918 House Divided/A      Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 20 of 20 
When Willie's dad buys a second hobby store, hectic schedules 
and lots of work keep the family apart. Willie learns that growing 
up means putting others first and that Jesus is always with him. 

 
BR-2697 House on Honeysuckle Lane/The      Page, Carole 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heartland Memories;  
     Book 1 of 5 

A series that ties the Reed and Herrick families to the house on 
Honeysuckle Lane and to each other. 

 
BR-2   How about Christianity?         Haentschel, A. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-8   How I Found God's Will for My...     Sigsworth, John 
     1 Volume; Biography 
 
BR-2140 How Long, O Lord?            Carson, D. A. 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

A Biblical approach to dealing with the confusion regarding pain 
and evil.  

BR-979  How Sweet the Sound          Hefley, James 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

God is alive and well in country music.   
 
BR-156  How to Build Bridges to Other...    Narramore, Clyde 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 
 
BR-1714 How to Get Along with Almost Any 



                       Wright, H. Norman 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-1950 How to Live with Your Kids          Davis, Ken 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

This book addresses the issues parents and their kids struggle 
with daily.  

 
BR-282  How to Respond-Cults           Beck, Hubert 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 2 of 15 
     The Response Series. Special Evangelism Work 
 
BR-1066 How to Respond-Eastern Religions   Lochhaas, Philip 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 15 of 15 
     The Response Series. Special Evangelism Work. 
 
BR-314  How to Respond-Islam         Lochhaas, Philip 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 13 of 15 
     The Response Series - Special Evangelism Work. 
 
BR-288  How to Respond-Jehovah's Witnesses   Kern, Herbert 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond; 
     Book 3 of 15 

This book compares the beliefs of the Jehovah's Witnesses 
with God's Word. 

BR-1911 How to Respond-Judaism       Kolb, Dr. Erwin 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 4 of 15 

Will help you understand what Judaism is. Teaches how this 
historic faith compares to Christianity and how to witness to 
both Jew and Gentile about God's love and forgiveness through 
faith in Jesus Christ. 

 
BR-287  How to Respond-Latter-Day Saints     Kaiser, Edgar 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 5 of 15 

You'll be able to use this solid, practical information in a myriad 



of situations. The next time you meet a Mormon missionary, 
you'll be prepared to defend your faith and confidently and 
sincerely share the Gospel. 

 
BR-1065 How to Respond-Lodge       Rongstad, L. James 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 6 of 15 
     The Response Series - Special Evangelism Work. 
 
BR-1773 How to Respond-New Age Movement  Lochhaas, Philip 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 8 of 15 

An inside look at the occult practices such as the use of 
crystals, reincarnation, and communication with the spirits.  

 
BR-296  How to Respond-New Christian Religion 
                        Lochhaas, Philip 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 12 of 15 
  
BR-280  How to Respond-Occult           Hoover, D. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond; 
     Book 10 of 15 
BR-1723 How to Respond-Satanism      Frederickson, Bruce 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 9 of 15 

This book will give you a better understanding of Satan and his 
lies. It examines the occult practices that God clearly forbids in 
Scripture and demonstrates how all people can live a victorious 
life over Satan through faith. 

 
BR-773  How to Respond-Science Religion    Harm, Frederick 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond; 
     Book 14 of 15 
     The Response Series.  Special Evangelism Work. 
 
BR-1982 How to Respond-Secular Humanism 
                        Lochhaas, Philip 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond;  
     Book 1 of 15 



Helps you identify Secular Humanism in today’s world and 
understand this deceptive threat to your faith.  It enables you to 
respond from a Biblical perspective to the teachings of Secular 
Humanism. 

 
BR-281  How to Respond-Transcendental Me   Gerberding, K. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; How to Respond  
     The Response Series. Special Evangelism Work 
 
BR-2853 How You are Changing           Graver, Jane 

1 Volume; Preteen, Christian Life; Learning about Sex; Book 3 
of 6 
Changes that occur to preteens can be difficult for them. 

 
BR-2724 Hurricane Power           Brouwer, Sigmund 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series; 
     Book 6 of 6 

After moving to Miami, David gets invited to join the track team, 
then finds himself involved in a mystery.  

BR-2833 Hush, Little One           Stohs, Anita Reith 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

When it's time to climb into bed, read or sing this special 
sleepy-time book to children; you'll sleep soundly knowing that 
God watches over us and cares for us even as we sleep. 

 
BR-3287 Hush, Little One             Stohs, Anita Reith 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1563 Hymns of Praise            Idle, Christopher 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Faith 

A selection of hymns to encourage and inspire. Each hymn is 
accompanied by a story about its author. 

  
BR-112  I am a Woman             Miller, Ella May 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-158  I Believe in Miracles         Kuhlman, Kathryn 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-1839 I Came to Love You Late         Landorf, Joyce 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
A haunting human drama, drawn from the Biblical account of 
Mary, Martha, Lazarus and the Teacher of Nazareth. 

 
BR-2327 I Can't Walk So I'll learn to Dance 
                  Martin, Carolyn/Lewis, Gregg 
     9 Volumes; Autobiography 

Carolyn Martin was born with severe Cerebral Palsy.  
 
BR-2237 I Don't Want to Complain, but...    Schroeder, Ted 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Adolescence can be a wondrous time of change, growth, and 
discovery.  

BR-2719 I Have a New Family Now  
1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Comforting Little Hearts 
Series; Book 1 of 3 

 
BR-226  I Heard the Owl Call My Name    Craven, Margaret 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

First book of series depicting the author's life while growing up 
in the Great Northern Territory. 

 
BR-2646 I Know My Daddy Loves Me    Wolfgram, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2643 I Know My Mommy Loves Me    Wolfgram, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-972  I Love the Word Impossible        Kiemel, Ann 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-2785 I Only Binge on Holy Hungers        Rue, Nancy 

6 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Raise the Flag Series; Book 3 
of 6 
Cheyenne has been meeting to pray with her new friends but 
still feels like an outsider. She doesn’t even have money to buy 
a birthday present so she shoplifts.  

 
BR-829  I Opener              Brokering, Herbert 
     1 Volume; Devotion 



80 parables of "new" ideas.  
 
BR-46  I Shall not Live in Vain          Hooker, Gloria 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

The story of Harriet Beecher Stowe, the author whose book 
changed the attitudes about slavery. 

 
 
 
BR-2238 I Take Out the Garbage because I Love You 
                 Weisheit, Carol/Weisheit, Eldon 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Each devotion pairs Scripture with practical marriage issues, 
helping you see God, marriage, and each other in a different 
light. Brief prayer and homework help you put each concept to 
work in your marriage. 

 
BR-2195 I Was a Stranger and...        Bachman, Anthony 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

The story of Joyce and Morgan Ilgenfritz and their ministry to 
hurting and homeless people. They opened their home to 
unwed mothers, runaways, and ex-convicts all because of their 
great love for Christ and what He can do. 

 
BR-3514 I Will Not be Afraid      Adams, Michelle Medlock 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Helps small children learn that even when scary things occur, 
our all-powerful, loving God is faithful and present. 

 
BR-1864 I Would Like to Know            Kelm, Paul 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Pastor Kelm answers your questions on the basis of what God's 
word says.  

 
BR-2277 If God Loves Me, Why Can't I Get My Locker Open 
                       Peterson, Lorraine 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Faith 
 
BR-2026 Illuminati/The              Burkett, Larry 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



In the year 2001 the Illuminati, a deadly secret organization, 
places one of their people in the office of the presidency of the 
United States.  

BR-2352 I'm So Glad You Told Me What I..  Johnson, Barbara 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Discover the healing power of humor and realize Jesus is the 
hope that will get us through the worst times.  

 
BR-1601 Impatient Turtle/The           Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Pogo's one goal in life was to have fun. But pogo had a 
problem. Because he was a turtle, he couldn't do most of the 
fun things he saw the boys doing who visited his pond.  

 
BR-1488 Improving Your Self Image     Wright, H. Norman 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-88  In Grandma's Attic         Richardson, Arleta 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
1 of 10 

 
BR-2923 In His Footsteps        Better, Cathy Drinkwater 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

How can we help to make the world a better place? We can 
learn to walk in Jesus' footsteps! 

 
BR-1146 In His Image       Brand, Dr Paul/Yancey, Philip 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2632 In His Steps             Sheldon, Charles M. 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

One church pledged to consider "What would Jesus do?" 
before making any decision for a year. Read how it caused joy, 
conflict, and suffering for those involved. 

 
BR-9   In My Father's House         Ten Boom, Corrie 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
     The years before "The Hiding Place." 
 
BR-3605 In the Beginning  Harrison, Matthew/Various Authors 



     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
A collection of essays and Bible studies on the sanctity of early 
human life. 

 
BR-2121 In the Eye of the Storm          Lucado, Max 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Using Christ as the example, the reader is shown how to 
transform panic into peace, stress into serenity. 

 
BR-2487 In the Grip of Grace            Lucado, Max 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     Based on the book of Romans 
 
BR-2423 In the Hand of the Potter      Rogers, Dale Evans 
     6 Volumes; Autobiography 

Dale Evans Rogers confronted issues and attitudes that were 
preventing her from surrendering to God and discovered a new 
kind of joy as she let God take control and shape her life. 

 
BR-2118 In the Mind of A Missionary       Kolander, Mark 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Mark Kolander tells of his call to be a missionary in Zambia, 
Central Africa. He writes his thoughts as he prepares for the 
journey, as well as impressions and challenges of his first two 
years of service there. 

 
BR-1733 In the Palm of His Hand      Various Teen Authors 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Faith 

Several teens share with you some of their own experiences. 
They have written personal devotions that have come out of 
their daily lives. Help you connect your own life experiences 
with your faith. 

 
BR-3593 In the Presence of My Enemies     Burnham, Gracia 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

A gripping account of the kidnaping of American missionaries 
and their year of terror in the Philippine jungle. 

 
BR-2852 In the Shadow of a Secret       Wubbels, Lance 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



Andrew Regan has a small pastorate in rural Minnesota. 
Christina Ellington left the rural town to escape her past, but 
returns to care for her mother. Together they are led by her 
mother to realize what is important in life. 

 
BR-2564 In the Shadow of the Cathedral  Schneider, Christine 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Fires of Faith Series;  
     Book 1 of 2 

The bishop decides to build a new cathedral. 
 
BR-2498 In the Twilight, In the Evening 
                   Morris, Lynn/Morris, Gilbert 

12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series; Book 6 
of 8 
In San Francisco, Cheney has the hard lesson to learn that her 
pride must be controlled and leave healing in God's hands.  

 
BR-227  In Tune with Wedding Bells  

Hill, Grace Livingston 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Collector's Choice Series;  

     Book 2 of 4 
 
BR-3378 In Your Dreams              Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 2 
of 12 
Just when events in Sierra's life start to look up, her 
grandmother needs emergency surgery.  

BR-2169 Indentured Heart/The         Morris, Gilbert 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 3 of 
13 
This book opens another chapter in the compelling saga of the 
Winslow family. Adam Winslow promises to bring Molly Burns 
to America if she will become an indentured servant for ten 
years. 

 
BR-1980 Inheritance/The              Stahl, Hilda 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; White Pine Chronicles Series; Book 2 
of 3 
The Chronicles continue in Upper Michigan in 1890, where only 
a few of the majestic white pines remain.  Lumber is scarce 



and valuable.  One man will stop at nothing to own them 
himself and to destroy the Havlick family.  Lark struggles to 
protect the things, and the people she loves. 

 
BR-2414 Inheritance/The           Alcott, Louisa May 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     The first book ever written by Miss Alcott. An 

impoverished Italian orphan, Edith Avelon's loyalty and beauty 
win her the patronage of wealthy friends until a jealous rival 
contrives to rob her of her position. 

 
BR-1570 Inside Out             Crabb, Dr. Larry 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Helps you look inside yourself as you give God the opportunity 
to set you free from all that keeps you from living in an often 
disappointing world. 

 
BR-1867 International Children's Story Bible 
                     Hollingsworth, Mary 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Children 
     Stories form the Bible for children ages 3 - 7. 
 
BR-2028 Intimate Marriage/The            Sproul, R. C. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A common-sense guide to the skills of marriage rooted in the 
eternal wisdom of the Bible. Covers communication, divorce 
and the sanctity of marriage, problems, etc. 

 
BR-2370 Intimate Moments          Ferguson, David/ 

Ferguson, Teresa/Thurman, Chris/Thurman, Holly 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Short daily devotions to help provide a base for building the 
intimacy you desire in your marriage. 

 
BR-2002 Into His Love             Patterson, Ward 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Creative Praise Series. Touches the heights and depths of life 
by magnifying the glory of God. 

 
BR-2201 Into the Long Dark Night       Phillips, Michael 



4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 6 of 9 
Invited by President Lincoln to visit Washington and help with 
his re-election campaign, Corrie Belle Hollister heads east, 
toward her own roots. As she seeks to sort out God's will, she 
unwittingly uncovers a plot that could change the course of the 
nation forever. She must take action, but the risk could cost her 
life. 

 
BR-1750 Introducing the Books of the Bible 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 

Provides 52-devotional summaries of the Bible books. 
 
BR-2138 Intruder/The                Baer, Judy 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cedar River Daydream 
Series; Book 6 of 12 
A book for teen-age girls. Cedar River Daydreams series deals 
with moving into a new town. 

BR-2399 Invasion from Planet X   Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 
2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 1 of 20 
Willie explores his Christian values when his remote control 
flying machine behaves unpredictably, generating reports of 
UFOs and motivating the Air Force to plan a command center 
in Glenfield. 

 
BR-931  Irregular People             Landorf, Joyce 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The problems of interpersonal relationship and how to deal with 
them. 

 
BR-3041 Is God Listening?        Steinmann, Andrew E. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

The book shows us a pattern of prayer we can use in our daily 
life. We can feel comfortable with our prayers and know that 
God is listening. 

 
BR-3473 Isaiah 1-39                Braun, John 

5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 



      
BR-3574 Island of Heavenly Daze/The 
               Copeland, Lori/Hunt, Angela Elwell 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heavenly Daze Series;  
     Book 1 of 5 

The island of Heavenly Daze is inhabited by many local 
characters as well as some appointed angels who look after 
them all.  

 
BR-3556 Island of the Innocent    Morris, Gilbert/Morris, Lynn 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series; Book 7 
of 8 
Cheney and Shilow are on the island of Hawaii when a volcano 
erupts. 

BR-3509 It Had to be You            Windsor, Linda 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Rancher Dan Jarrett and nurse Sunny Elders meet on a cruise 
ship and before the high sea adventure is over their stubborn 
hearts will learn to trust each other and the One who orders our 
steps. 

 
BR-1995 It's a Mystery to Me, Lord       Sorensen, David 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Devotion 
     Bible devotions for preteen boys. 
 
BR-2758 It's Always Darkest Before the Fun Comes Up 
                        Pierce, Chonda 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Chonda reveals the God Who knows how to turn life's worst 
punches into glorious punch lines. 

 
BR-904  It's My Turn               Graham, Ruth 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The wife of evangelist Billy Graham shares the events of her 
life. 

 
BR-2287 I've Found My Keys, Now Where's My Car? 
                        Littauer, Florence 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Trials, temptations, tragedies, testing, and tough times 



everybody has their share. 
 
BR-1560 I've Got to Talk to Somebody, God   Holmes, Marjorie 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

True-to-life stories about kids who deal with problems that 
make them doubt their importance to others and to God. Each 
story has questions to help you think about how you would 
handle the same situations. 

 
 
BR-2020 I've Heard Your Feelings          Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Adult, Poetry 
 
BR-1531 Jacob: God's Plain Man        Cantleberry, Lillian 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Relates the birth, life, and death of Jacob. 
 
BR-3083 Jacob's Ladder            Tracy, Pamela Kaye 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Sewing Circle Book;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Samantha dreams of riches and escaping her life as a clerk. 
 
BR-3444 Jacob's List             Whitson, Stephanie 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jacob Nolan has a list of things to do before he "settles down." 
But when his life is suddenly snuffed out will his parents work 
together to complete the list with his best friend, or will they be 
torn further apart? 

 
BR-1533 Jamie MacLeod Highland Lass 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The story of Jamie's quest for nobility.  
 
BR-2314 Janette Oke             Logan, Laurel Oke 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

The biography of one of our best-loved novelists as written by 
her daughter. 

 
BR-3079 Jehoshaphat                Pawlitz, Gail 



1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Little Learner Bible Story Books 
God helped Jehoshaphat defeat a wicked enemy and helps us 
defeat our enemy, sin, through the work of Jesus Christ. 

BR-2366 Jen's Pride and Joy            Coyle, Neva 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jennifer Whipple is finishing her degree in interior design and 
working in a department store. 

 
BR-3305 Jeremiah and Lamentations      Poellet, Daniel 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

Topics include: national disgrace, the New Covenant, 
faithfulness in trials, joy in God's calling.  

 
BR-2966 Jerusalem Vigil      Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Zion Legacy Series;  
     Book 1 of 6 

Israeli independence is just won and the British have occupied 
Jerusalem, but the fighting between Israeli and Arab 
escalates--who will take over the Holy City? 

 
BR-2554 Jesus and the Storm  
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; My Bible Friends;  
     Book 1 of 3 
     Jesus and the Children 
 
BR-2954 Jesus and the Woman at the Well  Busch, Melinda Kay 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     Based on Bible story from John 4:1-42 
 
BR-2718 Jesus Blesses the Children  
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Arch Books 
 
BR-2956 Jesus Calls His Disciples          Pawlitz, Gail 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Based on Matthew 4:18-22; Mark 1:14-20; Luke 5:1-11; John 
1:35-51 
 

BR-2492 Jesus Calms the Storm         Cook, Jean Thor 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
BR-2997 Jesus Christ Disciple-Maker          Hull, Bill 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-2953 Jesus Enters Jerusalem           Fryar, Jane 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-3402 Jesus Hears Me              Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2917 Jesus Is With Me             Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2795 Jesus Knows Me                Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3279 Jesus Loves Me              Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This little Poem and the charming Illustrations that go with it 
teach little ones that Jesus Loves Us. 

 
BR-2996 Jesus Loves Me              Miller, Calvin 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

No other song more succinctly and plainly states the basic 
elements of faith. Within these three words and the rest of the 
song are found the basic tenets of Christianity. 

 
BR-2824 Jesus Returns to Heaven         Baden, Robert 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Ascension story for children. Matthew 28:11-20, Luke 24:36-53, 
Acts 1:1-12. 

 
BR-2802 Jesus Rose On Easter Morn'  Stockstill, Gloria McQueen 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
 
BR-3425 Jesus Shows His Glory       Schkade, Jonathan 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Story of the Transfiguration explains who Jesus is; God the 
Son, the Savior, who would die. 

 
BR-2986 Jesus Walks Away            Bergt, Carolyn 



1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books; Story of Jesus 
teaching in Nazareth. 

      
BR-3342 Jesus Walks on the Water         Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
      
BR-3335 Jesus, My Good Shepherd        Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
      
BR-2984 Jesus, My Savior       Gimbel, Jim/Gimbel, Abby 

1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     Book of Luke and Acts 1 for children. 
 
BR-1409 Jeweled Sword/The              Hill, Ruth 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3292 Job                 Van der Linde, Dirk 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

Why do the just suffer? Where is God in midst of loss, illness, 
ridicule and defeat? Job's story gives us the purpose for 
adversity, Satan's role and the hope and strength we have 
through the promise of our Redeemer. 

 
BR-3080 Job                  Honsey, Rudolph E. 

5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

 
BR-900  Job's Niece            Hill, Grace Livingston 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1833 Job's Wife                  Shaw, Jean 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jean Shaw re-tells the familiar story from the perspective of 
Job's wife. His loss is her loss. His tragedies, her tragedies. A 
story of faithfulness to her husband and to God. 

 
BR-1357 Johann Sebastian Bach had a Wife  Peterson, William 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1192 John Bunyan             Dengler, Sandy 



     3 Volumes; Biography 
John Bunyan could out-swear any man alive, and he had spent 
twelve years in jail, but then God got hold of him.  Bunyan 
wrote many pamphlets and books including the well-known 
Pilgrim's Progress. 

 
BR-2574 John Bunyan              Wellman, Sam 
     Book 1 of 8 

John Bunyan's life changed after reading his wife's family's 
religious books. 

 
BR-943  John Newton               Newton, John 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

His life from a slave trader to hymn composer ("Amazing 
Grace"). 

 
BR-364  Jon and the Little Lost Lamb      Latourette, Jane 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-320  Joni                   Eareckson, Joni 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

After a swimming accident, Joni is left permanently paralyzed. 
She overcame her devastation with faith in God. 

 
BR-2667 Jordan's Crossing            Arthur, Randall 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Driven by revenge, Pastor Jordan Rau tracks his son's killers 
and almost destroys his wife and daughter, as well as himself. 
A mystery which offers insight and healing to those affected by 
liberalism in the church. 

 
BR-526  Joseph                  Barrett, Ethel 
     1 Volume; Bible Study 
 
BR-2495 Joseph and His Brothers          Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2990 Joseph Forgives His Brothers       Baden, Robert 

1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books; Genesis 37, 39-45 
for children 



Story of Joseph sold into slavery and his relation to his 
brothers. 

 
BR-330  Joseph Scroll/The           Wilson, Clifford 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2553 Joseph's New Coat          Degering, Etta B. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; My Bible Friends; 
     Book 2 of 3 
     Joseph and His Brothers 
 
BR-1776 Joshua                Girzone, Joseph 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Follow the life of Joshua as he moves into a small cabin on the 
edge of town. 

 
BR-3391 Joshua                  Dunker, Gary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

Traces God's covenant of grace, His promise to Abraham. 
Joshua anticipates the fulfillment of God's promise. 

BR-1848 Joshua                Harstad, Adolph 
5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     Bible Study of the Book of Joshua (NIV). 
 
BR-1889 Joshua and the Children         Girzone, Joseph 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Joshua arrives in a village and witnesses the doings of 
unscrupulous leaders and violent people. Through the children 
of the village Joshua is able to restore a sense of peacefulness 
and honesty. A modern-day parable. 

 
BR-2865 Journey to Bliss              Glover, Ruth 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saskatchewan Saga Series; Book 3 
of 5 
The British Women's Emigration Society recruits women for the 
"Bride's Ship" to the Canadian West. 

 
BR-2913 Journey to Easter            Bergt, Carolyn 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 



Young readers travel on the Journey to Easter and experience 
the special events in Holy Week. 

 
BR-1137 Journey to Love              Bacher, June 

3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Journey to Love Series; Book 
1 of 5 
With unyielding faith and resilience, Rachel Buchanan seeks 
adventure along the frontier trail to Oregon. 

 
BR-2117 Journey to Nowhere             Baer, Judy 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cedar River Daydream 
Series; Book 4 of 12 
A book for teen-age girls. Cedar River Daydreams series deals 
with moving into a new town. 

 
 
BR-2052 Journey West/The            Schulte, Elaine 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; California Pioneer Series; 
     Book 1 of 4 

Abby Talbot has enjoyed a life of wealth and privilege. 
Suddenly she finds herself orphaned, bankrupt and joining 
relatives moving to the West. 

 
BR-2577 Joy from Ashes                Lacy, Al 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Battles of Destiny Series; Book 5 of 6 
Major Layne Dalton learns that enemy soldiers in the Civil War 
have brutalized his wife and caused the death of his unborn 
son. He vows vengeance but through a miracle learns that 
vengeance belongs to the Lord. 

 
BR-2405 Joy I'd never Known/A          Dravecky, Jan 
     7 Volumes; Autobiography 

Jan Dravecky writes of her experiences in dealing with 
depression and helping her husband through his battle with 
cancer and the loss of his arm and baseball career. 

 
BR-1347 Joy that Lasts        Smalley, Gary/Jansen, Al 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2736 Joy the Clown Strengthens Heartland 



                       Holdsworth, Daniel 
1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Life; Heartland Series/The 
A parable about joy that teaches about the fruits of the Spirit. 

 
BR-341  Joy to My Heart             Gleason, Gene 
     5 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-3411 Joy to the World             Sawyer, Ruth 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction 
BR-1771 Joy to the World              Bickel, Philip 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author makes it clear that the true essence of mission is 
bringing the Gospel of Christ to people.  He helps Christians 
discover new ways to participate in missions by breaking down 
the age-old stereotype. 

 
BR-3492 Judges                  Dunker, Gary 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 
      
BR-1740 Julia's Last Hope              Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 2 
of 12 
John and Julia Harrigan live a tranquil life in Calder Springs. 
The death of the town involves John's work, their home and 
daughters. Raised in the East and educated in a fine school, 
Julia seemed an unlikely one to change the situation. By the 
grace of God, Julia decides they must find a way to save the 
town and their home. 

 
BR-2655 June                  Copeland, Lori 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of the West 1872 Series; Book 
2 of 6 
June Kallahan travels to the Northwest to be the bride of a 
young pastor but nothing works as planned.  

 
BR-2183 Junk Food Finders           O'Conner, Karen 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Edit Series; Book 1 of 4 
  
BR-3417 Just above a Whisper            Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Tucker Mills Trilogy;  



     Book 2 of 3 
Reese Thackery is an indentured servant to the bank until its 
owner Conner Kingsley comes to town to do an audit. Can 
Reese see beyond her role as servant to accept God's larger 
plan for her life? 

BR-2729 Just Enough Light for the Step I'm On 
                       Omartian, Stormie 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Prayers and Bible verses to help you move ahead in life, no 
matter what you are experiencing at the time. 

 
BR-1896 Just in Case You ever Wonder       Lucado, Max 
     1 Volume; Children 

A parent tells a child how special she is, both to the parent and 
to God. 

 
BR-2866  Just Like Mama             Lewis, Beverly 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction 

Susie Mae wants to be "just like Mama" and sets out to do what 
she does with amusing and touching results. Ultimately she is 
encouraged to be "just like the Lord Jesus." 

 
BR-2418 Justifiable Means           Blackstock, Terri 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sun Coast Chronicles Series; Book 
2 of 4 
Detective Larry Millsaps is investigating the attempted rape of a 
young woman. Larry finds himself caught in a deadly conflict 
between the ironies of the law and the demands of his Christian 
convictions. 

 
BR-3306 Justification and Sanctification      Maas, Korey 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
Righteousness, relationship, good works, grace. So many 
opinions. What do we believe? 

 
BR-1587 Kaleidoscope/The           Cloninger, Claire 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This is a book for those who long to see beyond the bits and 
pieces of their lives. 

BR-2584 Karyn's Memory Box         Whitson, Stephanie 



     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Keepsake Legacies;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Karyn Ritter leaves a box of memories from the day she arrived 
in Nebraska from Germany until her death. 

 
BR-2864 Katharina Von Bora 
          Markwald, Rudolf K./Markwald, Marilynn Morris 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Biography                                                       

An accurate historical biography of Katharina Von Bora through 
childhood, early adult years and marriage to Luther.  

 
BR-342  Katherine, Wife of Luther       Schreiber, Clara 
     4 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1281 Katherine's Yesterday       Hill, Grace Livingston 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2819 Katheryn's Secret              Hall, Linda 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Aunt Katie leaves her stories and journals to mystery writer 
Sharon Colebrook. 

 
BR-1553  Katie's Adventure at Blueberry Pond  

McDowell, J. & D. 
     1 Volume; Children 

Katie learns that her parents have a good reason for the rules 
they make. 

 
BR-2276 Kay James        James, Kay/Fuller, Jacquelline 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, 

Raised in poverty, facing discrimination because she is black, 
mistreated by an alcoholic father and an aunt, the odds were 
against her. But after starting her new life as a Christian, God 
opened doors for her. 

BR-2682 Keeping the Faith            Dittmer, Terry 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-2174 Keeping Your Teen in Touch-God 
                       Laurent, Dr. Robert 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 



Based on solid research and filled with real-life stories, this is a 
book that listens to teens. It is written especially for parents with 
kids entering the most confusing, unpredictable time of their 
lives. 

 
BR-2721 Kiddie Kindness and the Good News   

Holdsworth, Daniel 
1 Volume; Preschool, Christian Life; Heartland Series/The 
A parable about kindness that teaches about the fruits of the 
Spirit. 

 
BR-3109 Kids Bible/The               Lane, Leena 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Children's version of major Old and New Testament Bible 
stories. 

 
BR-343  Kim             Stevens, Leland/Trent, John 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

Kim believes her blindness is a gift from God because she 
"sees" more than most sighted people. 

 
BR-3424 King Josiah and God's Book      Nelson, Kristin R. 
     1 Volume; 2 Kings 22:1--23"27 for children.   
     Josiah renews the covenant. 
 
BR-2733 Kingdom Tales                Mills, Ron 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Bible Study 

Five parables Jesus told with modern-day applications for the 
older elementary reader. 

BR-2450 King's Daughter/The      Alden, Isabella MacDonald 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Dell moves in with her aunt and uncle after her mother dies. 
 
BR-344  Kitty My Rib                 Mall, E. J. 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

Story of Katherine Luther, woman of courage and devotion. 
 
BR-2391 Knight and the Dove/The          Wick, Lori 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kensington Chronicles;  
     Book 4 of 4 



King Henry commands a young knight, Bracken of Hawking’s 
Crest, to marry into one of the crown's most loyal families. The 
oldest daughter refuses to marry a lowly earl, so Lord Vincent 
calls his youngest daughter back. 

 
BR-2967 Knock, Knock!        Howie, Vicki/Macleon, Moira 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Just as the innkeeper is about to go to bed, a few noisy visitors. 
 
BR-1853 Lady of Stonewycke    Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Stonewycke Trilogy Series; Book 3 of 
3 
It continues with the sweeping saga of three generations in the 
lives of an aristocratic Scottish family. 

 
BR-1386 Lady's Confession/The        MacDonald, George 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1434 Laird's Inheritance/The       MacDonald, George 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2645 Land of a Thousand Dreams         Hoff, B. J. 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; an Emerald Ballad Series; Book 3 of 
5 
The drama of Ireland's battle to survive both on the Emerald 
Isle and in the streets of the New World. Morgan's friends 
Michael and Nora discover that the Land of Opportunity teems 
with poverty. 

 
BR-2516 Land of Promise              Tedrow, T. L. 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder Series; 
Book 8 of 8 
Mansfield faces the problems of racism and a clash of cultures 
when Chinese immigrants try to settle. 

 
BR-2203 Land of the Brave and the Free      Phillips, Michael 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 7 of 9 
The continuing journal of Corrie Belle Hollister. Escaping the 
Confederate territory on horseback, Corrie Belle is shot in the 



back. Will she discover the answers to life's most important 
questions at the convent? 

 
BR-3562 Land of the Shadow           Morris, Gilbert 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Appomattox Saga Series; 
     Book 4 of 4 
 
BR-1618 Landlady's Master/The        MacDonald, George 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Portrays a fascinating triangle of relationships. Alexa Fordyce, 
Andrew Ingram, and a servant girl named Dawtie have been 
inseparable since childhood, but Alexa's father owns the land, 
Andrew's family are tenants, and Dawtie is the child of a lowly 
cotter couple.  MacDonald traces their spiritual journeys, 
blending in mystery. 

 
BR-1632 Last Battle/The              Lewis, C. S. 
     3 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series;  
     Book 7 of 7 

How evil came to Narnia and Aslan led his people. 
 
BR-1962 Last Christmas/The             Bibee, John 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series; Book 5 of 
7 
With the ORDER party taking over the whole town of 
Centerville, things seem so bad that Barry feels it will be his last 
Christmas. It will actually become his first. 

 
BR-3012 Last Confederate/The          Morris, Gilbert 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; 
     Book 8 of 13 

The Winslows face conscription into fighting for a cause they do 
not support and against their relatives. 

 
BR-2068 Last Minute Miracle/The        Palmer, Bernard 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Danny Orlis Series;  
     Book 2 of 6 

Danny's reputation follows him to his new school, where 
everyone wants him as their new star quarterback.  

 



BR-2105 Last Thing We Talk About/The      Bayly, Joseph 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Through the experience of losing three sons to death, Joe 
Bayly realized the importance of considering the matters of 
death and dying. 
 

BR-1993 Laugh Again              Swindoll, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Taken from solid Biblical principles drawn especially from the 
New Testament, Chuck Swindoll encourages you to share in 
the joy of life. 

 
BR-2053 Laughing Cat/The           Murphy, Elspeth 
     1 Volume; Children 

Three cousins pursue a thief at a flea market and learn about 
the commandment "You shall not steal." 

 
BR-3273 Law and Gospel              Maas, Korey 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
A basic understanding of Law and Gospel. 

 
BR-3536 Leather and Lace             Mills, DiAnn 
     4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Texas Legacy;  
     Book 1 of 4 
 
BR-896  Leave Yourself Alone           Price, Eugenia 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Prods us to move beyond the self-knowledge syndrome of 
today and into real Christian living. 

 
BR-2130 Leaving the Light on    Smalley, Gary/Trent, John 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Suggests how to build memories which will form lasting 
friendships with your children. 

 
BR-2522 Lee William's Quest             Gage, Joy 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Sequel to "A Land of Heart's Desire." Lee William fights in the 
Civil War and gets imprisoned. He discovers his greatest battle 
is not with the enemy but with himself. 



 
BR-1682 Left Alone                 Becker, Ruth 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

What begins as a tragedy, ends as a story of strength, comfort 
and wisdom. More than a personal account of widowhood 
offers advice and encouragement to all who are left alone. 

 
BR-1910 Left Behind               Sorenson, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Katie Hooper Series; 
     Book 8 of 8 

A Katie Hooper Book.  When her best friend moves away in 
the summer, Katie worries. 

 
BR-3552 Legacy                    Lacy, Al 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 1 of 7 
Can the stranger bring Clay Austin back to the right side of the 
law and restore the code of honor. 

 
BR-3387 Legacy Lane             Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Hart's Crossing; Book 1 of 4 

Angie Hunter decides to go home to take care of her mother 
after surgery, since she was passed over for a job promotion. 
Her mother is anxious to nudge Angie back toward faith without 
overdoing it and losing her forever. 

 
BR-1589 Legacy of a Pack Rat           Graham, Ruth 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

Ruth Graham has brought together a lifetime of poems, 
experiences, memories, and meditations. 

 
BR-2565 Legend of Fire/The             Roddy, Lee 

4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ladd Family Adventure/ A; Book 3 
of 4 
A young Christian inadvertently places his family in danger on 
Hawaii's Kona Coast.  

 
BR-2316 Legend of Robin Brodie/The        Samson, Lisa 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Highlanders Series;  
     Book 2 of 1 



After a vicious attack on his family by the English invaders, 
Robin Brodie learns to face life again. 

BR-3412 Let Freedom Ring            Hannity, Sean 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Sean Hannity offers a survey of the world--political, social and 
cultural as he sees it. Points out that the greatest challenge we 
have is to stop the slow compromising of our national character. 

 
BR-3014 Let it Snow!              Boeshaar, Andrea 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Snowbound for Christmas; Book 1 of 
2 
A Christmas Eve blizzard makes a chance reunion with Shari 
and the fiancé she left 20 years ago. 

 
BR-3053 Let Me Hold You Longer        Kingsbury, Karen 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Christian Life 

A heartwarming reminder of the precious process of growing up 
and the joys of watching it happen. 

 
BR-2844 Let There Be Laughter 
                Bimler, Richard/Bimler, Robert D. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A book that will humorously help you focus on living each day 
as a gift from God. 

 
BR-3505 Let's Illustrate              Weisheit, Eldon 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Ideas and concepts to help you better communicate God's 
Word. 

 
BR-1552 Let's Keep Christmas          Marshall, Peter 
     1 Volume; Devotion 

Peter Marshall helps you pause and remember that Christmas 
means the birth of the Christ child. He pays tribute to the family 
customs that make the holidays so special. 

 
BR-3117 Leviticus                  Dunker, Gary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

An in-depth look at the book of Leviticus, studies holiness unto 
the Lord, sacrifice and Sacrament. 



 
BR-1852 Lie Evolution/The            Ham, Kenneth 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author uses the Bible as a dependable account of actual 
events that are supported by solid scientific evidence, to give 
much needed answers to the common questions of the 
unbeliever concerning Evolution. 

 
BR-1705 Life and Faith of Martin Luther      Fehlauer, Adolph 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

An account of Martin Luther's life from the time of a divided 
Germany in the early 16th century to his death. 

 
BR-1681 Life Apart/A               Evans, Shirlee 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Life Series by Shirlee Evans; Book 2 
of 2 
Gail’s marriage is shaken when the daughter she gave up for 
adoption fifteen-years ago reenters her life. 

 
BR-1452 Life in Her Hands/A           Evans, Shirlee 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Life Series by Shirlee Evans; Book 1 
of 2 
Rejected by her own parents, Gail finds herself expecting a 
child at fifteen. Three months pregnant, she reaches out to her 
foster mother for help.  

 
BR-2340 Life in the Fishbowl           Rogers, Tom 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Takes a look at life in service to the church with both inspiration 
and humor.  Covers topics like handling criticism, time 
management, money issues, prayer, and lack of personal and 
family time. 

 
BR-2465 Life on the Real World           Ritter, Eileen 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Devotion 

Life in the Real World helps teens search God's Word for His 
spin on life's temptations, trials, and triumphs. 

 
BR-489  Life is Forever                Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 



 
BR-3052 Life is Tough but God is Faithful      Walsh, Sheila 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Discover how to triumph in spite of suffering as the author 
identifies choices everyone must make. 
 

BR-1481 Life Sentence              Colson, Charles 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Based on the experience of a Christian minister who survived 
the Nazi death camp.  

 
BR-2044 Lifelight #14-Acts Part 2   Kolb, Dr. Erwin/Maier, Paul 
     6 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2563  Liferails                  Walker, Scott 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Biblical truths for coping with that problem. 
 
BR-1326 Light for the Way, New Test. Book 2    Starr, Frank 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study; Book 2, Mark and Epistles 
 
BR-3584 Light from Heaven              Karon, Jan 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 9 of 9 

Father Timothy Kavanaugh goes into the mountains to revive a 
small congregation and finds that he and Cynthia are renewed 
in ministry as he deals with these forgotten people. 

 
BR-1736 Light in My Heart/A          Kang, Young Woo 
     2 Volumes; Autobiography 
 
BR-458  Light in My Window          Arnold, Francena 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2506 Light in the Window/A            Karon, Jan 
     15 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 2 of 9 

Father Tim is in love with Cynthia, but a wealthy widow is 
pursuing Father Tim. 

 



BR-2136 Light that was Dark/The         Smith, Warren 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

Story of Warren Smith and his search for the ultimate truth in 
this world. He tries many of the new-age paths seeking 
spirituality only to find that the truth is what he has ridiculed for 
so long the Bible. 

 
BR-2701 Lighten Up!                 Davis, Ken 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Ken Davis weaves stranger-than-life stories into insights that 
cut to the heart of Christ-like living. 

 
BR-2628 Lights Out at Camp What-A-Nut     McCusker, Paul 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 5 of 12 
Summer camp doesn't seem like much fun when Mark finds out 
that he is sharing a cabin with a bully from Odyssey and that his 
best friend Patti has a boyfriend. 

 
BR-2764 Like Abigail                Barger, Millie 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Gail leaves the orphanage for an arranged marriage and life 
becomes difficult.  

BR-2811 Like Gold Refined             Oke, Janette 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Legacy Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Virginia fears change as she sees her elderly grandparents 
decline and the mother of foster child Mindy return. 

 
BR-2387 Like Lambs to the Slaughter    Michaelsen, Johanna 
     14 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Takes the concerned parent into the world of the innocent child. 
 
BR-3587 Line of Duty 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Newpointe 911 Series;  
     Book 5 of 5 

In Line of Duty, a bomb explodes at the Icon International 
building in New Orleans while lawyer Jill Clark Nichols is in the 
top floor boardroom. The thirty-story building goes up in flames 
and fire departments from all around the area are called in. The 



firefighters from Newpointe are especially concerned since they 
know Jill is inside the building. When the smoke finally clears, a 
count is taken. Jill narrowly escapes the chaos of the 
explosions and fire only to find that her husband Dan is 
missing. 

 
BR-1772 Lion, the Witch, and the Wardrobe      Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series;  
     Book 2 of 7 
     How Aslan, the noble lion freed Narnia from the spell. 
 
BR-1078 Lisa                   Shaffer, Betty 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

Lisa, a teenager from a good Christian home, did not suddenly 
one day decide to be rebellious those first small choices had 
seemed so innocent. Now she is pregnant. 

BR-2007 Listen! God is Speaking to You     Paustian, Henry 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; God's Word for seniors. 
 
BR-1439 Listening Ear/The            Tournier, Paul 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Christian caring, patient listening and compassion are the 
components the author utilizes as he shares his many years of 
experience as a physician, husband, lecturer, and writer. 

 
BR-2582 Little Girl Lost 
           Joseph, Leisha/Mendenhall, Deborah Bruner 

5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith                                   
The events of Leisha Joseph's life, her relationship to God, and 
what she can now teach others who suffer from  fear and hurt 
that result from violence and trauma. 

 
BR-1900 Little House in the Ozarks     Wilder, Laura Ingals 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

A collection of rediscovered writings, most of which have not 
been published since the early 1900's. 

 
BR-2187 Little House on Rocky Ridge      Macbride, Roger Lea 
     6 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

The story of Rose Wilder's move from South Dakota to Missouri 



with her parents, Almazo and Laura Ingalls Wilder. Roger 
MacBride is the adopted grandson of Rose Wilder Lane and 
writes from original journals. 

 
BR-1369 Little House on the Freeway        Kimmel, Tim 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-819  Little House on the Prairie     Wilder, Laura Ingals 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     The travels of the Ingalls family, pioneers in the 1800's. 
 
BR-1541 Little Visits with Jesus           Simon, Mary 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
     Daily devotions for families with young children. 
 
BR-2610 Little-Kids' Olympics          O'Conner, Karen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Action Readers Series; 
     Book 2 of 4 

Luke is disappointed when he's passed over for VBS sports 
coach. But he follows where God leads. 

 
BR-1324 Living above the Level of Mediocrity  Swindoll, Charles 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Living Beyond Series;  
     Book 3 of 5 
 
BR-2750 Living Beyond Regrets          Doud, Guy Rice 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Regrets, we all have them. But will we, as Christians, allow 
them to paralyze or propel us, lose our faith or use our faith? 
The road back may be uphill, but it is worth the climb. 

 
BR-1586 Living Beyond the Daily Grind     Swindoll, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Living Beyond Series;  
     Book 1 of 5 

Reflections on the songs and sayings in Scripture that help you 
cope with the daily grinds that can steal the joy. 

 
BR-1628 Living Beyond the Daily Grind     Swindoll, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion; Living Beyond Series; 
     Book 2 of 5 



Contains 13 Chapters on Psalms, "Songs in Scripture", and 13 
chapters on Proverbs, "Sayings in Scripture". Each chapter 
ends with valuable action steps that will help you apply the 
chapter's message to everyday life. 

 
BR-1577 Living By God's Surprises        Myra, Harold 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Through personal experiences and anecdotes from the lives of 
great Christians. 

 
BR-334  Living Gospels/The          Taylor, Kenneth 
     7 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-3315 Living in Christ             Paulus, Victor 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Study of the Small Catechism with questions, word studies, 
hymn verses, etc. 

 
BR-1768 Living in the Forgiveness of God     Bjorge, James 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 

Through stories and examples, the author shows how 
forgiveness is the greatest miracle in Christianity. 

 
BR-2677 Living on Nothing Atoll          Kelly, Theresa 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Aloha Cove;  
     Book 1 of 8 

Cass's life is turned upside down when her mother remarries 
and they go to live with her new stepfather and stepsister on 
one of the Marshall Islands in the Pacific Ocean. 

 
BR-1410 Living on the Plus Side        Lockerbie, Jeanette 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-1413 Living on the Ragged Edge       Swindoll, Charles 
     9 Volumes; Christian Life 

Coming to Terms with Reality. Based on Solomon's ancient 
journal Ecclesiastes. 

 
 
 



BR-1534 Living Sacrifice            Roseveare, Helen 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

One women's transforming journey from self-love to the 
self-giving love of Christ. Profound devotional reading for 
Christians on what it means to be a "Living Sacrifice". 

 
BR-2205 Living the Lord's Prayer       Anderson, Richard 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Historical details and real-life stories inspire readers to pray the 
Lord's Prayer with vigor and understanding. 

 
BR-2274 Living with My Lord           Kettner, Elmer 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; a Christian growth study guide 
for church women. 

 
BR-2280 Living with Your Dreams         Seamands, David 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Explains how God plants dreams in you to fulfill His purposes. 
Shows how God is with you in reshaping unrealistic dreams, 
restoring broken dreams, realizing delayed dreams.  

 
BR-1261 Lo, Michael            Hill, Grace Livingston 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 13 of 14 
When Mickey took the bullet intended for the baby daughter of 
a wealthy banker, his life was changed forever. From a poor, 
tattered child he became a well-educated and wealthy man, but 
he never forgot his friends and family in the tenements of New 
York. His vision was to help transform their lives. 

 
BR-1429 Load of Trouble/A            Davoll, Barbara 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Christopher Churchmouse Classics; 
Book 5 of 6 

BR-2360 Lone Point             Hill, Grace Livingston 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Maria insists on being unhappy when her parents rent out their 
home for the summer and move to a cottage at Lone Point. 
While there she meets Howard, a young minister. 

 
BR-1849 Loneliness                Elliot, Elisabeth 



     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
The author shares with the reader her own life's experiences as 
she was been widowed twice. How she has coped with 
loneliness and how she has gained strength through her faith. 

 
BR-2144 Long Road Home/The            Wick, Lori 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Place Called Home Series; Book 3 of 
4 
Paul Cameron is blinded by bitterness from the loss of Corrine. 
A tree crushes Paul's legs and he encounters the love of God in 
the patient care of his nurse, Abigail Finlayson. 

 
BR-1071 Long Way Home/The           Jewell, John 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 

One man's excursion into a painful loss of faith and his difficult 
journey back. 

 
BR-2924 Looking for You All My Life       Carlson, Melody 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Whispering Pines Series; 
     Book 3 of 4 

Pine Mountain businesses are headed for failure but a new land 
development may give reason to hope, until Maggie writes a 
revealing article about the developer and trouble starts to brew. 

 
 
BR-3061 Lord Calls Samuel/The         Hammond, Susan 1 

Volume; Primary, Arch Book 
The calling of Samuel to be God's servant.  

 
BR-1140 Lord of the Second Advent      Kemperman, Steve 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

The author recounts the gradual process by which he was 
drawn into the mental and emotional dependence of the family 
of Sun Myung Moon. 

 
BR-1497 Lord Teach Me Wisdom         Mayhall, Carole 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Discoveries provide inspiration, practical helps, and Biblical 
food for thought for women who want to deepen their 
knowledge. 



 
BR-2776 Lord Told Me--I Think/The         Matzat, Don 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Author shares ways God can speak to your heart and direct 
your paths. 

 
BR-2920 Lord's Prayer/The  
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2491 Lord's Prayer/The            Baden, Robert 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-899  Lord's Prayer/The         Hoffman, Dr. Oswald 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
     Help and encouragement in learning how to pray. 
 
BR-527 Lord's Supper Today/The         Elbert, Werner 

2 Volumes; Christian Faith; Contemporary Theology Series.   
An account of the Lord's Supper with examination of the 
doctrine. 

BR-2961 Lord's Supper/The             Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This charming book for young children teaches about the 
Sacrament of the Altar and the divine refreshment. 

 
BR-2808 Lord's Supper/The            Seltz, Gregory 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
A study of the Lord's Supper with comparisons to beliefs of 
other Christian denominations. 

 
BR-3325 Lost Coin/The             Dreyer, Nicole E. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

The parable of the lost coin, how precious each one is to Jesus. 
 
BR-3561 Lost in His Love               Cote, Lyn 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Blessed Assurance Series; Book 2 of 
3 

 
BR-893  Love Comes Softly             Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 1 of 



8 
The story of Marty, a young pioneer wife, who is left alone to 
learn firsthand the lessons of life. 

 
BR-1731 Love Finds a Home            Oke, Janette 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 8 of 
8 
Belinda once again faces decisions about her life and then the 
one person she never expects to see again - returns. 

 
BR-1331 Love Gift/The           Hill, Grace Livingston 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3275 Love Him in the Morning          Fischer, John 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

The story behind the song Love Him in the Morning, and how 
the message can change you. 

 
BR-1692 Love is a Choice 
         Hemfelt, Dr. Robert/Minirth, Dr. R./Meier, Dr. Paul 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Dr.'s Hemfelt, Minirth, and Meier walk you through their 10 
proven stages to recovery from co-dependency introducing a 
new dimension: the important state of seeing God's 
unconditional love. 

 
BR-1019 Love is a Gentle Stranger         Bacher, June 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Is A Gentle Stranger Series; 
Book 1 of 6 
After Chris Beth is jilted by her fiancée. 
 

BR-1763 Love Leads Home             Bacher, June 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Is A Gentle Stranger Series; 
Book 4 of 6 
Stagecoach days are gone. Shining rails now link the East and 
West. A young girl journeys from Oregon to Atlanta. Her future 
brings new dangers and new joys.  

 
BR-1395 Love Must be Tough           Dobson, James 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 



     New hope for marriages in crisis. 
 
BR-2583 Love on the Run            MacDonald, Shari 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Salinger Sisters/The;  
     Book 1 of 3 

The Salinger sisters run an ad agency. When younger sister 
Daphne runs away with the competition's youngest son, 
Catherine vows to stop the elopement so no ad information is 
leaked. 

 
BR-1425 Love Takes Wing             Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 7 of 
8 
 

BR-3022 Love worth Giving/A            Lucado, Max 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

How do you love someone who is hard to love? 
 
BR-3446 Love, Annie            Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction 

Annie Lind was born to be "Professor Love" her website column 
for the lovelorn. But when her dream date asks her out she 
ignores friends and commitments.  

 
BR-3028 Love, Joy, Peace             Burgland, Lane 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Fruit of the Spirit 

Bible Study explores the vital works of the Christian's life, 
understands Holy Spirit work of sanctification, and recognizes 
personal strengths and weaknesses, identify ways to bear fruit. 

 
BR-2547 Love, Values to Live By       Moncure, Jane Belk 

1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Values to Live By;  
     Book 3 of 5 
 
BR-1027 Love's Abiding Joy             Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 4 of 
8 

 
BR-1630 Love's Beautiful Dream          Bacher, June 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 2 of 6 



In this anxiously awaited sequel to "Love's Soft Whisper", Clint 
Desmind and Courtney Glamora deepen their relationship with 
the Lord and with each other as they face and overcome Clint's 
tragic accident. 

BR-897  Love's Enduring Promise          Oke, Janette 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 2 of 
8 
Marty has remarried and is raising her family on a homestead 
farm. Romance. 

 
BR-918  Love's Long Journey            Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 3 of 
8 
Marty's daughter is grown and moving further west, as a 
pioneer wife. 

 
BR-2894 Loves Me, Loves Me Not       Hicks, Barbara Jean 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Will Bonnie Fairley ever find true love again? Or is her heart too 
broken? 

 
BR-1764 Love's Silent Song             Bacher, June 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Is A Gentle Stranger Series; 
Book 2 of 6 
Pioneer schoolteacher Chris Beth of "Love Is a Gentle 
Stranger" series. Captivating adventures reveal the heartaches 
and joys of real pioneer life. 

 
BR-2515 Love's Soft Whisper            Bacher, June 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 1 of 6 

In just seconds Courtney Glamora's world split in half. Her 
mother was sending her away again, to the Columbia Territory. 
The 16-year-old is caught in the center of a family feud. 

 
BR-1087 Love's Unending Legacy          Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 5 of 
8 
Marty and Clark are back home again adjusting to Clark's 
accident. 

BR-1417 Love's Unfolding Dream          Oke, Janette 



5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Comes Softly Series; Book 6 of 
8 

 
BR-1077 Loving God               Colson, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-490  Loving Promises Especially for You      Rice, Helen 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2023 Loving Who You Are-Where You Are    Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Adult, Poetry 
 
BR-1330 Lovingly                   Rice, Helen 
     2 Volumes; Poetry 
 
BR-460  Lucinda                  Severs, Vesta 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     Courage in days of the Civil War. 
 
BR-1923 Ludwig's Handbook of NT Rulers    Ludwig, Charles 

4 Volumes; Bible Study13-detailed biographies of the men who 
shaped the times of Christ, plus, vivid   essays describing 
ancient cities. 

 
BR-1901 Luke                  Prange, Victor 

6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
Includes the complete text of the Holy Scriptures in the New 
International Version.  The commentary following the Scripture 
sections contains personal applications as well as historical 
background. 

 
BR-2998 Luther                Nohl, Frederick 

4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
     Biography of Martin Luther 
BR-3341 Luther Discovers the Gospel     Saarnivaara, Uuras 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Church History 

New light upon Luther's way from medieval Catholicism to 
evangelical faith. 

 



BR-2638 Macaroni and Cheese, Hot Dogs and Peas 
                       Hickson, Christine 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1798 Made for Each Other            Gesch, Roy 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

A devotional book that provides newly married Christian 
couples with meditations, marriage enrichment. 

 
BR-3549 Maggie's Miracle            Kingsbury, Karen 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Red Gloves Collection; Book 
2 of 4 

 
BR-2008 Magic Bicycle/The              Bibee, John 
     4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series; 
     Book 1 of 7 

The Spirit Flyer, a rusty old bicycle in the dump, surprises its 
new owner, John Kramar, when it magically lives up to its 
name. 

 
BR-1594 Magician's Nephew/The          Lewis, C. S. 
     3 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series; 
     Book 1 of 7 

How Aslan created Narnia and gave the gift of speech. 
 
BR-3017 Maiden of Mayfair/The        Blackwell, Lawana 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Tales of London Series; 
     Book 1 of 1 

Sarah Matthews is moved from an orphanage to be raised in a 
mansion in Mayfair by a supposed stranger.  

 
BR-1805 Make My Life an Alleluia      Stohlmann, Jeanette 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

You will be blessed with the scripture readings and prayers in 
each devotion. 

 
BR-2160 Makeshift Husband/The          Stahl, Hilda 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Series; Book 2 of 3 

Focuses on Diane and Seth's young marriage in a seemingly 
loveless relationship, intertwined with the strain of childbirth and 



suspicions of infidelity. 
 
BR-1567 Making Peace with Your Past     Wright, H. Norman 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author allows a variety of persons with visible differences 
to tell their own stories. Helps people to accept such persons 
and assist them in removing barriers to education, friendship 
and respect. 

 
BR-2887 Making the Play               Jones, Mike 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The story of the man who made the Super Bowl game-winning 
tackle and his inspiring rise to stardom. 

 
BR-2171 Mama Get the Hammer! There's a Fly on Papa's Head 
                        Johnson, Barbara 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Another inspiring, humor filled book of Barbara Johnson. Tells 
how to use humor to conquer the times when pain is the 
overriding consideration--mental or physical. 

 
BR-462  Mama's Way                Bjorn, Thyra 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1079 Man Called Luther/A          Benson, Kathleen 
     2 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1573 Man Called Norman/A           Adkins, Mike 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

When Mike Adkins first met Norman he found him to be a 
strange character, an eccentric. Through the years that 
followed, however, they developed a friendship and God used 
Norman to teach Mike what it means to love. 

 
BR-1638 Man from Shadow Ridge 
                  Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 1 of 
7 
In 1863 Tom Dawson seeks refuge from political and social 
conflicts. He finds peace at Shadow Ridge.  



 
BR-321  Man in Black               Cash, Johnny 
     4 Volumes; Biography 
     Johnny Cash’s own story, in his own words. 
 
BR-2321 Man in the Mirror/The          Morley, Patrick 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Reveals twenty-four secrets of how to live successfully with the 
man in your mirror. Is written for the man grappling with the 
pressures and stress of everyday life. 

 
BR-3330 Man Named Noah/A         Sanders, Karen N. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of the great flood and God's promise. 
 
BR-888  Man of the Desert/The      Hill, Grace Livingston 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 1 of 14 

  
BR-2359 Man of the House/The    Alden, Isabella MacDonald 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Originally published in 1883. To support his widowed mother 
and little sister, young Reuben Stone struggles. 

BR-349  Man Who Moved a Mountain/The    Davids, Richard 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

The story of Bob Childress (a Presbyterian minister, from the 
hills of southeast Virginia) is full of drama. 

 
BR-1713 Man Who Worried/The         Drickamer, John 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Building positive relationships with family, friends, and 
co-workers. 

 
BR-2488 Mandie and Joe's Christmas Surprise 
                      Leppard, Lois Gladys 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series 

Mandie and Joe plan a Christmas skit.  
 
BR-1562 Mandie and the Cherokee Legend     Leppard, Lois 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  



     Book 2 of 21 
A young girl from North Carolina makes a surprising discovery 
with the help of her Indian friends. 

 
BR-1529 Mandie and the Forbidden Attic     Leppard, Lois 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 4 of 21 
 
BR-1906 Mandie and the Foreign Spies      Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 15 of 21 

Mandie, Celia, Mrs. Taft and Senator Morton arrive in London 
with Jonathon, a young stowaway.   

 
BR-1915 Mandie and the Ghost Bandits      Leppard, Lois 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
Book 3 of 21 
A gold shipment, a train wreck on a moonlit night, and a gang of 
robbers disguised as “ghosts.” 

BR-1669 Mandie and the Hidden Treasure      Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 9 of 21 

Mandie and her friends are off searching for an illusive treasure 
hidden somewhere in the past. Threats from an angry man 
make this a challenge you won’t want to miss.  

 
BR-1846 Mandie and the Holiday Surprise      Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 11 of 21 

Mandie is excited to be going home for Christmas holidays. She 
will see all her family and friends. But this time something is 
very different. Could her family be keeping a secret? Is there a 
special present?  

 
BR-1974 Mandie and the Jumping Juniper      Leppard, Lois 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 18 of 21 

Traveling from Switzerland to Germany, Mandie and her friends 
arrive at the medieval stone castle of Baroness Geissler. It's no 
surprise when they discover a mystery.  A very old juniper tree 



that located on the property is said to "jump" sometimes, and no 
one knows why. 

 
BR-1495 Mandie and the Medicine Man       Leppard, Lois 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 6 of 21 
 
BR-1513 Mandie and the Secret Tunnel       Leppard, Lois 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 1 of 21 

The questions and answers in this book are categorized under 
five main headings: Human Relationships, Spiritual Concerns, 
Psychological Problems, Ethical Issues, and Biblical Questions. 

 
BR-2419 Mandie and the Shipboard Mystery     Leppard, Lois 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 14 of 21 

Mandie celebrates her thirteenth birthday with a surprise gift of 
a cruise to Europe. Grandma Taft, Celia, and Mandie are given 
a big send-off. 

 
BR-1914 Mandie and the Silent Catacombs     Leppard, Lois 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 16 of 21 

After leaving Paris, Mandie and her friends are excited about 
seeing the sights of Rome. They have almost forgotten the 
vanishing woman until, without warning, she reappears.  

 
BR-1936 Mandie and the Singing Chalet       Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 17 of 21 

Mandie and her friends are traveling to Switzerland after their 
adventure in Italy. In the ancient chalet where they are staying 
they discover some strange things going on.  

 
BR-1644 Mandie and the Trunk's Secret       Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series; 
     Book 5 of 21 

A set of old letters, hidden diamonds, a dangerous enemy, a 
secret cabin are all important. 



 
BR-1929 Mandie and the Washington Nightmare   Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 12 of 21 

Mandie returns to school after Christmas not knowing whether 
she will be able to accept President McKinley's invitation to the 
White House.  

BR-2012 Mandie and the Windmill's Message     Leppard, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 20 of 21 

Mandie and her friends find a mystery waiting for them in 
Holland. Someone seems to be sending messages by using the 
blades of a big windmill. Could they be out to destroy the royal 
family's reputation? 

 
BR-1516 Mandie and..Charleston Phantom      Leppard, Lois 
     4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Mandie Series;  
     Book 7 of 21 

A trip to a friend's beach house introduces Mandie to what 
seems to be a "phantom" rising into the air.  Mandie learns 
some important lessons about friendship and jealousy. 

 
BR-3553 Mantle/The            Stephens, William H. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Historical fiction based on Biblical story of Elijah and his fight 
against Baalism. 

 
BR-1054 Marcia Schuyler          Hill, Grace Livingston 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 9 of 14 
Marcia is a substitute wife for David and she longs for his love. 

 
BR-465  Marigold             Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1716 Mark                  Wicke, Harold 

6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
The commentary following the Scripture sections contains 
personal applications as well as historical background. 



BR-1718 Mark: Eyewitness             Taylor, Ellen 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The fascinating life story of Mark, the man who saw it all, Jesus 
Christ. 

 
BR-1924 Marks of The Nail/The            Quist, Allen 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

The author presents Christianity's truth-claims and carefully 
looks at its historical evidences. A must reading for Christians 
concerned about attacks against the Bible. 

 
BR-1489 Married Beyond Recognition       Harney, Sylvia 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

A humorous look at marriage. 
 
BR-2241 Marshal Matt and Topsy Turvy Trail    Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Marshal Matt Series 

With the help of his horse, Mister E, Marshal tries to find out 
who is responsible for messing up the tents. 

 
BR-2349 Marshal Matt and-Freezing Fingers    Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Marshal Matt Series 

For ages 4-7. Marshal Matt needs Jesus' help to solve the 
mystery of Janie's missing mittens. 

 
BR-2347 Marshal Matt and-Puzzling Prints     Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Marshal Matt Series 

In attempting to discover who has been leaving trash on the 
ground at the church picnic, Marshal Matt, his horse, and 
Janie's parrot learn something about respect as well. 

 
BR-2348 Marshal Matt and-Secret Code      Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Marshal Matt Series 

For ages 4-7. Matt won't give up until he solves the secret code 
that appears on the banners at booths. 
 

BR-2240 Marshal Matt and-Slippery Snacks    Sanders, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Marshal Matt Series 

Marshal Matt tries to find out who is stealing the snacks at 
Vacation Bible School. 



 
BR-2524 Martin Luther       Baden, Robert/Baden, Marian 

1 Volume; Preteen, Church History 
     Details of Luther's life and the work of the Reformation. 
 
BR-3303 Martin Luther               Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 
 
BR-1094 Martin Luther had a Wife      Peterson, William 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Biography about the marriages of five leaders. 
 

BR-1760 Martin Luther Man of God      Schroeder, Morton 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Biography 

48-vignettes on the life of Dr. Martin Luther. 
 
BR-350  Martin Luther, Hero of the Faith     Nohl, Frederick 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-2422 Martin Luther: Learning for Life     Harron, Marilyn 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Church History 

A book of Luther's perspectives on his own educational 
experience, his theology of education, and his theology. 

 
BR-2178 Martyrs and Missionaries          Trapp, John 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 
     A Bible Study on the book of Acts. 
 
BR-2952 Mary Magdalene's Easter Story      Hartman, Sara 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Mary Magdalene visits the empty tomb. John 20:10-18 for 
children. 

BR-2263 Mary's Christmas Story          Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2493 Mary's Story               Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2116 Master's Plan for Making Disciples/The 
                      Arn, Charles/Arn, Win 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
Every Christian can be an effective witness through an enabling 
church. This book is based on the Biblical principle of growth 
through natural networks of friends and relatives. 

 
BR-2665 Match Made in Heaven/A        MacDonald, Shari 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Salinger Sisters/The;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Lucy sets up one of her customers with a disastrous date. 
 
BR-2531 Matchmakers/The             Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Cynthia loves her widowed father and is thankful for his help 
after the sudden loss of her own spouse.  
 

BR-1624 Maury Had A Little Lamb         Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Primary, Fiction;  

Enjoy the wild and wooly adventures of Maury's little lamb in 
this wonderful story. 

 
BR-3481 Maverick Mania           Brouwer, Sigmund 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series; 
     Book 1 of 6 

The Mavericks are only a few games from the national soccer 
championships but their star player has disappeared. 

BR-1013 May's Boy                Monty, Shirlee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

A foster mother's love for her handicapped son and her faith in 
God for a miracle. 

 
BR-2893 Me and My Big Mouth           Meyer, Joyce 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     Suggestions on how to tame your tongue. 
 
BR-2827 Meal for Many/A             Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of the feeding of the 5,000. 
 
BR-2103 Meaningful Worship           Brauer, James 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 



A short book which shows how our Lutheran liturgy was put 
together from Scripture. 

 
BR-2294 Measure of a Heart/The          Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 6 
of 12 
Anna Trent has a great desire to learn and when Austin Barker 
comes to fill the pastorate he helps her to expand her 
education. 

 
BR-3010 Meditations from a Mother's Heart  
                       Kennedy, Pamela J. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
     Devotions based on women of faith in the Bible 
 
BR-3566 Meditations on Divine Mercy      Gerhard, Johann 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Written by 17th century Lutheran theologian and pastor.  This 
collection of prayers is divided into four parts: Sins, God's Gifts, 
our Needs, our Neighbor's Needs. 

 
BR-2269 Meeting at Midnight/The         Jenkins, Jerry 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 4 of 8 
 
BR-2625 Meeting Place/The     Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Song of Acadia; Book 1 of 5 

Two young women, one British, one French, meet by accident 
in a meadow and become true friends. 

 
BR-3276 Memoirs of Pontius Pilate         Mills, James R. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Thirty years after he sentenced Jesus to die, Pontius Pilate 
reflects on life, politics and religion. 

 
BR-3286 Merry Christmas                Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This special book introduces two to three year olds to our 
Christmas traditions. 

 
BR-2400 Messenger/The             Bunn, T. Davis 



     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
When Ariel gets the assignment to be sent as an undercover 
messenger to Philadelphia, she expects the City of Brotherly 
Love, but instead sees crime, poverty and human indifference. 

 
BR-1519 Messiah/The              Holmes, Marjorie 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Christ's life from the beginning of his ministry to his trial and 
crucifixion.  

 
BR-3029 Midnight Mystery         Mackall, Dandi Daley 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler; Book 4 
of 6 
Having her dad and sister gone on her mother's birthday Winnie 
meets someone else who lost a parent. 

 
BR-2603 Midnight Rescue              Johnson, Lois 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 3 of 6 
In 1857, having arrived in Minnesota Territory on her father's 
steamboat, 12-year-old Libby continues to harbor the runaway 
slave boy Jordan while worrying about a fugitive who has 
escaped from the local prison. 

 
BR-3503 Midnight Sea              Coble, Colleen 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A random shooting leaves Lane Tagama blind. She learns to 
navigate in the world of darkness. She must rely on her faith 
and the prayers of friends to keep her safe from someone who 
thinks she can identify him. 

 
BR-2282 Million Dollar Winner           Gorman, Carol 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; I Witness Series;  
     Book 3 of 4 

When Adam's mom wins the lottery, Adam and his friend 
discover they must forgive those who are jealous of them, just 
as Jesus forgave the people who hurt Him. 

 
BR-1816 Mind Your Tongue           Hulme, William 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 



Failure to use words for communicating feelings accounts for a 
great deal of misunderstanding in families. Using down-to-earth 
language and examples, the author explores such topics as 
listening, anger, conflict. 

 
BR-1421 Minister's Restoration/The      MacDonald, George 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1032 Ministry of Intercession/The      Murray, Andrew 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Prayer is the most dynamic opportunity available to God's 
children. 

BR-1967 Miracle Man...Nolan Ryan  Ryan, Nolan/Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Ryan speaks out on controversial issues. He reveals his views 
on marriage and family, moral values, today's work ethic, 
politics, opponents and teammates. He also shares some of his 
baseball career. 

 
BR-3590 Miracle on Kismet Hill           Lough, Loree 

1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Old Fashioned Christmas/An; Book 2 
of 4 
High on Kismet Hill, Brynee Carter's great-grandfather claimed 
the land that would be Carter Hollow, Virginia. Now as 
Christmas 1865 approaches, Brynne surveys the magnificent 
vista below and wonders about her future, ravaged by the Civil 
War. 

 
BR-2578 Miracles in the Middle 
                 Bimler, Richard/Schroeder, Ted 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This straightforward look at midlife encourages men and those 
who love them. Written clearly and compassionately by men 
who understand the problems of midlife. 
 

BR-2357 Missing on Castaway Island        Biggar, Joan 
4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Megan Parnell Mysteries; 
Book 1 of 4 
Megan Parnell has a new house, new stepfather, and a new 
stepbrother. She is not sure she likes all these changes. But 



she soon becomes involved in adventures that bring her closer 
to her new family and a new friend. 

 
BR-3465 Missing Peace/The          Germany, Rebecca 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Christmas Letters; Book 2 of 4 

Joyce's view of the world changed after being an army nurse in 
1944, and she wants to cut ties with her past. 

BR-2292 Missouri Homestead            Tedrow, T. L. 
3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder 
Series; Book 1 of 8 
It's 1884 and after devastating losses in South Dakota, Laura, 
Manly, and little Rose head East to Missouri. 

 
BR-3594 Mistaken Identity    Van Ryn, Don/Van Ryn, Susie/ 

Cerak, Newell/Cerak, Colleen/Cerak, Whitney 
3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
Mistaken Identity weaves a complex tale of honesty, 
vulnerability, loss, hope, faith, and love in the face of one of the 
strangest twists of circumstances imaginable. 

 
BR-1996  Mists of Danger               Hoff, B. J. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Danni St. John, an undercover journalist, was in grave danger. 
But there was no turning back as she investigated to Colony of 
the Lotus.  

 
BR-2727 Mitford Snowmen/The           Karon, Jan 
     1 Volume 

Everyone in Mitford is filled with the holiday spirit and a snowfall 
brings a snowman building contest. 

 
BR-3559 Moment of Weakness/A       Kingsbury, Karen 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Forever Faithful; Book 2 of 3 

Jade Conner and Tanner Eastman were childhood friends 
separated, only to find each other years later. Then a moment 
of weakness and a decision tear them apart. 

 
BR-3289 Mommy Promises         Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

From tucking them in at night to waving good-bye at the bus 



stop, from teaching them to tie their shoelaces to teaching them 
to lace their fingers in prayer, a mother's love for her child is 
reflected in so many ways. 

BR-2475 Mom's Pregnant             Hoffa, Darlene 
     1 Volume; Primary, Christian Life 
 
BR-3380 Monday Morning Faith          Copeland, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Can librarian Johanna Holland survive as a missionary in the 
jungles of New Guinea? Can this be God's plan or is His plan to 
leave the man she loves and go back to Michigan? 

 
BR-3569 Monday's Child             Chaiken, Linda 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Day to Remember Series; Book 1 of 
5 

  
BR-3027 Moonstruck in Manhattan     Nentwig, Wendy Lee 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Unmistakably Cooper Ellis; 
Book 2 of 3 
Cooper faces more trials with her friends and modeling career. 

 
BR-1942 More Funny Things on the Way to Church 
                  Anderson, Dave/Wilcox, Tim 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

The bulletin proudly presents a glaring blooper, a child shares 
and embarrassing (but innocent) observation with the 
congregation, the pastor flubs a line.   

 
BR-2248 More Stories from Grandma's Attic 
                       Richardson, Arleta 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
2 of 10 
A sequel to Grandma's Attic. Stories told by Grandma of an old 
rag doll that seems to come alive, a newborn goat dancing in 
the farm kitchen and of a faith that gives meaning to life. 

 
BR-1582 More than a Carpenter          McDowell, Josh 
     2 Volumes; Christian Faith 

The author focuses upon the person of Jesus Christ. It is a 
hard-headed book for people who are skeptical about Jesus' 



deity, His resurrection, and His claim on their lives. 
 
BR-3506 More than a Dream         Snelling, Lauraine 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Return to Red River; 
     Book 3 of 3 

Thorliff & Elizabeth have given long-held ambitions to God, and 
everything seems to be falling into place until disasters seem to 
be turning it all into ashes in the wind. 

 
BR-2239 Morning Star               Wells, Marion 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Starlight Trilogy Series; 
     Book 3 of 3 

Jenny must choose between blind religious loyalty and the 
dawning of truth on her life. Through her husband's faithful 
witness, she begins to find her way.  

 
BR-3326 Moses and the Long Walk        Bader, Joanne 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of the journey to the promise land. 
 
BR-1437 Mother of an Army         Ludwig, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Fictionalized biography of Catherine Booth, co-founder of the 
Salvation Army. 

 
BR-1566 Mother's Touch/A              Arndt, Elise 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

As mother-teacher in your home, you prepare your children for 
life. No one can replace your love and care in their early years, 
and no one else can teach them as you can of Jesus' love and 
of His world.  

BR-2017 Mourning into Dancing         Wangerin, Walter 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Deals with death and the emotions involved.  Intertwines the 
stories of his adopted daughter and a black family of his 
congregation and how they dealt with the death of a beloved 
family member. 

 
BR-3076 Mr. Macular Degenerate      Gonzales, Thomas A. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 



The author suffers from macular degeneration and has 
gathered true life, humorous stories from his life. 

 
BR-2792 Muggsy Makes an Assist       Kindig, Tess Eileen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Slam Dunk Series;  
     Book 4 of 8 

Mickey gets a chance to replace an injured teammate as a 
starter. 

 
BR-1860 Murder Behind Bars           Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 3 of 8 

When Margo inherits an estate worth just under a million 
dollars, questions with no answers begin to surface.  

 
BR-2305 Music Box/The              Bunn, T. Davis 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Young widow Angie Picard returns home to teach. Melissa and 
her father move to the town after the death of her mother.  

 
BR-2480 Musical Mystery          Mackall, Dandi Daley 

2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; 
Book; 5 of 8 
The puzzle Club kids get involved in a musical production and 
unexplainable things begin to happen. As they solve the 
mystery they learn to trust in each other and in God. 

BR-1404 Musician's Quest/The       MacDonald, George 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2968 My Bible           Better, Cathy Drinkwater 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

"I love to read my Bible, it shows me how to be." So begins this 
unique book that reveals the word "Bible" letter-by-letter 
through clever cut-outs on every page. 

 
BR-1262 My Bible Story Book           Fletcher, Sarah 
     1 Volume; Children 
     34 stories from the Bible. Written for small children. 
 
BR-1525 My Daily Devotion           Carter, Stephen 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 



A short passage of Scripture, a brief message and a prayer 
help you focus your thoughts of God. 

 
BR-1520 My Father's Child          Elliiot/Tanner, Vicki 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 

Valuable lessons in ministry from the partners of the Apostles. 
Stephen, Barnabas, Mark, James, Titus, Silas, Timothy, Luke, 
Aquilla and Priscilla, Appols, Philip and Demas. 

 
BR-2084 My Father's World     Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 1 of 9 
After her mother perishes in the desert, Corrie Belle Hollister 
brings her two brothers and two sisters to a mining camp during 
the California Gold Rush. 

 
BR-3064 My First Catechism 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Bible Study 

Small Catechism illustrated with pictures and narratives from 
God's Word very well done for primary age. 

BR-2826 My Happy Birthday Book          Truitt, Gloria 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Stories of Exodus 2:1-10, 1 Samuel 1, Luke 2:1-20, and Mark 
10:13-16 for children. 

 
BR-2992 My Happy Easter Book          Truitt, Gloria 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Matthew 27:57--28:10 for children 
 
BR-1463 My Heart Sings              Brown, Joan 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-916  My Life without God          Murray, William 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The son of Madalyn Murray the atheist who sued to have 
mandatory prayer removed from public schools describes his 
early years and how he found Christ at the age of 33. 

 
BR-3350 My Little Easter Book        Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 



 
BR-2989  My Merry Christmas            Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     Luke 2:1-20 for children. 
 
BR-2230 My North Dakota Prairie Childhood  
                       Brauer, Rose Marie 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

The background history and story of a North Dakota child 
growing up in a Lutheran parsonage. 

 
BR-3408 My Savior at My Side       Korthals, Richard G. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Stories, drawn from the author's personal experiences, reflect 
God's presence and power. Find assurance of our Savior's 
love, hope for the future, and strength for life. 

BR-1650 My Sister Katie            Wright, Christine 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Helps children understand more about the abilities and 
difficulties of a blind child.   

 
BR-3001 My True Love Gave to Me     Lynxwiler, Christine 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; All Jingled Out; Book 2 of 2 

Penny's husband wants to do something different at Christmas 
instead of traditional things. 

 
BR-2838 My Turn Bible Stories About ABCs    Fletcher, Sarah 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This series shares the Good News of Jesus Christ, encourages 
an enjoyment of Bible stories, all while reinforcing a variety of 
reading and learning concepts in children ages 2 to 6. 

 
BR-3403 My Turn Bible Stories About Colors    Fletcher, Sarah 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 
     Learn about colors in the story of Jesus' birth. 
 
BR-2689 My Turn Bible Stories About Opposites  Fletcher, Sarah 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2133 My Utmost for His Highest      Chambers, Oswald 



     4 Volumes; Devotion 
     Daily devotions for a year 
 
BR-1504 Mysterious Football Team/The      Jenkins, Jerry 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series 
Follow Dallas and the Baker Street Sports Club as they solve 
another big problem.  What is it about the football? 

 
 
BR-3453 Mysterious Signal            Johnson, Lois 

4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 5 of 6 
Arriving in a strange city, Libby and her friends look for a safe 
house, a station in the Underground Railroad where fugitive 
slaves can hide. But they don't know the area, can they find the 
mysterious signal in time? 

 
BR-2481 Mystery at Camp Galena          Biggar, Joan 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Megan Parnell Mysteries; 
Book 2 of 4 
Join Megan and Peter in the beautiful forests of Washington 
State for an adventure of page-turning excitement. 

 
BR-2941 Mystery of God's Will/The       Swindoll, Charles 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

This is a book about the lifelong journey of getting to know God 
and His will for you, not about easy answers. 

 
BR-2668 Mystery of Great Price       Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
2 of 8 
The children are busy helping prepare for a party to cheer up 
children in the hospital. 

 
BR-1286 Mystery of Mary/The       Hill, Grace Livingston 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

An apparently refined young lady asks for help, then 
disappears.  A novel of mystery and romance. 

 



BR-2147  Mystery of the Double Trouble/The   Murphy, Elspeth 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction 

Tim and his two cousins set out to find the boy who seems to 
be his double and learn the meaning of the commandment 
"Honor your father and your mother." 

BR-2371 Mystery of the Gravestone Riddle    Murphy, Elspeth 
1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 
The Ten Commandments Mysteries.  

 
BR-2115 Mystery of the Second Map      Murphy, Elspeth 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

The suspicions of three cousins about a possible theft at a 
building site lead them to prevent a crime. 

 
BR-2114 Mystery of the Silver Dolphin     Murphy, Elspeth 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Devotion 

Titus and his two cousins set out to prove his innocence in the 
disappearance of a small silver dolphin and experience the 
meaning of the commandment, "You shall not give false 
testimony." 

 
BR-2562 Mystery of the Tattletale Parrot/The  Murphy, Elspeth 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Ten Commandments Mysteries; 
Book 7 of 10 
In solving the mystery of who owns a parrot who has been 
taught to misuse God's name in swearing, three cousins 
uncover a burglary ring and experience the meaning of the 
commandment, "You shall not misuse the Lord’s Name.” 

 
BR-2086 Mystery of the Wild Surfer/The       Roddy, Lee 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ladd family adventure/ A; Book 2 
of 4 
Josh Ladd encounters a series of life-threatening situations 
when he befriends a mysterious young surfer. 

 
BR-3100 Name that Tune            Lehman, Yvonne 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Strings of the Heart;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Eva plays violin in a quartet. She also makes violins. Her 
dreams seem to come true when a famous violinist. 



 
BR-2310 Nana's Gift                Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Fiction 

A string of perfectly formed pearls would take Duncan years to 
save the money required to purchase them. With the passing of 
time, the pearl necklace will take on extraordinary value for the 
last great-granddaughter. 

 
BR-3472 Negotiator/The            Henderson, Dee 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; O'Malley Series; Book 1 of 6 

Kate O'Malley is a hostage negotiator, which can also make her 
a target. She is involved in a case filled with romance and 
suspense and also faith to fill her life. 

 
BR-3401 Neighbor's Fence/The           Sattler, Gail 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Tails of Love; Book 4 of 4 

Fluffy doesn't like Fido, and their owners don't like each other 
either. But one day the pets get lost and their owners must work 
together to find their pets again. 

 
BR-2430 Never Again Good-Bye        Blackstock, Terri 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Second Chance Series;  
     Book 1 of 4 

Wes Grayson would have been attracted to the woman with the 
camera, but she had clearly been stalking Amy, his adoptive 
daughter. Laney Fields had a longing to see the child she'd 
brought into the world six years ago. 

 
BR-1467 Never Miss a Sunset           Gilge, Jeanette 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer; Book 2 of 3 

In the early 1900's thirteen-year-old Ellen, the oldest daughter 
of ten children, struggles with her family through a bitter winter 
on the Northwoods Wisconsin homestead.  

 
 
BR-1808 New Age or Old Lie?          McRoberts, Kerry 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

More than merely an expose of the New Age, this book is a 
defense of the Christian faith. McRoberts urges the church not 
to react with paranoia, but to calmly address the New Age with 



Biblical conviction and wisdom. 
 
BR-2261 New Girl in Town              Baer, Judy 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cedar River Daydream 
Series; Book 1 of 12 
The first in the Cedar River Daydreams Series.  For teen-age 
girls. The book deals with moving into a new town. 

 
BR-2426 New Graft on the Family Tree 
                   Alden, Isabella MacDonald 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Originally published in 1880. Louise loved Lewis and promised 
to help him. 

 
BR-1834 New Kid in Town             Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Homeless and friendless, Fuzzle searches to find his place in 
the forest. But all the other forest dwellers seem to avoid him.  

 
BR-1048 New Life/The             Murray, Andrew 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-1799 New Me/The               Sorenson, Jane 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Katie Hooper Series;  
     Book 7 of 8 

When Katie's friend Sara suggests they should go on a diet 
together, Katie isn't so sure she likes the idea. A diet, a new 
hairstyle, and paying more attention to her clothes was only the 
beginning!  

BR-469  New Moon Rising            Price, Eugenia 
     6 Volumes; Adult; St. Simons Trilogy; Book 2 of 3 
 
BR-1317 New Name/A          Hill, Grace Livingston 
   5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2731 New Song/A                Karon, Jan 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 5 of 9 

Timothy Kavanaugh recently retired from Lord's Chapel but 
takes a vacancy on Whitecap Island. 



 
BR-2959 Nine One One             Kavouras, Dean 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

As a volunteer chaplain for Cleveland Fire and Police 
Department as well as FBI, Cleveland Division, the author 
outlines his ministry to 9/11 victims and families.  

 
BR-1749 Nineteen and Wedding Bells Ahead  

Richardson, Arleta 
2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
7 of 10 
Mabel is engaged to Len Williams and looks forward to a 
peaceful year of teaching. A big storm, a buried will, old rumors 
and new schemes contrive to make Mabel's year anything but 
dull.  

 
BR-353  No Greater Love           Tengbom, Mildred 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

The gripping story of nurse Clara Maass who gave her life to 
yellow fever research. 

 
BR-2179 No Time for Tears             Bacher, June 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Sequel to SONGS IN THE WHIRLWIND. Follows Marvel 
Harrington's life through high school. 

BR-1203 No Wonder They Call Him Savior      Lucado, Max 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
     Vignettes to elicit gratitude, beginning with the Cross. 
 
BR-2027 No Wrinkles on the Soul        Morgan, Richard 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Meditations to use as daily devotions or for small group. 
 
BR-2634 Noah's Ark 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2726 Nora's Ribbon of Memories      Whitson, Stephanie 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Keepsake Legacies;  
     Book 3 of 3 

Nora O'Dell is fifteen when she runs away from home. 



Becoming successful in business she realizes that some gifts 
cannot be bought but are only given through the grace and 
mercy of God. 

 
BR-2182 Normal is Just a Setting on Your Dryer 
                       Clairmont, Patsy 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

What is normal when we try to compare ourselves with others? 
There is no such thing. Normal does not apply to people and 
Patsy Clairmont helps to accept things as they are in life with 
her brand of parable and humor. 

 
BR-3440 Northpointe Chalet        Smith, Debra White 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Austen Series/The;  
     Book 4 of 6 

Texas native Kathy Moore loves her new home in Northpointe, 
Colorado. The 22-year-0ld's bookstore in thriving.  Then one 
dark and stormy night, a kind stranger takes refuge in her store. 
She learns he's Ben Tilman. Suddenly, an old man corners her 
with warnings about the murderous Tilman patriarch. 

BR-1179 Nostalgic Almanac/A            Hong, Edna 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Harry Walton begins work in his first parish. As he wins the 
confidence of his people he also moves into a web of 
entanglements, losing his heart to a woman who is controlled 
by her mother. 

 
BR-1202 Not Alone             Hunt, Keith & Gladys 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Practical guidance on how to form friendships, improve 
communication in marriage, mend relationships. 

 
BR-470  Not My Will              Arnold, Francena 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Eleanor's secret love for Chad could mean losing her 
inheritance and giving up a lifelong dream. Will she follow her 
own will, or make the hard choice to submit her life to Christ's 
leadership. 

 
BR-1265 Not Under the Law        Hill, Grace Livingston 



     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
Will Darcy Sherwood be convicted of a crime he didn't commit?  

 
BR-2937 Note/The             Hunt, Angela Elwell 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of Faith; Book 2 of 8 

When a Pan World plane crashes and burns in Tampa Bay, 
Payton MacGruder, a reporter, tries to find the child of the writer 
of a note that is washed ashore.  
 

BR-1784 Not-So-Great Escape/The   Meyers, Bill/Johnson, Ken 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 3 of 9 

Nicholas plans the "perfect" escape to go to the new horror 
movie with his friends. But his plan backfires and ne and 
McGee learn a valuable lesson about obedience and mental 
pollution.  

BR-3487 Now Picture This             Gunn, Robin 
3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 9 
of 12 
While keeping herself wrapped up in a long distance 
relationship with Paul, Sierra hears a small voice of doubt. Is it 
okay with God for her to ignore her family and friends for the 
sake of that relationship? 

 
BR-3447 Numbers               Rake, Timothy A. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Bible Study on book of Numbers: cycle of repentance & 
forgiveness among God's O.T. people, the means of grace 
through which God grants and sustain's faith, types & 
foreshadowing of Christ. 

 
BR-3097 Obadiah, Jonah and Micah 
             Weidenschilling, J. M./Baker, Robert C. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

God speaks to us through these prophets about the ultimate 
result of unrepentant sin, His love and compassion for all 
people, His faithfulness and His fulfilled prophecies regarding 
Jesus Christ. 

 
BR-3519 Obadiah, Jonah, Micah          Spaude, Cyril 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 



Series 
     Commentary on Old Testament Minor Prophets. 
 
BR-2545 Obedience, Values to Live By       Buerger, Jane 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; Values to Live By; 
     Book 1 of 5 
 
BR-2760 October Song             Lewis, Beverly 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Stories of the continuing lives of the Lancaster County Amish 
people whose stories are interconnected. 

BR-2435 Of Spies and Spider Webs     Mackall, Dandi Daley 
2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries; Book 5 
of 8 
For ages 6-9. After Sam joins the cast of the Cinnamon Lakers' 
play, scripts disappear, sets collapse, and other disasters 
threaten to destroy their plans while Molly hopes to make Sam 
understand why Jesus is special. 

 
BR-3009 Off the Edge             Francisco, Adam 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Faith on the Edge Series 

The relationship between faith, science and our future as a 
space-faring people. Looks at creation, the end of the universe 
and possibility of life on other planets. 

 
BR-3288 Oh Holy Night              Harrast, Tracy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

God so loved the world that He sent His only Son.  
 
BR-3082 Old Maid's Choice          Hake, Cathy Marie 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Sewing Circle Book;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Betsy thinks she is destined to be an old maid. But blacksmith 
Tyson tries to convince her different. 

 
BR-2129 Older, Wiser, and Better...      Lockerbie, Jeanette 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 

Retirement years are great opportunity years. You can activate 
your skills and put many life-long dreams into action.  

 



BR-1599 On Eagles' Wings            Gorsuch, Geoff 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

As a reconnaissance jet pilot in Vietnam, the author witnesses 
horrors that took him far beyond the breaking point of his 
Christian faith. On Eagles Wings chronicles Geoff's struggle to 
reconcile his faith. 

 
BR-3397 On the Homefront            Cassel, Katrina 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Looks at various types of families, parents and siblings that 
exist today and God's plans for them.  

 
BR-2184 On the Trail of the Truth 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 3 of 9 
Corrie Belle Hollister longs to be a journalist, to serve God with 
her writing, and become a woman of the truth.  

 
BR-1545 On the Waters of the World       Flood, Robert 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

Behind the genius of Correct Craft, America's oldest 
family-owned boat building firm, lies the inspiring story of the 
Meloon family and their commitment to honor God in their 
business decisions. 

 
BR-3497 On this Day              Carlson, Melody 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Drawn to Lakeside Inn for a wedding, five different women 
seem to share little more than joy for the couple. 

 
BR-471 Once Upon a Christmas Time         Bjorn, Thyra 
    1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

A lovely story of childhood memories of the Christmas season as 
celebrated in Sweden. 

 
BR-1272 Once Upon a Summer           Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Season of the Heart Series Book 1 of 
4 
12 year-old Josh and his young aunt Lou must both make 



choices that would change their lives. 
 
BR-2942 Once Upon a Tree            Miller, Calvin 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

The Cross. 
 
BR-2601 One Cup of Water            Brauer, Janice 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A story of women missionaries who made a difference, one 
person at a time, as they followed Jesus' command. 
 

BR-1455 One Holy Passion             Sproul, R. C. 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2874 One Incarnate Truth         Siemon-Netto, Uwe 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Essays that relate "the truth of the Gospel" to a postmodern 
world. Explore its impact on Christian theology and spirituality 
and propose creative ways to share the Gospel. 

 
BR-3601 One Perfect Gift            Morgan, Kathleen 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jessica Ashmare leaves Baltimore for a nursing job in 
Colorado. But when that fall through she finds herself in a 
temporary position with a rancher and his non-too-happy son. 

 
BR-2653 One Shenandoah Winter         Bunn, T. Davis 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of Christian people who are protective of their own. 
 
BR-2216 One Size Fits All and Other Fables   Higgs, Liz Curtis 
     9 Volumes; Preteen, Christian Life 

The author has been a large woman most of her life. She uses 
humor to look at how we view ourselves and how others view 
us when we don't quite fit the perfect size. 

BR-2382 One Small Miracle            Wubbels, Lance 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction  

A teacher finds that showing love and patience to a group of 
special students gives her as much of a reward as it does the 
class when they accomplish their goals. 



 
BR-3075 One Wintry Night            Griffin, Pamela 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Christmas/A 

Ivy's mother marries and relocates from Boston to a small 
Nebraska town. But Ivy would do anything to return. 

 
BR-2358 Only Angels Can Wing It        Higgs, Liz Curtis 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Liz Higgs' humorous and practical re-examination of the many 
qualities of the "virtuous woman" from Proverbs. 

 
BR-1957 Only Game in Town/The           Bibee, John 

7 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series; Book 3 of 
7 
Daniel, a new boy in Centerville, struggles over whether to join 
the evil but tempting Cobra Club or align himself with the 
children who ride the Spirit Flyer bicycles. 

 
BR-2831 Only God Would've Planned It That Way!   
                         Barness, Todd 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

How would you have welcomed the King of kings? With a 
parade, a party, or fireworks? This book walks through Holy 
Week in new fashion.  

 
BR-2763 Only the Best              Lewis, Beverly 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Girls Only; Book 2 of 4 

Jenna Song has given all she has to gymnastics. When her 
parents adopt a Korean baby she fears it will change her life as 
well as her chance at a gymnastic meet. 
 

BR-2442 Only the River Runs Free 
                  Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Galway Chronicles Series; Book 1 
of 3 
Set in 1840 era, this story shows the roots of the troubles that 
brought so many Irish to America's shores, and which continue 
to plague England and Ireland today. 

 
BR-3448 Only You, Sierra              Gunn, Robin 



4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 1 
of 12 
When her family moves to another state, Sierra dreads going to 
a new high school until she meets Paul. 

 
BR-3581 Opal                Snelling, Lauraine 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakota Treasures;  
     Book 3 of 4 
   
BR-2220 Other People My Age are Already Grown Up 
                        Schimmels, Cliff 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A series of short essays filled with good sense and humor 
about everyday life. 

 
BR-1521 Other Twelve/The             Flynn Leslie 
     4 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1985 Out of His Heart            Patterson, Ward 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Creative Praise Series 

Reflects the truth and mystery of our Creator through the 
centuries and focuses the reader's emotions in praise and 
thanksgiving, petition and conversation. A personal adventure 
in creative worship.  Psalms 51-100. 
 

 
BR-2361 Out of the Bleachers and Onto the Field 
                         Gibson, Michael 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

How to witness without hang-ups. How to build loving 
relationships with non-Christians. 

 
BR-1926 Out of the Blue             Hershiser, Orel 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

This record-setting pitcher for the World Champion L.A. 
Dodgers professional baseball team, has one commitment in 
his life, as well as in sports, to do his best.   

 
BR-3070 Out of the Red Shadow         de Graaf, Anne 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



Pieter Piekaz is a leader of Solidarity against Stalinism and is 
jailed. His young nephew Tomasz is drawn by Western 
materialism. Will a family's heritage of faith and love be enough 
to heal the scars? 

 
BR-472  Out on the Mountains           Rowley, Harold 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 
     The story of shepherds and lost sheep. 
 
BR-2674 Out to Canaan                Karon, Jan 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 4 of 9 

Father Tim thinks about retiring. Several townspeople are 
struggling with personal problems. A mayoral candidate wants 
Mitford to develop. Is a change in the future? 
 

BR-355  P.S. I Love You                 Mall, E. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

5 children in 30 months, all adopted, make this one of the most 
heart-warming stories of family love. 

BR-2094 Pack Up Your Gloomees in a Great Big Box 
                        Johnson, Barbara 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Barbara Johnson helps you learn not only to endure life, but to 
enjoy it. Tells the story of her life through many trials and how 
her Spatula Ministries developed, which now helps many 
parents cope with problems of children. 

 
BR-473  Papa's Daughter              Bjorn, Thyra 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The pastor's daughter comes of age in an unforgettable story 
brimming with love and laughter. 

 
BR-474  Papa's Wife                Bjorn, Thyra 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The young servant girl, Maria, captures the heart of the 
reluctant bachelor minister and raise a family of eight. 

 
BR-3300 Paper Moon               Windsor, Linda 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Moonstruck Series 



Caroline Spencer, a hilarious single mom chaperones a 
boisterous bunch of teenagers to Mexico. A story where kids 
will be kids, crooks will be crooks and love trumps all. 

 
BR-3373 Parable of the Talents/The       Dreyer, Nicole E. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book 
     Matthew 25:14-30 for children 
 
BR-1540 Parenting isn’t for Cowards       Dobson, James 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

This book deals confidently with the frustrations of child-rearing. 
Gives specific advice to parents on subjects of greatest 
concern. Gives encouragement to parents raising children in a 
shock-wave world. 

 
BR-1600 Partners             Hill, Grace Livingston 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Collector's Choice Series; 
     Book 3 of 4 

A lonely young woman and a lonely journalist discover love 
when they fight for the life of an abandoned baby. 

 
BR-2930 Pastor Jenkins said "Hang on to Matthew 6:33" 
                         King, Robert H. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Dr. Robert and Jean King share how God has used them and 
their many gifts in His service. 

 
BR-1482 Pastors' Barracks/The           Wise, Robert 
     4 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-475  Patch of Blue/The         Hill, Grace Livingston 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3293 Patience, Kindness, Goodness       Burgland, Lane 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Fruit of the Spirit;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Helps understand the Holy Spirit's work of sanctification, 
recognize personal strengths and weaknesses in view of God's 
calling, identify ways to bear fruit in the Lord's service. 

 



BR-1660 Patricia              Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
     The love story of a wealthy girl and a humble man. 
 
BR-2720 Payne Stewart      Stewart, Tracey/Abraham, Ken 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The biography of professional golfer Payne Stewart, his game, 
his family and his faith. 

 
 
BR-1441 Peace Child               Richardson, Don 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

An unforgettable story of primitive jungle treachery in a gripping 
first-hand account of how Jesus, God's "peace child", changed 
the Sawi, a headhunting cannibalistic tribe of New Guinea, into 
a peace loving people. 

 
BR-1292 Peace with God              Graham, Billy 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Describes the way to the "peace that passes all understanding."  
Deals with assessing the situation. 

 
BR-1875 Peanut Butter and Jelly Secrets     Levene, Nancy 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Alex Series (The)  
      Book 4 of 5 

After spending her school lunch money at a carnival and trying 
to hide the fact that she is skipping lunch every day, Alex 
decides that disobeying her parents causes too many 
problems. 

 
BR-2946 Peanut Butter Promises          Currie, Robin 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Devotion 

Stories with prayers, activities, and questions to help 
preschoolers remember Bible stories. 
 

BR-327  Pearls for a King         Scharlemann, Dorothy 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     6 short stories inspired by Bible characters. 
 
BR-1611 Peasant Girl's Dream/The      MacDonald, George 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
Readers will be delighted by this strong yet tranquil narrative 
woven around the harsh climate of the highlands and the tender 
bonds of love developed among the Scottish peasants. 

 
BR-2346 Penny Whistle/The              Hoff, B. J. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Two young friends plan to give a gift that may save a life. A 
one-room schoolhouse provides the setting. 

 
BR-1842 Pentecost or Pretense?         Clement, Arthur 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

An examination of the Pentecostal and Charismatic 
movements. 

 
BR-2885 Perfect Match/A             Lewis, Beverly 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Girls Only; Book 3 of 4 

Heather Bock and her brother Kevin are a great ice dancing 
duo, but Heather dreams of going solo. 

 
BR-2686  Perfect Wife/The           MacDonald, Shari 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Salinger Sisters/The;  
     Book 3 of 3 

Felicia is struggling to rebuild her and her children's lives after 
divorce, juggling child care, housework and a new career.  
 

BR-2425 Perilous Bargain/A             Peart, Janet 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Oriel Banning is compelled to agree to a strange bargain and 
must travel from England to Ireland. 

 
BR-3607 Persecution              Limbaugh, David 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 
     How liberals are waging war against Christianity. 
 
BR-1908 Personal Touch/The    Crabb, Rachael/Hart, Raeann 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Mrs. Crabb provides practical insights on genuine hospitality. 
The "key," she says, "is to focus on people, not preparations."   

BR-328  Peter, Life and Letters        Dallmann, William 



     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-2980 Peter's Easter Story          Dreyer, Nicole E. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Luke 5:1-11; 12:12 other Gospels. The story of Peter receiving 
forgiveness from the Risen Savior. 

 
BR-2981 Philip and the Ethiopian    Jander, Martha Streufert 

1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books; Acts 8:26-40 for 
children 

     Philip instructs and baptizes the Ethiopian traveler. 
 
BR-1830 Philippians, Colossians, Philemon    Kuschel, Harlyn 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
Includes the text of New International Version.  Contains 
personal applications as well as historical background. 

 
BR-524  Picked on Pat             Renken, Aleda 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Haley Adventure Book/A  
                       
BR-1634 Piercing the Darkness          Peretti, Frank 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Peretti Series; Book 1 of 2 

Sally Beth Roe, a young loner, finds herself caught in the 
middle of bizarre events, fleeing for her life while trying to recall 
her dark past.  Her journey is a penetrating portrayal of our 
times, a reflection of our wanderings. 

 
BR-1554 Pizza for Everyone          McDowell, J. & D. 
     1 Volume; Children 

Every day young people make tough decisions. Will you cheat 
on a test? Will you take a dare you know is wrong?  Will you 
follow God Even if others laugh at you? Stories about kids who 
make hard decisions.  

BR-2810 Place Called Bliss/A            Glover, Ruth 
6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saskatchewan Saga Series; Book 1 
of 5 
Two women leave homes in Scotland for new lives in 
Saskatchewan, one to gain freedom and one to bear an heir for 
the family name. But there is an unknown secret that ties them 



together for the rest of their lives. 
 
BR-2332 Place Called Home/A             Wick, Lori 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Place Called Home Series; Book 1 of 
4 
Christine Bennett is alone after the death of her only living 
relative, her grandfather. She receives a note saying she is in 
danger and must leave town. Christine moves and begins a 
new life. 

 
BR-2209 Place in the Sun/A    Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 4 of 9 
Corrie Belle Hollister came to California a young, frightened girl 
and is now a grown woman with a loving family. But with trouble 
in Miracle Springs and within the Hollister-Belle clan, Corrie 
faces the reality that God works. 

 
BR-2702 Place to Come Home to/A       Carlson, Melody 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Whispering Pines Series; 
     Book 1 of 4 

Maggie Carpenter leaves Los Angeles to take a job at the small 
town Pine Mountain, Oregon newspaper. A tender tale of 
intrigue, inspiration, and faith renewed. 

 
BR-1912 Place to Rest Your Heart/A       Streufert, Donna 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Four women with four different journeys.  Each woman is 
unique and yet they all find strength.  

BR-2813 Playing God               Weise, Robert 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Faith on the Edge Series 

Explores the ethics of "perfecting" humanity through DNA, 
cloning and more. Explores the benefits and dangers. 

 
BR-1787 Playing with Fire    Weldon, John/Bjornstad, James 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 

What are fantasy games? Are they good? Are they evil? This 
book teaches how they are played, the benefits and hazards 
and the possible effects on the players. 

 



BR-408  Please Get off the Seesaw Slowly   Williamson, Norma 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2572 Point of No Return           McCusker, Paul 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 8 of 12 
Jimmy discovers that standing up for what you believe in can 
be costly but also rewarding. 

 
BR-2670 Poison-pen Mystery        Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
4 of 8 
Join the Puzzle Club on a mission to save the city's centennial 
celebration. 

 
BR-477  Pontius Pilate               Maier, Paul 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2761 Poppy                 Larriva, Barbara 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Allegra Alexander had it all until her husband was killed and her 
broken heart caused her to lose her son. Now elderly and in the 
hospital, 9-year-old Poppy comes into her life to bring sunshine. 

BR-2167 Portal/The                  Myers, Bill 
4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Journeys to Fayrah Series;  Book 
1 of 5 
With Denise's gift to Nathan of a strange red stone, an 
adventure to another dimension begins, culminating in Nathan's 
perilous entrapment, due to his own selfishness, and with 
parallels to Christian beliefs overall. 

 
BR-3069 Portrait of Paul/A           Valleskey, David 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Explores Paul's life and mission work and applies his 
missionary methods to present-day churches. 

 
BR-2571 Postcard/The              Lewis, Beverly 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Amish Country Crossroads; Book 1 
of 3 
When tragedy enters her life, Rachel withdraws into a shell that 



is cracked open when an ancient postcard sent by her 
great-uncle to his beloved reveals what life is all about. 

 
BR-1706 Power of Affirming Touch/The    Grant, Dr. Wilson 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Dr. Ross says the secret to the growing of a child is in the 
knowing of the child. Becoming fully aware of his personality is 
the most crucial thing you can do in helping him develop into a 
strong adult.  

 
BR-1188 Power of Encouragement/The     Doering, Jeanne 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Encouragement means caring for one another and being 
concerned with others' welfare.  

 
BR-1316 Practice of the Presence of God/The    Blaiklock, E. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2693 Prairie Fire             Palmer, Catherine 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Town Called Hope; 
     Book 2 of 3 

Jack Cornwall has lost everything and moves to Hope to be 
near Caitrin, whom he hopes to build a new dream. 

 
BR-2629 Prairie Rose             Palmer, Catherine 

7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Town Called Hope;  
     Book 1 of 3 

Rosie Mills and Seth Hunter both have unhappy pasts. They fall 
in love and try to build a family. 

 
BR-2751 Prairie Storm            Palmer, Catherine 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Town Called Hope; 
     Book 3 of 3 

Two people are forced to put away their differences when a 
helpless infant needs their care. 

 
BR-2143 Pray, Christian, Pray         Clement, Arthur 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

An in-depth look at prayer and the prayer life of the Christian. 
How to pray, when to pray, what to pray for. 



 
BR-386 Pray, Praise and Hooray         Bimler, Richard 

2 Volumes; Devotion 
     Prayers for youth and other people. 
 
BR-3419 Prayer - We Speak to God       Kleinig, John W. 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Spirituality Series/The 
Secret vocation, intercession of Jesus, the gift of prayer. 

 
BR-2722 Prayers Written at Vailima   Stevenson, Robert Louis 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 

Prayers written by Stevenson and compiled by his widow, 
Fanny Osborne. 

BR-535  Preacher Had Ten Kids/The      Bradsher, Frances 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Marvel as a pastor and his wife raise ten children under 
financial conditions of the 1800's and see that life is more than 
struggling for money and worldly success. 

 
BR-1505 Predators in Our Pulpits        Keller, W.  Phillip 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Keller presses every Christian layperson. 
 
BR-3333 Predestination            Manteufel, Thomas 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Difference Series 
Shows what Lutherans believe and how their beliefs differ from 
other religions on the topic of Predestination. 

 
BR-1583 Preparing for Adolescence        Dobson, James 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Straight talk to teens and their parents about adolescence. Dr. 
Dobson speaks frankly and openly about inferiority feelings, 
conformity, and peer pressure, physical changes, love, and the 
search for identity. 

 
BR-2159 Preparing for Retirement         Burkett, Larry 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Deals with subjects one must face as he comes to grips with 
the financial aspects of retirement in the '90s. What to look for 
in Social Security payments, nursing homes, medical care, a 



retiree's budget. 
 
BR-1948 Presence/The              Bunn, T. Davis 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

T. J. Case, a lawyer and politician of integrity is propelled into 
the middle of the big-time politics in Washington, D.C.  Can he 
make a difference with a group of big-city politicians and a 
sinister underworld of corruption? 

BR-3042 Presidential Mystery/The      Mackall, Dandi Daley 
1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries; Book 8 
of 8 
During the excitement of the school's mock election, Molly tries 
to discover who is framing her. 

 
BR-2106 Pressed DownbBut Not Forgotten 
                   Lyon, H. Curtis/Juern, John 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Dealing with depression, what it is, what causes it, the spiritual 
roots of depression, and the spiritual answers to treatment. Plus 
Bible studies for dealing with depression. 

 
BR-2443 Presumption of Guilt          Blackstock, Terri 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sun Coast Chronicles Series; Book 
4 of 4 
Beth Wright is a reporter on the trail of a story that could 
expose something ugly at the Children's Home. Someone else 
is on her trail, determined to keep her from breaking the story. 

 
BR-2456 Pretense                  Wick, Lori 
     27 Volumes; Fiction 

A story of the tender bond of sisterhood and god's promise of 
redemption for all who seek Him. 

 
BR-2960 Priest/The               Rivers, Francine 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sons of Encouragement; 
     Book 1 of 5 

Story of Aaron, the first high priest, and his relationship to 
Moses and the people of Israel. 

 
BR-1191 Prime Rib and Apple            Briscoe, Jill 



     2 Volumes; Christian Life; Stories of women of the Bible. 
 
 
BR-2003 Prince Caspian               Lewis, C. S. 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Chronicles of Narnia Series; 
Book 4 of 7 
How good Prince Caspian and his army of Talking Beasts. 

 
BR-1352 Priscilla and Aquila  Henderson, Lois/Smith, Harold Ivan 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Story of the first Christian converts in Rome. 
 
BR-325  Prison Letters            Ten Boom, Corrie 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

The letters written by and to Corrie while interred at a Nazi 
prison camp. 

 
BR-2559 Private Justice             Blackstock, Terri 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Newpointe 911 Series;  
     Book 1 of 5 

Several wives of the town's firemen have been murdered. 
Mark's wife may be the next. 

 
BR-1411 Problem of Pain/The            Lewis, C. S. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 
 
BR-1385 Prodigal Apprentice/The       MacDonald, George 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1609 Prodigal Cat/The              Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction 

The delightful story of the misadventures of a prodigal cat.  
 
BR-2107 Prodigals and Those Who Love Them   Graham, Ruth 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The worry Mrs. Graham experienced while her two sons were 
prodigals. A variety of prodigals are introduced, as well as how 
family members responded. 

BR-2514 Promise for Breanna/A             Lacy, Al 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Angel of Mercy Series;  



     Book 1 of 10 
Breanna Baylor is a certified medical nurse who travels the 
West helping where needed. She is trying to escape the past of 
being jilted by her fiancé, who destroyed her trust for all men. 

 
BR-3585 Promise for Spring/A        Sawyer, Kim Vogel 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Begging England born Emmaline Bradford to give prairie life a 
try, Geoffrey Garrett offers a compromise: if she stays till 
spring, he'll pay her way back if she decides she wants to go 
back. 

 
BR-2673 Promise Me Tomorrow            Wick, Lori 

9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Memories Series; 
Book 4 of 4 
Rusty works with the orphanage until a widower offers her a 
position as companion to his son. 

 
BR-3469 Promise Unbroken/A              Lacy, Al 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Battles of Destiny Series; Book 3 of 6 
Two couples battling jealousy and hatred amidst a war that 
would cripple America. 

 
BR-3445 Promised to Me           Hatcher, Robin Lee 

        6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Coming to America Series;    
 Book 4 of 4 

This book is book four in the Coming to American Series about 
women who come to America to start new lives. Set in the 
1800s and early 1900s, these novels craft intense chemistry 
and conflict between the characters. 
 

 
BR-2608 Prophet                 Peretti, Frank 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A prophetic tale that tells of the struggle over which vision of 
moral authority will define our nation. 

 
BR-2883 Proposal/The                Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; English Garden Series;  
     Book 1 of 4 



1810 - William Jennings has never known the love and 
companionship of marriage, but becomes ward of three small 
children who turn his world upside down. 

 
BR-1152 Proverbs 31 Lady/The          Drake, Marsha 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

The story of a captive housewife.   
 
BR-422  Proverbs for Today          Coates, Thomas 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

The wisdom contained in these God-inspired words is 
applicable to every phase of life and living. 

 
BR-2131 Psalm 23: The Song of a Passionate Heart 
                         Roper, Davis 
     1 Volume; Devotion 

Roper looks at this restful Christian psalm from the perspective 
of the 20th Century. 

 
BR-423  Psalms for Today           Coates, Thomas 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-1677 Psalms I                  Brug, John 

6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
The commentary following the Scripture sections contains 
personal applications as well as historical background and 
explanations. 

 
BR-1754 Psalms II                 Brug, John 

6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
This volume includes the text for Psalms 73-150 from the New 
International Version. The commentary following the scripture 
sections contains personal applications as well as historical 
background and explanations. 

 
BR-1783 Purple Door/The             DeVos, Janifer 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Guardian Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 



When she accidently falls through the door of an antiques shop, 
Erin embarks on an adventure which tests her. 

 
BR-1403 Pursuit of Holiness            Bridges, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-2950 Pursuit/The                 Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; English Garden Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Edward Steele heads back to England, but promises to help 
two fellow travelers. When they encounter trouble he keeps his 
word but could never foresee the changes.  

 
BR-1299 Putting Away Childish Things     Seamands, David 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2790 Puzzle Club Meets the Jigsaw Kids/The 
                      Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Puzzle Club Mysteries Series; Book 
6 of 8 
A thief is in town. Another detective team is also in town. Who 
will solve the mystery? 

BR-2132 Quality of Mercy/The          Morris, Gilbert 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Danielle Ross Mystery Series; Book 
5 of 6 
Successful sleuth Dani Ross faces her most harrowing 
challenge ever when Tommy Cain, an embittered parolee 
threatens revenge against the Ross family.   

 
BR-1364 Queen of the Reformation       Ludwig, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Accurate in historical setting, a significant biography of 
Katherine Luther. 

 
BR-3565 Queen's Smuggler/The 
                  Jackson, Dave/Jackson, Neta 
     1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction 

Sarah tries to smuggle a New Testament into England in order 
to save the life of William Tyndale. 

 



BR-1512 Quest for Character          Swindoll, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Forty devotional readings on subjects of honesty, purity, 
courage, conviction, compromise, sincerity. 

 
BR-2458 Quest for Love             Elliot, Elisabeth 
     8 Volumes; Christian Life 

Bring your love life under the authority of Jesus Christ. Elliot 
dusts off concepts such as commitment, integrity, honor, and 
servanthood, and then applies them to dating and singleness 
today. 

 
BR-1210 Questions Christian Women Ask 
                    Carmichael, Bill & Nancie 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Guidance from a Biblical perspective, gives steps to solving 
problems, and adds resources for additional help. 

 
BR-3301 Quiet         Borst, Steven B./Borst, Katharine 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography; Heroes of the Faith;  
     Book 5 of 8 

Highlights stories of Hannah, widow of Zarephath, Naaman and 
the Young Girl, Zacchaeus, Dorcas and John. 

 
BR-1939 Quiet Heart/The              Bacher, June 
     8 Volumes; Devotion 

The author brings uplifting and loving inspiration to help you 
quiet your heart before the Lord. 

 
BR-2745 Quiet Strength/A             Oke, Janette 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Legacy Series;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Virginia Simpson learns that when God allows something to be 
taken from you, He replaces it with something. 

 
BR-2452 Quiet Thunder                 Lacy, Al 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 6 of 7 
Quiet Thunder and Thane Tyler were born on the same day 
with the help of the Stranger. Their lifelong friendship is put to 



the test when they meet with guns.  
 
BR-2944 Quiet Times with Jesus     Loontjer, Jacqueline L. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Devotion 

Sometimes humorous, always practical, this collection of 52 
devotions helps see God at work right in the classroom. Applies 
God's Word to classroom experiences. 

 
BR-1990 Quilt/The                Bunn, T. Davis 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

Mary starts a quilt but will only let others help is each stitch is 
sewn with prayers of thankfulness. Those involved in the 
project find they will never be the same. 

BR-2381 Race for Freedom             Johnson, Lois 
7 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 2 of 6 
In 1857, while helping to conceal a runaway slave on her 
father's steamboat, 12-year-old Libby looks to God for  support 
and hopes her friend Caleb will let her join the Underground 
Railroad. 
 

BR-481  Rainbow Garden            St. John, Patricia 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction 

For 9-12 year olds. When Elaine leaves her home in London to 
stay with the Owen family in Wales, she feels miserable and left 
out. It's only the little secret garden that she finds at the end of 
the rainbow. 

 
BR-2605 Rainbow of Saris/A       Brauer, Janice (Editor) 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This book tells four stories of women missionaries in India and 
the lives they touched through their dedication. 

 
BR-1433 Rainy Day Rescue            Davoll, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-3542 Ransom of Love          Lacy, Al/Lacy, Joanna 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mail Order Bride Series;  
     Book 5 of 5 
 



BR-3019 Ransomed Bride               Peart, Jane 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of Montclair;  
     Book 2 of 4 

The story of the seemingly impossible love of Lorabeth 
Whitaker for her first cousin Cameron Montrose, taking many 
an unexpected turn that eventually leads to happiness. 

 
BR-2685 Reach for the Stars           Lewis, Beverly 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Girls Only; Book 4 of 4 

Miranda Garcia hopes to win the Dressel Hills Downhill Classic. 
Her ski instructor breaks a leg and Miranda has to take over her 
classes, take care of her mother and keep up with school. How 
does she cope? 

 
BR-903  Reaching Out with Love         Campbell, Jean 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A public school English teacher's Christian commitment goes 
beyond the classroom. 

 
BR-1267 Reaching Your Full Potential      Furman, Richard 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Offers assistance in establishing goals and in feeling more 
confident and adventurous in pursuing them. 

 
BR-1651 Read Me a Bible Story        Friedrich, Elizabeth 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-3595 Reading the Psalms with Luther 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

The Psalms, each with a short introduction by Luther and 
concluding after each with a prayer. 

 
BR-3527 Ready to Wed              Carlson, Melody 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Tales from Grace Chapel Inn Book 4 
of 47 
Visitor Belle from Georgia arrives at the Inn proclaiming that 
God has sent her to Acorn Hill to find the man she is to marry. 
Jane and her sisters teeter between disbelief and awe as Belle 
sets off to meet all the eligible bachelors in beautiful Cascade 
Mountains. Then Jane gets a letter from Justin, her 



ex-husband, asking if he can visit. What could he want after all 
this time? 

 
BR-2272 Real Men Pray             Couser, Thomas 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Short prayers to help focus your thoughts and bring your needs 
to God in regard to work, success, temptation. 

 
BR-2839 Real Night before Christmas/The     Anders, Isabel 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Wonderful things took place on the night before Christmas. 
Discover the special Christmas gift you received. 

 
BR-3376 Real Story of the Creation/The        Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

Maier explains Biblical creation in a unique way. The real story 
of our perfectly designed, balanced world. 

 
BR-1621 Reason for Joy/A           Thigpen, Thomas 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Learn how to experience the refreshing river of joy that flows 
within you by coming to know God as its source. 

 
BR-2168 Reasoning from the Scriptures       Rhodes, Ron 
     15 Volumes; Bible Study 

Covers point by point what the Jehovah's Witnesses believe 
and how to refute those beliefs from the Bible. Uses quotes 
from the Scriptures side-by-side with quotes from Jehovah's 
Witness writings. 

 
BR-1508 Reasons Skeptics Consider Christ 
                  McDowell, Josh/Steward, Don 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 

An invaluable guide and resource tool one can use in tackling 
the tough questions skeptics often ask Christians. 

 
BR-2606 Reckoning/The                            Lewis, Beverly 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heritage of Lancaster County; Book 
3 of 3 
Katherine is living the life she has always dreamed of, yet her 



Amish roots are calling her home. 
 
BR-2245 Red as in Russia & Measles & Love    Niedfeldt, Linda 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The story of a Russian family in 1927 who seek escape from 
religious persecution. 

 
BR-2648 Red Bird              Whitson, Stephanie 

7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Prairie Winds-Whitson; Book 3 
of 3 
A white woman and a Lakota Sioux man discover that God 
often makes His children give up their own plans. 

 
BR-3367 Red Card       Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game On - 2 Timothy 1:7 

Paul and Andy Stewart are twins on the same soccer team, but 
sibling rivalry causes problems. Athletes explore the impact of 
Christian principles and character. 

 
BR-2213 Red Geranium/The            Oke, Janette 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

Great-grandson Tommy loves Gran Thomas too much to allow 
the inner light to go out in her life.  

 
BR-806  Red Signal/The          Hill, Grace Livingston 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2712 Redeeming Love            Rivers, Francine 
     14 Volumes; Adult, Fiction  

A retelling of the Book of Hosea. Angel is sold into prostitution 
as a child and meets a man who is called by God. 

BR-2618 Redheaded Orphan              Travis, L. 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ben and Zack Series 

Ben misses his friend Zack when his family moves away, but 
Ben finds a new friend in an orphan. 

 
BR-2896 Reggie White in the Trenches 
                   White, Reggie/Denney, Jim 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

The life of Reggie White a football star, minister and 



peacemaker. 
 
BR-2153 Reluctant Bridegroom/The        Morris, Gilbert 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 7 of 
13 
Sky Winslow, son of Chris and Dove, agrees to return East and 
bring a wagon train of brides to the men of Oregon City. On the 
long trip two of the women make an impact on Sky. 

 
BR-3535 Reluctant Fugitive/The         Mindrup, Darlene 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Roses Book; Book 3 of 4 
 
BR-3443 Remnants of Faith           DeMarco, Renee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Patchwork Christmas;  
     Book 1 of 2 

A retired schoolteacher leaves a patchwork quilt to two former 
students. Each has it for one year. 

 
BR-1966 Reno                  Morris, Gilbert 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Reno Western Saga Series; Book 1 
of 4 
The Carrs of Skull Ranch control the Valley and dominate the 
farmers there. Jim Reno wants no part of the farmers lost 
cause.  

 
 
BR-2943 Rescue/The                 Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; English Garden Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 

When Anne Gardiner slips from a ladder into the arms of 
Robert Weston, her deranged father demands they be married. 
A tender story of God's amazing love and kindness toward His 
own. 

 
BR-3500 Rescuer/The              Henderson, Dee 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; O'Malley Series; Book 6 of 6 
 
BR-2767 Rest Stop              Klawiter, James F. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A collection of 80 light-hearted devotions which offers a 



contemporary look at God's love for us through Jesus. 
 
BR-2519 Return to Harmony     Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

Two young girls have little in common until a homeless dog 
brought them together. As different as night and day in 
personality and interest, their friendship grows strong through 
shared joys. 

 
BR-3433 Return to Me            Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A modern day story of the prodigal. Roxy Burke takes her 
inheritance determined to be a Nashville star. 

 
BR-2284 Return to the Hiding Place          Poley, Hans 
     6 Volumes; Autobiography 

Hans Poley was the first person taken in by the Ten Boom 
family, the Dutch family featured in "The Hiding Place." Tells 
what life was like for persecuted Jews during the war while 
Poley was in the Ten Boom home. 

 
 
BR-2110 Returning Remnant/A         Kauffeld, Shawn 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Israel's captivity and return, 605-430 B.C. Includes Scriptures, 
archeological finds to back them up. 

 
BR-3501 Revelation                Mueller, Wayne 

3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible   Commentary 
Series 

     Commentary for lay people on the book of Revelation 
 
BR-2124 Revenge at the Rodeo          Morris, Gilbert 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Danielle Ross Mystery Series; Book 
4 of 6 
Gilbert Morris has skillfully combined Christian values and 
beliefs within the framework of an intriguing mystery. 

 
BR-2647 Ribbit! Roar! Quack, Quack, Quack 
                   Tangvald, Christine Harder 



     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2318 Riches Stored in Secret Places      Davis, Verdell 
     2 Volumes; Autobiography 

After 27 years as a pastor's wife, Verdell Davis is widowed 
when her husband dies in a plane crash. The story of her 
readjustment, relentless soul searching, and inner 
transformation. 

 
BR-356  Richest Lady in Town/The        Landorf, Joyce 
     2 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-2258 Ride the Wild River           Morris, Gilbert 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Reno Western Saga Series; Book 3 
of 4 
Jim Reno meets a teenager claiming to be his cousin. The 
teenager hires Reno to ride west with a wagon train.  

BR-1909 Riders of the Silver Rim  
Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 2 of 
7 
Joshua Roberts is hired to work at the Silver Rim Mine unaware 
that its future is threatened by greedy and unscrupulous 
enemies.  As an Easterner, can he bring order to a frontier 
town and protect those he has come to. 

 
BR-2057 Rimrock                 Morris, Gilbert 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Reno Western Saga Series; Book 2 
of 4 
A new man must be appointed deputy Marshall of Rimrock. 
That man is Jim Reno, a war-weary drifter. As the new deputy, 
Reno will face the death threats of a blood-thirsty saloon owner 
and the sinister gunslinger. 

 
BR-2302 Ring Around a Mystery        Erwin, Vicki Berger 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 4 of 6 
After Justin is accused of stealing the friendship ring he gave 
her, Elizabeth attempts to help. 

 



BR-1575 Rise and Shine            Swindoll, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Ten stirring chapters that call for an alert, wide-awake church, 
ready to reach out and grasp the incredible opportunities at the 
close of the twentieth century.  

 
BR-3045 Rise and Walk               Byrd, Dennis 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

The trial and triumph of Dennis Byrd after he suffers a broken 
neck on the football field. 
 
 

BR-1973 Road Best Traveled/The        McAlpine, Stuart 
     7 Volumes; Christian Life 

Jesus told his followers there are only two roads.  A wide 
highway or a narrow lane. The narrow lane is the one Jesus 
recommends and The Road Best Traveled is for anyone who 
wants to discover why. 

 
BR-1701 Robbie Taggart Highland Sailor 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

From London to Bombay to Shanghai, from treachery and 
betrayal to the possibilities of forgiveness, from near death to 
the joys of true love this story of Robbie Taggart's search for life 
is exciting and inspirational. 

 
BR-1857 Role of the Church in Society/The    Colson, Charles 
     1 Volume; Church History 

Charles Colson calls us to remember that the church is more 
than a lofty building or self-help group. It is a people exhorted to 
holiness and mandated to tell others the Good News - by our 
words and our lives. 

 
BR-2970 Romans               Panning, Armin J. 

4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

 
BR-1836 Romantic Love             Dobson, James 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 



Dr. Dobson offers sensitive, practical guidance on how to use 
your head in matters of the heart. He answers questions about 
the powerful emotion of romantic love. 

 
BR-1224 Room for One More       Booth, Nyla/Scott, Ann 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The heartwarming, true story of the Scott family, who adopted 
fifteen children. 

BR-2715 Rose for Jenny/A             Page, Carole 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heartland Memories;  
     Book 5 of 5 

The touching story of a young woman's search for love and her 
personal journey of faith. 

 
BR-1794 Roses for Mama              Oke, Janette 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 3 
of 12 
Angela was just fourteen when her mother was dying and 
giving her instructions on how to raise three young siblings.  
Then something happened to her father.  Angela faces 
profound events that reshape their family. 

 
BR-3320 Ruby                Snelling, Lauraine 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Dakotah Treasures;  
     Book 1 of 4 

Ruby Tarvald and her young sister Opal set out to see their 
long lost father and claim their inheritance. But instead of 
treasure the sisters find they now own a saloon and brothel. 
How do God-fearing women handle this? 

 
BR-2244 Rumor/The               Gorman, Carol 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; I Witness Series; Book 4 of 4 

Samantha and Abby start a "good" rumor and discover that they 
need Jesus' forgiveness. 

 
BR-1958  Runaway Parents/The            Bibee, John 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series;  
     Book 6 of 7 

The Kramer family is split apart when the parents decide to stop 
following the way of the Spirit Flyer Bicycles and join forces with 



the powerful and sinister Goliath Industries. 
 
BR-1503 Running on Empty            Briscoe, Jill 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Through insightful character studies of ten Bible people who 
had many problems and low points we, too, see how God can 
give us new meaning and energy when we have our problems 
and are running on empty. 

 
BR-3013 Rush of Wings/A           Heitzmann, Kristen 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rush of Wings/A;  
     Book 1 of 2 

Noelle St. Clair's panic is real and causes her to abandon a 
wealthy sheltered life for a remote and safe haven. Can Rick 
Spencer or his brother Morgan break through the shell with 
their faith and bring Noelle to faith and life? 

 
BR-2694 Rustle of Angels/A 
          Webber, William D./Webber, Marilynn Carlson 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life                                                 

Real stories that have been researched concerning angels. 
 
BR-2902 Ruth                  Copeland, Lori 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Brides of the West 1872 Series; Book 
5 of 6 
Ruth Priggish is on the run from an 80-year-old suitor so heads 
for Wyoming territory. Her only hope of getting there is with the 
unwilling protection of U.S. Marshall Dylan McCall. 

 
BR-1161 Ruth                  Henderson, Lois 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Ruth’s heroine faith in God and her own inner strength. 
 
BR-3372 Ruth and Naomi           Sanders, Karen N. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book;  
     Ruth 1-4 for children 
BR-924  Ruth, Great Heroes of the Bible      Barrett, Ethel 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-1742 Ruth...A Love Story            Traylor, Ellen 



     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
Ruth, a Moabitess, was a foreigner to the Jewish religion and 
way of life. She suffered the pain of separation and poverty 
before her understanding would be made plain. 

 
BR-3362 RV There Yet?               Hunt, Diann 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Three baby-boomer women hop into a vintage Winnebago on a 
rescue mission to save their old Bible camp. 

 
BR-2394 Ryan's Trials             Shepherd, Linda 
     6 Volumes; Young Adult, Bible Study  

A devotional novel which deals with real life problems today's 
teenagers face.  
 

BR-2283 Sacred Honor              Roth, David 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The inside account of his life from early childhood to the 
present. His involvement in the Persian Gulf. 

 
BR-2190 Sacred Ruins/The           Palmer, Bernard 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Danny Orlis Series; Book 6 of 
6 
Sent on a mission to the jungles of Mexico, Danny soon 
uncovers a temple robbery plot.  

 
BR-2624 Sacred Shore/The      Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Song of Acadia Book 2 of 5 

For 18 years Anne and Nicole led separate lives with the 
people they thought were their parents. Now they find the truth 
and develop a friendship. 

BR-2951 Saint Nicholas            Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Nicholas was a generous pastor, his response to the gifts Jesus 
gives us. 

 
BR-2214 Saintly Buccaneer/The          Morris, Gilbert 

12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series; Book 5 of 
13 
Nathan and Paul, Winslow cousins, continue their separate 



struggles during the Revolution. Nathan fights to keep the 
hopes of the Army while Paul bitterly opposes it.  

 
BR-2939 Saints and Angels All Around     Wismar, Gregory J. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Stories about Christian saints and God's holy angels. The 
saints help us find inspiration for our walk with God. 

 
BR-3310 Salt Garden/The      Martinusen, Cindy McCormick 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A writer, a recluse, and a dead woman's journal converge as 
they discover the trust about lost love.  

 
BR-619  Salute to Sandy           Rogers, Dale Evans 
     1 Volume; Biography 
 
BR-1826 Samuel Francis Smith         Fitch, Marguerite 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

Traces the life of the Baptist clergyman and poet who wrote the 
words to the patriotic song: “My Country 'Tis of Thee.” 

 
BR-2555 Samuel, the Little Priest        Degering, Etta B. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print; My Bible Friends; 
     Book 3 of 3 

Also David, the Youngest Boy. 
BR-1741 Sanctity of Life            Swindoll, Charles 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

While this book decries society's penchant for abortion, it is also 
a book on resolve, courage, and compassion.  It is not the last 
word on abortion, but it is the definitive position on moral living 
for Christians today. 

 
BR-3418 Sanctuary          Lewis, Beverly/Lewis, David 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Amish Country Crossroads; Book 3 
of 3 
A harrowing love story of the power behind revenge, the price 
for freedom and the solace found in friendship. The search for 
meaning in life brings them face to face with the cross of Christ. 

 
BR-2462 Sand & Shells Carousels Silver Bells   Anders, Isabel 



     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 
     Prayer poems for all the seasons 
 
BR-2018 Sandcastles and Cucumber Ships...     Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Poetry 
 
BR-1940 Sandi Patti, the Voice of Gospel       Cusic, Don 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

Don Cusic tells of Sandi's early years as a backup singer and 
reveals how she manages her musical achievements.  

 
BR-2528 Sarah's Patchwork          Whitson, Stephanie 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Keepsake Legacies;  
     Book 1 of 3 

Each scrap of fabric Sarah sews into a quilt tells of her change 
from a frightened orphan into a woman. 

 
BR-3550 Sarah's Song             Kingsbury, Karen 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Red Gloves Collection; Book 
3 of 4 

BR-3062 Saul's Conversion            Bohnet, Eric C. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book 
     Story of Saul's conversion on the way to Damascus. 
 
BR-1431 Saved By the Bell            Davoll, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-3533 Saving Grace              Y'Barbo, Kathleen 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Roses Book; Book 4 of 4 
 
BR-2921 Savior that God Sent/The        Rainbolt, Kelly 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print; Christmas book. 
 
BR-3071 Saying Goodbye Even When You Don't Want To 
                         Bolton, Martha 
     5 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

The violence in high schools points out need for teens help in 
dealing with grief: death of parents and friends, suicides, 
divorce, losses through sin and failure.   

 



BR-2749 Scarlet Thunder           Brouwer, Sigmund 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series; 
     Book 5 of 6 

17-year-old Trent is helping his uncle film a TV documentary 
about Scarlet Thunder, a stock-car racing team, when he 
begins to suspect that someone is sabotaging the shoot. 

 
BR-1490 Scary Basketball Player/The       Jenkins, Jerry 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series; Book 2 of 8 
When their basketball team gets its big chance, the opportunity 
to play the undefeated defending champions, the Baker Street 
Sports Club almost gives up before the game.  
 

BR-748  Screwtape Letters/The           Lewis, C. S. 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2374 Sea to Shining Sea           Phillips, Michael 

13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journals of Corrie Belle Holliday 
Series; Book 5 of 9 
Corrie's reputation as California's Woman Reporter brings her 
to the attention of the new Republican Party. She believes 
slavery is wrong and wants to help get Lincoln elected. 

 
BR-2142 Sean Donovan                Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Californians Series;  
     Book 3 of 4 

The story of Kaitlin's brother and the rebellious life he leads 
before finding the Lord and the changes it brings. 

 
BR-1987 Search for Serenity/A         Tchividjian, Gigi 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Gigi describes seven areas of struggle which conspire to make 
us weary. She offers comfort, perspective, spiritual 
encouragement and sound Biblical counsel. 

 
BR-2699 Searching Heart/A             Oke, Janette 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Legacy Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Virginia Simpson graduates from high school. But her plans for 



college and marriage take a sudden change. 
 
BR-2700 Seaside                Blackstock, Terri 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A mother's love and honesty tries to teach her daughter a wiser, 
uncluttered way of life to bring peace to their hearts and healing 
to their relationship. 

 
 
BR-2907 Season of Blessing   LaHaye, Beverly/Blackstock, Terri 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seasons Series; Book 4 of 4 

As friends of Cedar Circle lend love and support to Sylvia 
during her illness, God is at work, knitting hearts, shaping and 
changing lives and drawing forth blessings. 

 
BR-2882 Seasons of Bliss             Glover, Ruth 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saskatchewan Saga Series; Book 4 
of 5 
When Tierney Caulder meets her beloved Robbie Dunbar on 
the Canada frontier, she can hardly take it in. But is the future 
once again to be torn apart or will their faith bring them 
together? 

 
BR-1382 Seasons of Love             Bacher, June 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journey to Love Series;  
     Book 3 of 5 
 
BR-2779 Seasons under Heaven 
               LaHaye, Beverly/Blackstock, Terri 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seasons Series; Book 1 of 4 

Neighbors try to help a child who needs a heart transplant. All 
of them live on the Cedar Circle Culdesac. 

 
BR-2756 Second Chances          Smith, Debra White 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seven Sisters Series;  
     Book 1 of 7 

Marilyn Thatcher is not looking for another man after her pastor 
husband deserted her. She meets her charming neighbor but 
also discovers his mysterious side whose past threatens her 
future. 



 
BR-2088 Second Corinthians          Valleskey, David 

5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 

     A Bible Study commentary written for the layman. 
BR-2661 Second-Best Bride             Glover, Ruth 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Wildrose Series; Book 5 of 6 

When Meg's beautiful sister promises to marry a homesteader 
Meg wonders if she will honor her pledge. 

 
BR-1476 Secret Baseball Challenge/The      Jenkins, Jerry 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series; Book 1 of 8 
The Baker Street Sports Club go from dreaming about playing 
baseball to forming their own team. 

 
BR-2478 Secret Cave of Robinwood/The      McCusker, Paul 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series 
Book; 3 of 12 
To impress the members of a special boy's club he longs to 
join, Mark betrays a secret of his best friend Patti, causing him 
to lose her friendship and his club membership. 

 
BR-1574 Secret Garden/The          Burnett, Frances 
     5 Volumes; Preteen, Children 

Unloved and unloving, Mary Lennox wanders the moors of her 
uncle's home in England. One day she chances upon the door 
of a secret garden. Mary, her sickly cousin Colin, and a peasant 
boy named Dickson strive to make the garden bloom once 
more.  

 
BR-2417 Secret in the Old Book/The     Erwin, Vicki Berger 

1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 5 of 6 
Elizabeth explores an old house filled with books and 
encounters a mysterious boy trying to sell a first edition. 

 
BR-2666 Secret Money          Leppard, Lois Gladys 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Lily Adventures/The 

Lily’s adventure, solving of a mystery. 



BR-2081 Secret of the Shark Pit            Roddy, Lee 
2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ladd Family Adventure/ A;  Book 
1 of 4 
Several acts of disobedience against his father's orders plunge 
12-year-old Josh into terrible trouble during a search for a 
long-lost Hawaiian treasure guarded by sharks. 

 
BR-2065 Secret of the Sunken Sub          Roddy, Lee 

        2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ladd Family Adventure/ A;    
 Book 4 of 4 

When 12-year-old Josh witnesses the sinking of a Soviet robot 
submarine off the coast of a Hawaiian island, he becomes the 
quarry of Russian spies racing to beat the United States Navy 
to the sub and its secrets. 

 
BR-3121 Secret Place of Thunder   Morris, Gilbert/Morris, Lynn 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series; Book 5 
of 8 
Setting is an indigo plantation near New Orleans where voodoo 
and illness are trying to force Cheney relatives to leave. 
Cheney and Shiloh must find out what a West Indies cult is all 
about. 

 
BR-2197 Secret Society of the Left Hand  Mackall, Dandi Daley 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Cinnamon Lake Mysteries; Book 1 
of 8 
When Molly and her friends form the Secret Society of the Left 
Hand, each member agrees to do a secret act of kindness, but 
someone threatens to reveal the secrets.  

 
BR-1479 Secret Strength               Tada, Joni 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Four groupings of tough and tender devotional readings. 
 
 
BR-3031 Secrets               Heitzmann, Kristen 
     14 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Michelli Family Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 

Rose Barrett is restoring an old villa to recover from her father's 
death. Lance Michelle is looking for answers to keep his 



grandmother. Will the secrets of the villa unite or divide them as 
they keep their personal secrets. 

 
BR-2285 Secrets                  Gunn, Robin 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series; 
     Book 1 of 8 

Jessica takes a job as an English teacher in Oregon, 
determined to hide her identity from the community. 

 
BR-2782 Secrets of the Heart        Lacy, Al/Lacy, Joanna 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mail Order Bride Series;  
     Book 1 of 5 

Peter's young widow answers an ad for a mail order bride.  
 
BR-3511 Secrets on the Wind         Whitson, Stephanie 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pine Ridge Portraits;  
     Book 1 of 3 
 
BR-1737 Seed's Inheritance             Thiele, Colin 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

An authentic and engaging historical novel, from one of 
Australia's most versatile writers. 

 
BR-2873 Seeing Through              Roper, David 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Using the book of Elijah as source and example, shows how 
God can use you to change your world. 

 
 
 
BR-1925 Sequoia Scout       Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 4 of 
7 
Will Reed has never shied away from danger, but few 
Americans had attempted the overland trail to the High Sierras. 
Will discovers marauding Indian tribes, nature's threats, and 
Mexico's new independence from Spain. 

 
BR-3538 Serena's Strength             Mills, DiAnn 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Roses Book; Book 2 of 4 



 
BR-3582 Sermon on the Mound        O'Connor, Michael 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Convinced God was orchestrating the New York Mets' 
phenomenal comeback in game six of the 1986 World Series, 
O'Connor began analyzing why God would rig a game watched 
by millions for his benefit. Why would God care about him? 
Sermon on the Mound reveals that God is available to us 
everywhere. 

 
BR-2247 Service with a Smile          O'Connor, Karen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Action Readers Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

For ages 6-9, each Action Reader has five stories with related 
activities. 

 
BR-1835 Seven Days a Week: Faith in Action     Vos, Nelvin 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

An ecumenical book that demonstrates the great hunger, need 
and possibilities for an effective ministry of the laity in the 
contemporary world. 

  
BR-1320 Seven Deadly Sins          Campolo, Anthony 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
 
BR-2073 Seven Men Who Ruled the World from the Grave 
                          Breese, Dave 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Church History 

The grave cannot contain the influence these seven men have 
on today's world. They have altered the thinking of society 
through their philosophies. The author warns us of the dangers 
of believing their ideas. 

 
BR-2814 Shade                   Miller, Calvin 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Snow Series; Book 3 of 4 

The pressing weight of loss and heartache cause the suffering 
to seek the refreshing places of God's comfort. Continues the 
story of the Muellers and McCaslins in King of Prussia, 
Pennsylvania. 



 
BR-2613 Shadow of Doubt           Blackstock, Terri 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Newpointe 911 Series;  
     Book 2 of 5 

One of Newpointe's police officers lies in a hospital, comatose 
from arsenic poisoning, and the only suspect is his wife. 
Friends doubt her innocence, but her real Christian friends 
stand by her to prove her innocent. 

 
BR-2006 Shadow of Doubt             Todd, Diane 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Shadow Series; Book 2 of 2 

Lissa McIntyre is a photographer who becomes involved in the 
mystery of a strange key given to her by a friend.  She 
becomes entangled in mystery and murder and needs God's 
strength to help her know what is right. 

 
BR-2560 Shadow of Fear               Peart, Jane 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Edgecliffe Manor Mysteries; Book 2 
of 2 
Challys Winthrop promises her dying mother she will care for 
her little brother Ty. 

 
BR-1854 Shadow of the Almighty         Elliot, Elisabeth 
     8 Volumes; Biography 

An account of the martyrdom of Jim Elliot and four missionaries 
at the hands of the Auca Indians in Ecuador. Elisabeth Elliot 
gives the vivid details of a life "hid with Christ in God." 

 
BR-2228 Shadow of the Mountains  Morris, Gilbert/Morris, Lynn 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series; Book 2 
of 8 
After her trip to Washington Territory, Cheney returns home. A 
friend having a baby has settled in the wilderness of Arkansas 
where there is no doctor. Cheney goes to help and finds she 
must deal with superstition. 

 
BR-1851 Shadow Wind              Todd, Diane 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Shadow Series; Book 1 of 2 

Two years ago Krista had torn herself away from Anthony 
Mariana's power. She established a new life in Colorado. Now 



she has been forced to return to unfinished business. 
 
BR-2424 Shadowed Memories             Lacy, Al 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Battles of Destiny Series; Book 4 of 
6 
A soldier awakes from a battlefield injury but does not know 
who he is or even which side he was fighting for.  

 
BR-1882 Shadows over Stonewycke 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

        12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Stonewycke Legacy Series;   
 Book 2 of 3         

Shortly before the outbreak of WWII, Allison and Logan's 
relationship falls into disenchantment.  Logan gets involved 
with espionage and slips into France to become part of the 
Underground.  

BR-2085 Shame and Grace            Smedes, Lewis 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Presents a spiritual plan for healing based on grace, the gift of 
knowing that one is acceptable even though he cannot meet 
God's standards or those of society, the church or family. 
 

BR-2324 Sharpening the Sword         Hower, Stephen 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Fifty true stories of well-known people with Christian 
application. 

 
BR-1662 She Loved People            Warnke, Mabel 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

A loving depiction by a mother of her deceased daughter set 
against a family history. 

 
BR-3021 She Said Yes               Bernall, Misty 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Biography 

Cassie Bernall, a victim of Columbine, started down the 
troubled path similar to that of her killers, but her parents risked 
everything to get her back on the right path. When the killers 
asked "Do you believe in God?" 

 
BR-2910 Sheep Care           Blake, Anne Catharine 



1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print; Sheep Board Books; Book 3 
of 4 

 
BR-2915 Sheep Lost           Blake, Anne Catharine 

1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print; Sheep Board Books; Book 4 
of 4 

 
BR-2636 Sheep Share          Blake, Anne Catharine 

1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print; Sheep Board Books; Book 2 
of 4 

 
BR-2637 Sheep Sleep           Blake, Anne Catharine 

1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print; Sheep Board Books; Book 1 
of 4 

  
BR-749  Shepherd Looks at Good Shepherd   Keller, W. Phillip 
     3 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-609  Shepherd Looks at Psalm 23/A     Keller, W. Phillip 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

A lively and interesting devotional commentary based on one of 
the best-loved Bible passages. 

 
BR-1518 Shepherd of the Hills/The        Wright, Harold 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The classic story of the stranger who goes deep into the Ozark 
Mountains. His appearance signals intellect and culture, yet he 
is marked with grief and disappointment.   

 
BR-1844 Shepherd/The              Girzone, Joseph 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

David Campbell, the Shepherd, preaches to Catholics, 
Protestants, Moslems and Jew the universal message that 
changes everyone it touches.  Campbell's attempt to fulfill the 
dream of Jesus, one flock, one shepherd. 

 
BR-3066 Shepherd's Christmas Story/The  Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 

The story of the first Christmas night in Bethlehem, told by a 
shepherd who was there. 



 
BR-2589 Shiloh Autumn      Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     15 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The Depression ends, but banks are failing, and crops are lost 
to dry weather and low prices. Share joys and tragedies as a 
family struggles to make a living and survive in adversity. 
 

BR-2576 Shining Light/The             Glover, Ruth 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Wildrose Series; Book 1 of 6 

Worth and Abbie Rooney were lured by the promise of land and 
wealth in the West in the early 1900's. Their new life in 
Saskatchewan was hard, but could Abbie hold on to the 
dream? 

 
BR-2999 Ship Possessed/A           Gansky, Alton L. 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; J.D. Stanton Mysteries;  
     Book 1 of 2 

A story of the forces of darkness that are all around us. The 
USS Triggerfish, a World War II submarine, has come home 50 
years after she was presumed lost in the Atlantic, but she is not 
alone.  

 
BR-1916 Shipwreck on the Lights          Biggar, Joan 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Adventure Quest Series; Book 
3 of 4 
While visiting a pen pal at a lighthouse station in British 
Columbia, Mike, Jodi and Billy are plunged into an adventure 
involving shipwrecks and drug smuggling and find that Jesus' 
light guides them more surely. 

 
BR-2730 Shoe Box/The             Rivers, Francine 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

While Timmy finds a loving home he remains unwilling to share 
the secret of his mysterious shoe box. 

 
BR-1818 Shoelaces and Brussels Sprouts    Levene, Nancy 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Alex Series (The);  
     Book 1 of 5 

A young Christian lies to her mother about losing a special pair 
of shoelaces. 



 
 

BR-2025 Shooting Star       Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 7 of 
7 
The 7th book in the Saga of the Sierras, set in the California 
gold rush days.  

 
BR-2644 Shooting Stars      Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series;  
Book 8 of 20 

     Willie discovers that God already thinks he's a star. 
 
BR-2676 Short Stories for Long Rainy Days 
                    Douglas, Katherine Anne 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Ten short stories, each confirming the power of love to 
transform hearts and lives. 

 
BR-2759  Short Stories from Days Gone By 
                    Douglas, Katherine Anne 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

One of the best things about growing old is new perspective on 
the past. The collection takes us into the many-faceted lives of 
real people trials, triumphs, and deeper assurance of God's 
love. 

 
BR-2188 Showdown/The            Palmer, Bernard 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Danny Orlis Series; Book 4 of 
6 
Tim Barton, new quarterback at Cedarton, pays a one-man 
game, and the rest of the team is in rebellion. Each is 
determined to break the other side first. Can Danny bring the 
two sides together before the championship. 
 
 

BR-2880 Showers in Season  
LaHaye, Beverly/Blackstock, Terri 

     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seasons Series; Book 2 of 4 



Continues the theme of life and relationship of Tory, Sylvia, 
Cathy and Brenda. Sylvia is in the midst of a hurricane in 
Nicaragua while on a mission trip while Tory debates abortion. 

 
BR-1765 Showers of Blessings             Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Poetry 

Through these poems the author reflects on the many blessings 
our loving Father pours upon us. 

 
BR-2518 Shunning/The              Lewis, Beverly 

        8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heritage of Lancaster County;   
 Book 1 of 3 

Katie Lapp is being raised Old Order Amish and feels somehow 
that she never quite belongs. A family secret which she 
discovers in the attic changes her whole life. 

 
BR-890  Siberian Seven/The            Pollock, John 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Exhaustive, comprehensive reference and resource material. 
 
BR-595  Sifted Gold               Wilson, Yvonne 
     2 Volumes; Biography 

Overnight Yvonne Wilson was paralyzed from the rare disease 
Guillain-Barre Syndrome. As you read her story you will see the 
glory of Christ who saved her. 

 
BR-1907 Silence is Broken/The          Jenkins, Jerry 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 5 of 8 

Margo Mysteries Vol. 5. Allyson Scheel's mother was a socialite 
and her father an immigrant laborer with a heavy German 
accent.  

BR-3011 Silent Abduction                Lacy, Al 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 2 of 7 
A mysterious man fights to defend a small town and to rescue a 
woman and child held captive by a local Indian. 

 
BR-3107 Silent Star              Peterson, Tracie 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Andy works for the telegraph office in WWII and because of the 



sad news he brings the town turns against him.  Estella 
befriends him and teaches him and the town that God is the 
one who brings hope to the sad. 

 
BR-1656 Silent Track Star/The          Jenkins, Jerry 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series 
One of the fastest runners in the state has moved to Dallas's 
neighborhood. He doesn't seem to have any fun and does not 
want to make friends. The Sports Club learns a tough lesson 
from him.  

 
BR-2304 Silk                   Chaikin, Linda 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heart of India Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 

A novel about a young Christian girl who lives in India during 
the 1790s. She adopts an orphan Hindu boy whose parents 
had converted him to Christianity.  

 
BR-2181 Silver Boxes, the Gift of Encouragement 
                        Littauer, Florence 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

A book filled with wit, wisdom and warmth. The author shows 
readers how to: become an encourager, make others feel 
special, transmit trust, mend broken dreams and challenge 
others to be the best they can be. 

 
BR-2071 Silver Chair/The              Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series;  
     Book 6 of 7 

How captive Prince Rilian escaped from the Emerald Witch. 
 
BR-3442 Silver Lining              Reece, Colleen L. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Patchwork Christmas;  
     Book 2 of 2 

A retired schoolteacher leaves a patchwork quilt to two former 
students. Each has it for one year. 

 
BR-1699 Silver Wings            Hill, Grace Livingston 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



Amory Lorrimer fell in love with a young pilot, Gareth.  Almost 
immediately he had to leave for a dangerous assignment over 
the Arctic. He disappeared and Amory kept her belief that he 
was still alive.  A love story. 

 
BR-3394 Simple Gifts               Copeland, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

When Marlene Queens goes home to Parners Springs, MO to 
settle her Aunt Beth's estate she finds her entire life being 
rearranged. Can God work a miracle so she can finally have the 
future she's longed for? 

 
BR-3332 Sing Glory, Sing Jesus is Born!       Pawlitz, Gail 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This book offers sweet illustrations and a delightful rhyme about 
the baby Jesus.  

 
BR-1892 Single Moms, Single Dads         Miller, David 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Deals with the everyday life of a single parent and offers 
practical, Biblical, common-sense insight and support. 

 
BR-3379 Sisterchicks Do the Hula!         Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 2 of 6 

Best friends Hope and Laurie are on a mission to Hawaii to 
commemorate their fortieth birthdays unhindered by a surprise 
little stowaway.  

 
BR-3365 Sisterchicks Down Under          Gunn, Robin 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 4 of 6 

Kathleen's husband Tony takes a job in New Zealand and she 
feels all alone until she meets Jill, a recent widow.   

 
BR-3383 Sisterchicks in Gondolas          Gunn, Robin 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 6 of 6 

Jenna is invited to Vienna to cook for a small retreat group and 
takes her sister-in-law Sue along. Their service makes them 



realize that when serving God, the most important thing to do is 
just show up. 
 

BR-3314 Sisterchicks in Sombreros        Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 3 of 6 

Canadian sisters Melanie and Joanne are stunned to hear they 
have inherited a Mexican beach house. When they go to check 
it out their adventures make them realize the dreams God has 
for them. 

 
BR-3344 Sisterchicks on the Loose!        Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 1 of 6 

Sharon and Penny were unlikely best friends and their 20-year 
friendship takes a surprising leap when Penny plans a trip to 
seek out her only living relatives in Finland!  

BR-3338 Sisterchicks Say Ooh La La!       Gunn, Robin 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sisterchicks Novel/A;  
     Book 5 of 6 

When they were little, Amy and Lisa promised they'd go to 
Paris. Even though they grew apart over the years, some 
promises are made to be kept. 

 
BR-1605 Six Hours One Friday           Lucado, Max 
     4 Volumes; Devotion 

If the claims of the cross are true, then there is an anchor point 
for our futility, amnesty for the guilty, and life for the dying. 

 
BR-1838 Sixteen and Away From Home    Richardson, Arleta 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Grandma's Attic Series; Book 
5 of 10 
Mabel and her friend, Sarah Jane, begin their last year of 
school at the academy in town and away from their farm homes 
and families. They have some “momentous moments.”  

 
BR-2765 Sixth Man Switch          Kindig, Tess Eileen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Slam Dunk Series;  
     Book 1 of 8 

Fourth grader Mickey McGhee and friend Zack Zeno eat, sleep 



and breathe basketball. When the city announces a basketball 
league for their age group they wonder what chance they have 
against taller athletes. 

 
BR-1762 Skate Expectations             Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 4 of 9 

After Derrick Cryder abuses Nicholas's friend, Philip, Nicholas 
challenges him to a skateboard race. Nicholas and McGee 
learn the importance of showing love and kindness to others. 

 
BR-2111 Skeleton in God's Closet/A          Maier, Paul 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A skeleton almost 2,000 years old will it shed new light on the 
life of Jesus or plunge the world into chaos? Explores the 
tension between doubt and faith, science and religion, and one 
man's determination to find the truth. 

 
BR-3462 Skies over Sweetwater           Moberg, Julia 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A novel based on the real story of the Women Air force Service 
Pilots (WASP) who served as transfer pilots during World War 
II. The first women in history trained to fly American military 
aircraft. 

 
BR-2641 Sleepytime Prayers          Browne, Yolanda 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2510 Smelly Tales          Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

        1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends      
 Series; Book 4 of 12 

Rosie the skunk and her desert animal friends learn that gossip 
hurts. 

 
BR-2534 Snow                   Miller, Calvin 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Snow Series; Book 1 of 4 

Mary Withers, a young widow, desperately needs asthma 
medicine for her daughter. 

 
BR-2472 Snow Angel/The             Boone, Debby 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 



Rose and her grandfather seem to be the only people left in 
their village who know how to dream and experience the beauty 
of the world, until a snow angel comes to life and creates 
wondrous events. 

 
BR-2609 Snow Ghost                  Lacy, Al 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 7 of 7 
Payton Sturgis paid for his crimes with his life. Can John 
Stranger convince the people of Silver Bow that ghosts do not 
exist? 

 
BR-2013 Snowflakes in September       Various Authors 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

Unusual happenings in people's lives. Shows how God directs 
our paths, supplies our needs, preserves our lives, speaks to 
us, and sends His Word. 

 
BR-1568 So Who's Perfect            Cassie, Dhyan 
     5 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-1921 So, Stick a Geranium in Your Hat  

Johnson, Barbara 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Barbara is a survivor: her husband had a near-fatal accident, 
she lost a son in Vietnam and another to a drunk-driver, a third 
son was a homosexual.  

 
BR-2717 Soaring Eagle            Whitson, Stephanie 

5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Prairie Winds-Whitson; Book 2 
of 3 
A young widow, a disillusioned soldier and an angry Sioux 
warrior are united to create a novel of romance. 

 
BR-1443 Solo Flight              Various Authors 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-3074 Solomon Builds the Temple      Nielsen, Pamela 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Little Learner Bible Story  

Based on 1 Kings 5:1--8:66. Teaches young readers that God 



calls us to gather in his house the church. 
BR-2877 Some Things Last Forever        Wubbels, Lance 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Gentle Hills Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

With their family's future ahead of them, will the Macmillans 
come to understand the things in life worth living. 

 
BR-2104 Sometimes I Feel Like Running Away from Home 
                     Newenhuyse, Elizabeth 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Newenhuyse offers dozens of insights and simple, inexpensive, 
enjoyable ideas to put some lift back into your day. 

 
BR-1991 Sometimes I Hurt          Tengbom, Mildred 
     2 Volumes; Bible Study 

Job and his friends step-out of the Old Testament and into 
modern life where their reactions to misfortune are related to 
the problems faced by today's Christians. 

 
BR-1828 Song for Kasey/A             Page, Carole 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

16-year-old Kasey struggles with having to make a move to a 
new school, her feelings about her own looks and popularity, 
her interest in a certain young man and her jealous thoughts 
toward a girl in her class. 

 
BR-3386 Song of Solomon             Dunker, Gary 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; God's Word for Today 

The themes of love and longing, expectation and fulfillment take 
on a wondrous cast and hue. 

 
BR-3458 Songs from a Mother's Heart     Kennedy, Pamela J. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A delightful application of God's poetry, wisdom and practical 
love that will touch the hearts of mothers. 

BR-2152 Songs in the Whirlwind          Bacher, June 
     11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Marvel Harrington is a 13-year-old in Texas just as the 
Depression hits. 

 



BR-1564 Songs of Faith             Idle, Christopher 
     1 Volume; Music; Well-loved hymns and their stories. 
 
BR-2428 Sophie's Heart                Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Sophie leaves Czechoslovakia and a good job as a government 
translator in order to make a better life for herself. But after a 
brief job as a waitress, she finds a job as a housekeeper for a 
widower with three children. 

 
BR-2429 Soul's Quest for God/The         Sproul, R. C. 
     5 Volumes; Bible Study 

Applies theology for all Christians who long for a deeper 
intimacy with God. 

 
BR-1314 Sound of the Trumpet/The     Hill, Grace Livingston 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 14 of 14 
Lisle Kingsley found in John Sargent the man she wanted to 
marry.   

 
BR-2019 Sounds of Yourself             Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Adult, Poetry 

A small book of poems which encourage the reader to examine 
his feelings. 

 
BR-2483 Sour Snacks          Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
3 of 12 
In preparation for an important race, Wanda, a cottontail rabbit, 
learns to eat only when hungry and to exercise. 

BR-2289 Speaking the Truth in Love 
                   Koch, Ruth/Haugk, Kenneth 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Invites you to experience the freedom and joy of Christian 
assertiveness. You will discover how a scriptural understanding 
of assertive living builds healthy relationships with others, in 
groups, and in congregations. 

 
BR-2501 Speaking the Truth in Love to Mormons 



                         Cares, Mark J. 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Facts about Mormonism and how to witness to Mormons. Does 
not rehash Mormon history and doctrine, but approaches from 
the standpoint of how Mormons think and how to approach 
them about their faith. 

 
BR-743  Special Women in the Bible        Strom, Kay 
     1 Volume; Bible Study 
 
BR-2752 Spider McGhee and the Hoopla    Kindig, Tess Eileen 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Slam Dunk Series;  
     Book 2 of 8 

Mickey McGhee becomes a surprising basketball dynamo. In 
the midst of the media hype he learns the importance of 
friendship, forgiveness, and unconditional love especially God's 
love. 
 

BR-3358 Spiked!         Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game On 2 Timothy 1:7 

With the help of her best friends, and a new friend, Katie learns 
to see people more as God does and discovers that God often 
works in surprising ways. Volleyball theme. 

 
 
 
BR-3043 Spiritual Journey through Breast Cancer/A    

Asti, Judy 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Judy describes her journey in a unique, honest and powerful 
way, as God constantly demonstrates the depth and breadth of 
His love and strength 

 
BR-1500 Spiritual Stamina            Briscoe, Stuart 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 

Based on the powerful of Colossians. 
 
BR-2616 Spirituality of the Cross/The   Veith Jr., Gene Edward 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

How Lutheran faith is centered on the cross of Jesus.  



 
BR-2126 Splashes of Joy            Johnson, Barbara 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Barbara Johnson, popular humorist and conference speaker 
offers giggles and guidance in short chapters, intended to be 
read in one sitting. 

 
BR-2281 Sportin' a 'Tude            Clairmont, Patsy 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

A humorous look at how not to let others' attitudes rub off on 
you. 

 
BR-2706 Spring                  Mass, Wendy 

1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Windows on the Seasons Book 
2 of 4 
Children celebrate spring with this anthology of songs, poems, 
and prayers. 

 
BR-2659 Spring Waters Rushing      Hayden, Susannah 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Romance Reader 

Belinda lived in the Northwest Territory. Could one man's 
secrets send her away? 

BR-1485 Spring's Gentle Promise          Oke, Janette 
4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Season of the Heart Series; Book 4 
of 4 
The continuing story of Joshua Chadwick Jones. Josh inherits 
his Grandpa's farm and with it the responsibility of supporting 
Grandpa and Uncle Charlie as well as himself.  

 
BR-1817 Springtime of Faith         Lockerbie, Jeanette 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 

The author gives every day the newness of spring. Each page 
brings a heartfelt, encouraging message. Whether for individual 
or family devotions, you'll be renewed with this approach to 
Scripture reading. 

 
BR-1581 Spunky's Diary              Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Spunky is a perky pup whose experiences will endear him to 
your heart. Learn with Spunky what "School", and "Farm" are 



and chuckle when Spunky visits "Church", much to the 
embarrassment of his family. 

 
BR-2502 Standing Firm               Quayle, Dan 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Biography of Dan Quayle from the time of his selection as the 
Vice President Candidate. 

 
BR-1759 Star in the Breaking         Myers, Bill/Johnson 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction 

Nicholas and McGee learn the value of being humble. 
 
BR-2681 Star Light                 Byrd, Sandra 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Secret Sisters; Book 3 of 8 

When bad things happen, Tess's new faith is tested. Can she 
trust God with the big things? 

 
BR-1989 Star Light, Star Bright           Wells, Marion 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Starlight Trilogy Series;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Jenny's search for spiritual truth continues into her marriage. 
Her happiness is overshadowed by thoughts and frightening 
memories.  

 
BR-3073 Star of Wonder           Hinkle, Cynthia A. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

The story of the wise men.  
 
BR-2212 Stars for a Light/The    Morris, Gilbert/Morris, Lynn 

12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Cheney Duvall, M.D. Series; Book 1 
of 8 
Cheney Duvall graduates from medical school in 1865 at a time 
when women are not yet accepted as doctors. 

 
BR-2650 Stadia's Gift          Kelley, Brian/Kelley, Alfie 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The story of Stadia, a baby born with no brain, and how her 
parents and God dealt with the struggle. 

 
BR-2290 Steer Clear              Winkler, Kathleen 



     1 Volume; Young Adult, Christian Life 
The experiences of teens who have faced the consequences of 
such risky behavior as drugs, alcohol, and premarital sex, and 
giving in to peer pressure. 

 
BR-811  Step Further/A             Eareckson, Joni 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-3474 Sticky Statues         Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
9 of 12 

     Value: humility 
 
BR-2474 Stop! It's Christmas          Simon, Mary Man 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 
 
BR-1623 Storm at Daybreak             Hoff, B. J. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Daybreak Mystery/A;  
     Book 1 of 4 

Blinded in a car accident.  Daniel Kane believes the driver was 
killed in the crash.   

 
BR-3525 Storm Rising           Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Blog on Faith Girls 

Storm Novello is convinced no one will like her inner brainiac, 
so she hides behind a public airhead persona and quits every 
project before anyone gets to close. 

 
BR-2755 Storms over Willowbrook         Page, Carole 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heartland Memories;  
     Book 4 of 5 

Story follows Alice Marie back to Willowbrook to the house she 
grew up in and tells the story of enduring love that thrives even 
when threatened by danger and death. 

 
BR-889  Story of a Whim/The       Hill, Grace Livingston 

2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 5 of 14 
A case of mistaken identity leads to great changes in a young 
man's life. 



 
BR-2828 Story of Creation/The          Atchison, Beth 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     Genesis 1-2 for children 
 
BR-3063 Story of Easter/The  

Doyle, Christopher/Haysom, John 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

A retelling of the accounts made by the Gospel writers.  
BR-3343  Story of the Good Samaritan/The     Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-3035 Stranded in Paradise           Copeland, Lori 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of Faith Fiction Club 

Tess Nelson's life is turned around when she loses her job and 
takes a hilariously disastrous trip to Hawaii. She wants to get 
back to normal but God has something else in mind. 

 
BR-2476 Strange Journey Back          McCusker, Paul 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 
Book 1 of 12 
Unhappy by his parent's separation, Mark tries to go back in 
time to set things right. 

 
BR-1804 Strange Proposal/The       Hill, Grace Livingston 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Collector's Choice Series; Book 4 of 
4 
A spirited society girl finds her destiny shaped by the love of a 
struggling young doctor. 

 
BR-1861 Stranger at Stonewycke 
                  Phillips, Michael/Pella, Judith 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Stonewycke Legacy Series; Book 1 
of 3 
The Scottish town of Port Strathy in 1931 has grown, but is 
feeling the effects of the Depression.  The Stonewycke fortune 
is stretched to the limits.  

 
BR-2614 Stranger's Message/The         McCusker, Paul 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Adventures in Odyssey Series; 



Book 11 of 12 
A homeless man's arrival in Odyssey challenges Whit and the 
community young people. 

 
BR-2098 Stranger's Wife/The            Stahl, Hilda 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie series; Book 3 of 3 

Set in 1890, this is the story of Maple Raines, who is rescued 
from an arranged marriage by a stranger. They are ambushed 
and she stays to nurse him back to health. He feels it is his duty 
to marry her. 

 
BR-2252 Streiker the Killdeer            Hardy, Robin 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Streiker Series; Book 2 of 3 

A modern parable about trust and faith which began in 
STREIKER'S BRIDE. Continues in Hawaii when Adair promises 
to "take care of business" for Fletcher. What the business is 
comes as a big surprise! 

 
BR-2119 Streiker's Bride             Hardy, Robin 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Streiker Series; Book 1 of 3 

Adair Weiss is chosen to be the wife of a man she has never 
met. She must make a decision using only a dossier and 
without meeting the man. Will she accept and how will it change 
her life? 

 
BR-2210 Streiker's Morning Sun          Hardy, Robin 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Streiker Series Book; 3 of 3 

Fletcher and Adair travel to the little town of Beaconville at the 
request of one of the residents who thinks Fletcher is the only 
one who can help her dying town.   

 
BR-1229 Strengthening Your Grip        Swindoll, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

Encourages readers to strengthen their grip on what is 
significant in life. 

 
BR-1200 Strike the Original Match      Swindoll, Charles 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 
     A Biblical look at marriage. 
 



BR-3395 Strike Three       Smith, Stephen D/Caldwell, Lise 
     3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Game On 2 Timothy 1:7 

Softball theme. Stephanie has learned a lot from her brother, 
Todd's faith during his struggle to walk after a serious accident. 
Can she use that to confront her own struggles with 
teammates, friends, and a special boy? 

 
BR-1895 Strong-Willed Child/The         Dobson, James 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

A practical "how to" book on discipline and child-rearing, which 
focuses on sibling rivalry, hyper-activity, self-esteem, and the 
most common errors made by frustrated parents. 

 
BR-1232 Struggling for Wholeness       Anderson /Ream 
     4 Volumes; Young Adult, Autobiography 

Twin sisters express their feelings on growing from skinny, 
plain, struggling children to adult women. 

 
BR-2728 Stuck on You       Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 13 of 20 
Inspired by mishaps to his remote control model car and his 
friend's glasses, Willie tries to come up with a new super glue. 
Fruits of the Spirit are emphasized throughout! 

 
BR-2059 Studies in Creation             Klotz, John 
     6 Volumes; Christian Life 
     A general introduction to the creation-evolution debate. 
 
BR-2246 Stuff You Gotta Know          Doud, Guy Rice 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Practical advice about how God's promises relate to such 
real-life issues as depression. 

  
BR-3119 Submarine Sandwiched  Buchanan, Paul/Randall, Rod 

1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; Misadventures of Willie Plumet 
Series; Book 2 of 20 

  
BR-690  Substitute Guest/The       Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



 
BR-3024 Subway Tokens in the Sand    Nentwig, Wendy Lee 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Unmistakably Cooper Ellis; 
Book 3 of 3 
Spring break in the Hamptons with best friend Claire is just 
what Cooper needs, until her mother invites Josh and Alex to 
join them.  

 
BR-1393 Success Fantasy/The         Campolo, Anthony 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2398 Suffer the Little Children           Lacy, Al 
     8 Volumes; Angel of Mercy Series; Book 5 of 10 

Breanna Baylor helps on an orphan train carrying children to 
adoptive families. She develops a special bond between 
several of the children. 

 
BR-2709 Summer                 Mass, Wendy 

1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Windows on the Seasons; Book 
1 of 4 
Classic poems, songs and prayers about summer.  

 
BR-2177 Summer Promise             Gunn, Robin 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christy Miller Series; Book 1 
of 6 
A summer in California for Wisconsin farm girl Christy Miller 
brings her a new image, a moral dilemma involving the local 
fast crowd, an encounter with Christianity, and a vortex of 
questions about what is important in life. 

BR-2658  Summer's Wind Blowing       Hayden, Susannah 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Romance Reader 

Amelia loved the land. Would it fail her when she needed it 
most? 

 
BR-1432 Sunday Surprise/A           Davoll, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-2575 Sunroom/The              Lewis, Beverly 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A lady who is dying and she meets with her children each week 



in the hospital sunroom. 
 
BR-2821 Sunsets                  Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series;  
     Book 4 of 8 

Alissa Benson, a travel agent in Pasadena, keeps crossing 
paths with rude and arrogant Brad Phillips. The she discovers 
he is her new neighbor. 

 
BR-1408 Sunshine of Joy               Rice, Helen 
     1 Volume; Adult, Poetry 
 
BR-2477 Surprise Endings             Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christy Miller Series; Book 4 
of 6 

      Fifteen-year-old Christy hopes to make the cheerleading squad, 
which would give her a greater opportunity to take a stand for 
Christ among the popular girls in school, but she faces a 
jealous classmate and financial 

  
BR-1569 Surprised by Suffering           Sproul, R. C. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

It offers Christian answers human beings ask about their 
destiny.  

 
BR-3529 Sweet as Apple Pie          Billerbeck, Kristin 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction, As American as Apple Pie; 
     Book 2 of 4 

Kayli wanted to make a name for herself by creating fantastic 
desserts, but Adam prefers to enjoy simple things in life. Will 
Kayli stay in Europe or make Adam's favorite pie? 

 
BR-3460 Sweet Briar               Wilbee, Brenda 

        3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seattle Sweetbriar Series;     
 Book 1 of 6 

Louisa Boren journeys west by covered wagon to carve out a 
new way of life. From her rugged determination and hope come 
an enduring love and the founding of a city. 

 
BR-3602 Sweet the Moments     Wagenknecht, DeLyn Davis 



     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
Reflections for women on everyday things. Reminds the reader 
that god is present in all things. 

 
BR-2457 Swindler's Treasure/The          Johnson, Lois 

6 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Riverboat Adventures Series; 
Book 4 of 6 
In 1857, while working for the Underground Railroad on a 
steamboat, 13 year old Libby hunts for the swindler who has 
robbed her father, and she tries to reunite the fugitive slave 
Jordan with his missing father. 

 
BR-3099 Syncopation                Huston, Bev 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Strings of the Heart;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Tristan plays viola in a quartet. His old love Cynthia returns for 
a visit. 

 
 
BR-2221 Tablet/The                 Myers, Bill 

4 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Journeys to Fayrah Series; 
Book 4 of 5 
Cross-dimensionalized once more to the land of Fayrah, Denise 
and Nathan continue in their spiritual discoveries as they make 
minor wrong choices and fail to trust the powerful and loving 
Imager. 

 
BR-2949 Take Me Home        Bateman, Tracey Victoria 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christmas Sleigh Ride; Book 
2 of 2 
It is Kathleen's first Christmas away from home and she 
wonders if that is a mistake. 

 
BR-1790 Take Me Out of the Ball Game        Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 2 of 9 

The Eastfield Braves are bound to win. They have a secret 
weapon, Thurman Miller, A Babe Ruth, Hank Aaron and 
Godzilla all in one.  

 
BR-3522 Take My Hand               Gunn, Robin 



3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 
12 of 12 
A costly misunderstanding leaves Sierra anxious as she says 
goodbye to Portland and heads to California. 

 
BR-2311 Tale of Beatrix Potter/The       Lane, Margaret 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The biography of Beatrix Potter, well-known children's author of 
"Peter Rabbit" and other stories. 

 
BR-2223 Taming of Roberta Parsley/The      Gorman, Carol 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; I Witness Series; Book 1 of 4 

With kindness and Jesus' love, eleven-year-olds help "tame" 
the angry and rude new girl after she runs away. 

 
BR-1197 Taming Tension            Keller, W. Phillip 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Suggestions for living a calm, healthful, and joyous life. 
 
BR-1807 Tangled Web/The              Hoff, B. J. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Daybreak Mystery/A;  
     Book 3 of 4 

A Daybreak Mystery. Daniel and Jennifer Kane, their son 
Jason, the newly married Gabe and Lyss Denton have come to 
get the farm ready for summer campers.  
 

BR-1813 T-Bone Trouble             Levene, Nancy 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction; Alex Series (The);  
     Book 5 of 5 

When a new girl at school starts spreading lies about her, Alex 
loses some friends. 

 
BR-3600 Tears in a Bottle            Bambola, Sylvia 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A gripping story of betrayal, hurt and triumph that accurately 
portrays the real truth behind the abortion lie and the trauma 
suffered in the aftermath, as seen through the eyes of a 
pregnant teenage girls. 

 
BR-2678 Tears of the Sun                Lacy, Al 



3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Journeys of the Stranger Series; 
Book 4 of 7 
John Stranger attempts to prevent a battle. 

 
BR-2797 Tell Me the Christmas Story        Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1858 Tell Me the Story             Lucado, Max 
     1 Volume; Children 

Prepares children to become familiar with God's voice and 
willingly obey because they have come to know Him. 

BR-3277 Tell Me What God Made          Walker, Joni 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This little poem and the sweet illustrations that go with it explain 
that God created the world and everything in it. 
 

BR-2586 Tempest and Refuge      Jander, Martha Streufert 
     1 Volume; Adult, Bible Study; Under His Wings; 
     Book 2 of 5 
 
BR-2556 Ten Commandments for Children/The 
                        Jones, Mary Alice 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1653 Ten Commandments for Today/The 
                        Kramer, William 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

An introduction to and an explanation of the Ten 
Commandments for today’s reader. 

 
BR-2987 Ten Commandments/The         Miller, Claire 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Exodus 20:1-17 God gives the Ten Commandments to His 
people. 

 
BR-2832 Ten Friends Together       

Osborn, Susan Titus/Tangvald, Christine Harder 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

We can all be friends together because of Jesus our very Best 
Friend! Hop onto our bus to meet nine new friends. What do 



they look like? Where do they live? Join them as the tenth 
friend who love Jesus. 

 
BR-3329 Ten Plagues/The             Hartman, Sara 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of the Children of Israel and Pharaoh. 
BR-2862 Tender Vine/The           Heitzmann, Kristen 

13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Diamond of the Rockies Series; 
Book 3 of 3 
Carina and Quillan are married and now journey to California to 
meet her parents and confront her past with former beau Flavio, 
who determines to win her back at any cost. 

 
BR-2402 Tender Years/The             Oke, Janette 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Legacy Series;  
     Book 1 of 4 

This new series (A Prairie Legacy) returns to the legacy of 
Marty and Clark Davis from the Love Comes Softly. 

 
BR-3609 Tendering in the Storm        Kirkpatrick, Jane 

11 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Change and Cherish Historical 
Series; Book 2 of 3 
Based on a true story, A Tendering in the Storm gives voice to 
a mother's fears for her family. 

 
BR-3006 Texas Angel                Pella, Judith 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A riveting tale of redemptions rising amid the ashes of betrayal. 
 
BR-3571 Texas Angel            Smith, Debra White 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Texas; Book 4 of 4 
 
BR-3572 Texas Honor            Smith, Debra White 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Texas; Book 1 of 4 

After her father's death, Rachel Isaacs is determined to hang 
onto her family's ranch in spite of everything that's going wrong 
- Cattle are missing, her barn has been burned to the ground - 
twice, a man was killed and his body mysteriously vanished. 

 
BR-3570 Texas Lady            Smith, Debra White 



     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Texas; Book 3 of 4 
 
BR-3573 Texas Rose            Smith, Debra White 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Texas; Book 2 of 4 
 
BR-2784 Texas Sky/A                 Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Rose Trilogy;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Dakota Rawlings, Texas Ranger, accepts the easy task of 
escorting Darni Wingate to Aurora but discovers that trouble 
follows in her passion for life and her newfound faith in God. 

 
BR-1472 Thank You for Being a Friend         Briscoe, Jill 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

With unusual candor, the author gives credit to ten women who, 
over the years, have nurtured her spiritual. 

 
BR-2635 Thank You, God  
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1928 Thank You, Good-Bye          Jenkins, Jerry 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 7 of 8 

Shannon Perry comes asking for protection. Six people 
murdered in the past few months have been acquaintances of 
hers. In each victim's hand was a "thank you" note. 

 
BR-3331 Thankful Leper/The         Hinkle, Cynthia A. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     The story of the ten lepers. 
 
BR-1480 Thanks for Being a Friend        Johnson, Lois 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Choices kids have to make to save or lose a friend.  
BR-3034 Thanksgiving-a Harvest Celebration Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

The story of the 102 travelers who left Plymouth England for a 
new beginning in a new world. 

 
BR-3406 That Easter Morn               Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 



For children of all ages, That Easter Morn is taken from a hymn 
called “O Sons and Daughters of the King.” 

 
BR-2945 Then Comes Marriage   
                 Hunt, Angela Elwell/Myers, Bill 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Heather and Kurt Stone are to celebrate their first anniversary 
but are fighting instead. Their awakening to the realities of 
marriage and coming to terms are the story of every husband 
and wife. 

 
BR-597  Then Sings My Soul    Shea, George Beverly/Bauer 
     3 Volumes; Autobiography 
     Autobiography of gospel singer, George Beverly Shea. 
 
BR-3313 Theology to Live By/A         Preus, Herman A. 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Reveals Luther's theology not as abstract speculation but as 
doctrine with practical application to Christian life. 

 
BR-598  There's a Snake in My Garden        Briscoe, Jill 
     3 Volumes; Autobiography 
 
BR-2615 These High Green Hills            Karon, Jan 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Mitford Years Series;  
     Book 3 of 9 

Father Tim's life is full of surprises, but a wilderness camping 
trip sends him home a changed man. 

 
BR-1766 Thessalonians               Kuske, David 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; People's Bible Commentary 
Series 
Includes the complete text of the New International Version.  

 
BR-1886 They Called Her Mrs. Doc         Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 5 
of 12 
The spoiled daughter of a noted Montreal physician falls in love 
with a conscientious young doctor.  When he discloses his 
intentions of doctoring on the Western frontier, she is filled with 



uncertainties.  
 
BR-2484 Thief from Five Points/The           Travis, L. 
     4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ben and Zack Series 

While staying at his uncle's mission in New York City during the 
Civil War, Ben and his friends try to help. 

 
BR-2801   Things I Do in Church       Stiegemeyer, Julie 
      1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2796   Things I Hear in Church      Stiegemeyer, Julie 
  1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3278 Things I See at Baptism        Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Help little ones understand what happens during Holy Baptism. 
 
BR-2958 Things I See at Christmas      Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Help toddlers participate in the church service.  
 
BR-2908 Things I See at Easter        Stiegemeyer, Julie 
  1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
BR-2536 Things I See in Church        Stiegemeyer, Julie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This book helps young children follow along in the service and 
better understand what is happening. Take it along and start 
your child on the road to understanding worship! 

 
BR-2903 Things I've Learned Lately       Jacobson, Danae 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life 

Seventeen year old Danae captures the joy and challenges of 
her generation. 

 
BR-2176 Things That Go Bump in the Night 
                 Warren, Dr. Paul/Minirth, Dr. R. 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Explains that facing and overcoming fears is a major growth 
process for children and adolescents. 

 



BR-2225 Things that Matter Most          Thomas, Cal 
     7 Volumes; Christian Life 

Political columnist Cal Thomas prescribes a new vision for 
America that begins with reconsidering the values. 

 
BR-1585 Things We Wish We Had Said 
                  Campolo, Anthony/Barth, W. 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Reflections on different aspects of the father-son relationship. 
Starting with the idea that each failed at some point to 
communicate his feelings to the other. 

 
BR-1556 Thinking and Acting Like a Christian 
                       Lockerbie, D. Bruce 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

The author shows you how the neglected art of thinking 
Christianity about all area of life is a discipline that needs to be 
regained for the betterment of the church. 

BR-599  This is My Story, This is My Song     Hines, Jerome 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 
     Jerome joins the glee club and sings his life story. 
 
BR-3615 This is My Story, This is My Song     Crosby, Franny 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Franny Crosby wrote hymns, songs, poetry, traveled frequently, 
spoke publicly without the aid of eyesight.  

 
BR-1056 This is My Story/This is My Song     Bramer, Mary 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

Stricken with polio as a teenager, an account of triumph over 
handicap, and the power of faith. 

 
BR-2344 This Little Pig               Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Children's book told from the perspective of the animals who 
are the main characters. 

 
BR-1462 This Present Darkness          Peretti, Frank 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Peretti Series; Book 2 of 2 

Ashton is just a typical small town. But when a skeptical 



reporter and prayerful pastor begin to compare notes, they 
suddenly find themselves fighting a hideous New Age plot to 
subjugate the townspeople. 

 
BR-2434 Thorn in the Heart/A           Stafford, Tim 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Who would possibly want to murder a handicapped teenager 
and his three friends? 

 
BR-2594 Thorny Treasures       Hodgson, Mona Gansberg 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Desert Critter Friends Series; Book 
2 of 12 
Lenny, the pack rat, decides to explore the desert alone so he 
won't have to share anything he finds.  

BR-2521 Thousand Shall Fall/A   Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     18 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Shiloh Legacy Series;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Continues the story of Birch Tucker and Max Meyer. Set in the 
time of the stock market crash. 

 
BR-2786 Thread of Hope          Thompson, Faye Hill 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

As the Weaver and Perfecter of hope, God creates a wonderful 
tapestry. 

 
BR-1216 Three from Galilee           Holmes, Marjorie 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

A sports novel that shows what it takes to develop a winning 
spirit.  

 
BR-2496 Three Men in the Fiery Furnace       Olive, Teresa 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-1022 Three Steps Forward-Two Steps Back 
                        Swindoll, Charles 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
BR-2145 Through the Looking Glass & Back 
                   Bondow, Susan/Kelm, Paul 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 



A book on improving our self-image using both Christian and 
psychological principles. The fears we face, the mistakes we 
make, and how we approach life determine our self-image. 

 
BR-3369 Thunder from Jerusalem  Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Zion Legacy Series;  
     Book 2 of 6 

The battle for Jerusalem continues as supplies, ammunition 
and defenders run short. 

BR-2757 Thy Brother's Keeper           Sproul, R. C. 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Two friends whose lives begin together but take very different 
turns. 

 
BR-3436 Tidings of Joy            Daley, Margaret 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Ladies of Sweetwater Lake/The 
Chance Taylor came to repay a debt and didn't foresee having 
feelings for his new landlady and her wheelchair-bound 
daughter. But his secret obligation may just give him the 
chance to start over. 

 
BR-3471 Tie that Binds/The   Boffo, Nancy Otto/Tomblin, Linda 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A collection of devotions that honors the mother/daughter 
relationship. 

 
BR-2710 Tiger Heat              Brouwer, Sigmund 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series; 
     Book 2 of 6 

A group of teenagers calling themselves the Sewer Rats play a 
game of paintball war in the city sewer tunnels. 

 
BR-3116 Tiger Rising/The                DiCamillo, Kate 
     2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

Rob Horton discovers a real tiger in a cage in the woods and 
meets Sistine Bailey the same day. That is the beginning of 
understanding that memories, heartache and tigers can't be 
locked up forever. 

 
BR-2876 Till We Meet Again           Stokes, Penelope 



13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Faith on the Homefront Series 
1944 - Libba learns that Link is alive but paralyzed and doesn't 
know if he will regain use of his legs.  

BR-1689 Tilly                   Peretti, Frank 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction 

Kathy and Don are like any other young couple. No one could 
imagine what secrets lied buried in their souls until Kathy is 
captivated by a simple name, Tilly, a tiny gravestone and their 
lives are changed forever. 

 
BR-2707 Time of Christmas/The     Richterkessing, Suzanne 

1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Mouse Prints: Journey 
Throughout the Church Year; Book 1 of 3 
Helps children learn about the different seasons of the church 
year Advent to Epiphany. 

 
BR-2704 Time of Easter/The      Richterkessing, Suzanne 

1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Mouse Prints: Journey 
Throughout the Church Year; Book 2 of 3 
This volume focuses on Lent, Easter to Ascension Day. 

 
BR-2705 Time of the Church/The    Richterkessing, Suzanne 

1 Volume; Preschool, Children; Mouse Prints: Journey 
Throughout the Church Year; Book 3 of 3 
Focuses on Pentecost, Holy Trinity, Reformation Day. 

 
BR-700  Time of the Singing Birds     Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-3085 Time to Dream/A             Glover, Ruth 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Wildrose Series; Book 3 of 6 

A story of faith, courage, and love in Wildrose, a small frontier 
town in Saskatchewan. 

 
BR-2580 Time to Enjoy Your Blessings    Miley, Dianne Haynes 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
 
 
 
BR-2341 Time to Mourn, a Time to Dance/A  



Metzger, Margaret 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

It is for griever’s as well as persons who want to improve their 
ability to help those who are experiencing a loss. 

 
BR-2982 Timothy Joins Paul            Rottmann, Erik 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2617 Titan Clash             Brouwer, Sigmund 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Sports Mystery Series;  
     Book 4 of 6 
     Jack Spencer gets kicked off the basketball team.  
 
BR-600  To Catch an Angel            Russell, Robert 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

Blinded at age five, Dr. Russell graduated from Yale and Oxford 
(all on scholarships) and achieves his goals. 

 
BR-2703 To Dream Again               John, Sally 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Catherine's life was changed by a frightening incident.  
 
BR-2657 To Know Her by Name            Wick, Lori 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Memories Series; 
Book 3 of 4 
McKay Harrington chases an outlaw into the mountains and 
finds himself wounded and dependent on a woman, who turns 
out to be anything but what he at first suspected. 

 
BR-3413 To Rome with Love        Smith, Debra White 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Seven Sisters Series  
     Book 4 of 7 

Kinkaide Franklin left Melissa Moore at the altar six years ago. 
Now he is back.  

BR-2798 To the Town of Bethlehem 
                    Stockstill, Gloria McQueen 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1841 Tombs of Anak/The           Peretti, Frank 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cooper Kids Adventure 



Series; Book 3 of 4 
Jay, Lila, and their father enter the tombs of Anak and find new 
mysteries, danger and adventure as they stumble onto a 
frightening religion.  

 
BR-2504 Tomorrow's Dream     Oke, Janette/Bunn, T. Davis 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kyle Story/A Series; 
     Book 2 of 2 

Sequel to Another Homecoming. Kyle's life seems perfect. 
 
BR-2235 Too Long a Stranger            Oke, Janette 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 9 
of 12 
Sarah Perry's husband dies and leaves her in a western town. 
She wants more for her daughter so sends her away to school. 

 
BR-3404 Touch and Feel Christmas           Unknown 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3405 Touch and Feel Creation            Unknown 
     1 Volume 
 
BR-2971 Touched by an Angel 
                Williamson, Martha/Sheets, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Tells how the series came to be and then shares many of the 
stories from the series and the response to the shows by the 
actors and the audience. 

BR-2273 Touching the Rock              Hull, John 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

A powerful, poignant memoir of what it is like to go blind and to 
be blind.  

 
BR-1646 Tough Questions Christian Ask        Neff, David 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Jesus left us with the most important truth of all, but he also left 
us with questions the church has been trying to answer ever 
since.  

 
BR-3322 Town that Forgot about Christmas/The  



Leigh, Susan 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

The story of a special visitor who brings a special message to 
remind us what Christmas is all about. 

 
BR-2097 Toy Campaign/The             Bibee, John 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Spirit Flyer Series; Book 2 of 
7 
Armed with only her magic Spirit Flyer bicycle, Susan takes on 
the owner of a toy shop offering free toys to children in order to 
lure them into the Deeper World. 

 
BR-745  Tramp for the Lord          Ten Boom, Corrie 
     3 Volumes; Biography 

The lessons Carrie has learned in God's great classroom she 
shares with you. 

 
BR-2532 Trapped at Haunted Canyon        Biggar, Joan 

4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Megan Parnell Mysteries; Book 4 
of 4 
During a camping trip in Arizona, Megan, her stepbrother Peter, 
and friend Aaron are taken captive by black marketers illegally 
excavating pottery from ancient ruins. 

BR-1636 Trapped at the Bottom of the Sea    Peretti, Frank 
3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Cooper Kids Adventure Series; 
Book 4 of 4 

 
BR-2249 Treasure              Bergren, Lisa Tawn 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Christina determines to find her uncle's sunken ship.  
 
BR-1739 Treasure at Morning Gulch         Biggar, Joan 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Adventure Quest Series; Book 
1 of 4 
12-year-old Jodi finds adventure and spiritual enlightenment 
when she, her brother, and their cousin discover and 
abandoned gold mine in Washington's Cascade Mountains. 

 
BR-2965 Tree for Christmas/A       Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 



This lyrical Christmas book encourages us to see that we need 
a tree for Christmas. 

 
BR-1712 Trial & Error               Grant, George 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

This book contains true stories which discover the ACLU's 
founding and strategy. It exposes their support of legalization of 
child pornography and drugs, prostitution and abortion on 
demand. Issues that affect family life. 

 
BR-3025 Tripping over Skyscrapers     Nentwig, Wendy Lee 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Unmistakably Cooper Ellis; 
Book 1 of 3 
Cooper Ellis has everything: two terrific friends, an exciting life 
in Manhattan, and a chance at a modeling career. Then her 
friends start hanging out with others, rumors are spread about 
her. 

BR-2056 Trouble in a Fur Coat           Oke, Janette 
     2 Volumes; Primary, Fiction 

Told from the perspective of the animals. 
 
BR-2451 Trouble in Yakima Valley          Biggar, Joan 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Megan Parnell Mysteries; 
Book 3 of 4 
Sixteen-year-olds Megan and Peter expose the bullies who are 
sabotaging their uncle's apple harvest and persecuting a 
Hispanic family working in the orchards. 

 
BR-2260 Trouble with a Capital T           Baer, Judy 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Cedar River Daydream 
Series; Book 2 of 12 
Deals with popularity, teen pregnancy, child abuse. 

 
BR-3441 Trouble with Tulip/The       Clark, Mindy Stearns 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Smart Chick Mystery;  
     Book 1 of 3 

A mismatched duo works to solve a local murder.  
 
BR-3360 Troublesome Creek             Watson, Jan 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 



Copper loves life on Troublesome Creek. 
 
BR-3057 True Believers               Dorrell, Linda 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

1950's heiress Peggy Nickles buys an old church, cemetery 
and will give it to Otha Lee Sturgis and his black congregation if 
he helps repair it.  

 
BR-3521 True Valor               Henderson, Dee 

9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Uncommon Heroes Series Book 2 of 
3 
Lt. Grace Yates is an F/A18 Hornet pilot flying dangerous 
missions.  

BR-1509 Trusting God              Bridges, Jerry 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Jerry Bridges delivers an uplifting challenge to trust in God, who 
alone will lovingly carry you through. 

 
BR-2445 Truth about Angels/The  

Lutheran Laymen's League 
     1 Volume; Christian Life 
      
BR-3051 Truth Seeker/The           Henderson, Dee 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; O'Malley Series; Book 3 of 6 

Lisa O'Malley is a forensic pathologist who must find a 
connection between deaths of five women.  

 
BR-2170 Truth Twister/The                          Berry, Harold 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Berry exposes and examines the doctrines and beliefs of more 
than a dozen current religions. 
 

BR-3415 Truth Will Set You Free/The     Hoard, Samuel L. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Autobiography 

Anecdotes reveal subtleties and cruelties of racism in society 
and church. 

 
BR-1550 Truth Will Set Your Free/The    Buckingham, Jamie 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Renowned storyteller and master satirist, Jamie goes behind 



the scenes to name names and talk about hilarious incidents.  
 
BR-3272 Tuesday's Child             Chaiken, Linda 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Day to Remember Series; Book 2 of 
5 
Valli Chataine, a star in the Paris Ballet Company, must flee 
Paris before German occupation and return to French Algeria. 

BR-3081 Tumbling Blocks            Boeshaar, Andrea 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Sewing Circle Book;  
     Book 1 of 4 

A marriage is arranged for Elsa, but her future husband 
disregards God and antagonizes her. 

 
BR-2654 Turn Northward, Love           Glover, Ruth 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Wildrose Series; Book 4 of 6 

Three people are at a crossroads that will test their fortitude 
and faith in God. 

 
BR-2351 Turn toward the Wind      Bourke, Dale Hanson 
     5 Volumes; Christian Life 

Change is something we all resist. 
 
BR-1686 Turning Hearts toward Home      Zettersten, Rolf 
     5 Volumes; Biography 

A behind-the-scenes look at the family man, Dr. James 
Dobson.  

 
BR-1792 Twas the Fight before Christmas      Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 9 of 9 

Nicholas and McGee go through some very situations which 
help them find the real meaning of Christmas.  

 
BR-607  Twelve Christ Chose/The         Smith, Asbury 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
 
BR-2078 Twelve Who Followed         Huxhold, Harry 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Short capsule stories about the disciples of Jesus as taken from 
Scripture. How they became followers, what their personalities 
were like, and what role they played. 



 
 
 
BR-2573 Twenty-first Century Spirituality  

Frederickson, Bruce 
3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Christian Perspective Series 
God's Word remains unchanged even as we face the 
challenges of attitudes, idolatry, and other religions. 

 
BR-2695 Twenty-one Ponies            Byrd, Sandra 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Secret Sisters; Book 2 of 8 

Tess discovers that forgiveness isn't something you earn. 
 
BR-3557 Twilight of Courage/The  

Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
     13 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-1761 Twister and Shout              Myers, Bill 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Fiction; McGee and Me; Book 5 of 9 

Nick's parents are gone for the evening and he and his sister 
and two friends are left alone when a tornado strikes their city.  

 
BR-2192 Two Sides of Love/The    Smalley, Gary/Trent, John 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

This book examines the hard and soft sides of love in 
relationships with spouse, children and those around us. 

 
BR-1822 Two-Gether               Gedde, Palmer 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

10 Chapters giving helps to strengthen your marriage.   
 
BR-2499 Ulterior Motives            Blackstock, Terri 

10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sun Coast Chronicles Series; Book 
3 of 4 
Art dealer Louis Debose is murdered. Prime suspect is Ben 
Robinson. Sharon Robinson knows he is capable of ruining 
lives, but not of murder. 

BR-2890 Unafraid         Rivers, Francine/Lynch, Peggy 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Story of Mary, mother of Jesus.  



 
BR-2936 Unashamed        Rivers, Francine/Lynch, Peggy 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Outline is Biblical, some dialogue, action and characters 
consistent with Biblical record, are added to aid understanding 
of message. 

 
BR-3507 Unchanging Truth in Changing Times 
                      Barry, Rev. Dr. A. L. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

Answers many questions people are asking about the Christian 
faith and Lutheranism. 

 
BR-1643 Uncle Arthur's Storytime I       Maxwell, Arthur 
     2 Volumes; Children 

A collection of true stories illustrating values of honesty, love, 
faith, respect, compassion, and cooperation. 

 
BR-1782 Uncle Arthur's Storytime III      Maxwell, Arthur 
     2 Volumes; Children 

Illustrates important values. 
 
BR-2427 Under Eastern Stars           Chaikin, Linda 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Heart of India Series; 
     Book 2 of 3 

Two very different men wait in her shadows. Coral must choose 
whom to trust and the decision will determine the course of her 
future. 

 
BR-3513 Under God's Sky           Hardison, John R. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Collected anecdotes about living as a Christian in today's world. 
BR-2202 Undercover                Stahl, Hilda 

2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Amber Ainslie Detective Series; 
Book 3 of 4 
Amber Ainslie, private detective, must work undercover to hunt 
for a possible murderer. 

 
BR-2881 Undercover Angel          Rutledge, Cynthia 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Love Inspired 



Police officer Angel Morelli goes undercover to save teens from 
a drug ring. Posing as a student, she never expects to fall in 
love with the history teacher. 

 
BR-2530 Understanding Alcoholism and Related Issues 
                        Various Authors 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 

20 Bible studies on alcoholism, addictions, child abuse, and 
other issues. 

 
BR-3087 Unexplained/The         Halbert, Christopher 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Faith on the Edge Series 

Topical Bible Study miracles. 
 
BR-3088 Unforgotten             Heitzmann, Kristen 
     12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Michelli Family Series;  
     Book 2 of 3 

Sequel to Secrets. Lance Michelli tries to unravel the family 
secrets before his grandmother Antonia dies. He and Rose 
Barrett travel to New York from Sonoma to follow the trail. 

 
BR-3106 Unhappy Appy          Mackall, Dandi Daley 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler; Book 5 
of 6 
Everyone is pairing off and Winnie wants a best friend too. But 
she is going to have to solve the mystery of her friend Harok 
and her horses before that happens. 

BR-2505 Union Army Black              Travis, L. 
     4 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Ben and Zack Series 

A 12 year old boy who has watched the Civil War for four 
bloody years enlists as a drummer boy in the Union. 

 
BR-2208 Union Belle/The             Morris, Gilbert 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; House of Winslow Series;  
     Book 11 of 13 

Forced to shoot a man he plans a jailbreak with the help of Lola 
Montez who is attempting to escape the saloon life she dreads.  

 
BR-611  Unique World of Women/The       Price, Eugenia 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 



 
BR-922  Unity in Marriage              Fields, W. 
     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-2807 Until the Christ Child Came    Mackall, Dandi Daley 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1454 Unto the Hills              Graham, Ruth 
     12 Volumes; Devotion 
 
BR-2696 Unveiled               Rivers, Francine 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

The story of Tamar, daughter-in-law of Judah, who risked her 
life to be the woman she was called to be.  

 
BR-3488 Unwrapping Christmas          Copeland, Lori 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Rose has planned the perfect family Christmas, but as they 
start drifting away Rose is slowed down in a most unexpected 
way, which allows the family to discover the true meaning of 
giving. 

 
BR-1172 Unwrapping Your Spiritual Gifts     Hubbard, David 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A look at Biblical "gifts lists" and their meaning. 
 
BR-1457 Velveteen Rabbit/The        Williams, Margery 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 
 
BR-2735 Very First Christians/The           Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

This time Christopher's grandfather teaches him about the 
drama of Pentecost.  

 
BR-2401 Very First Christmas/The          Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Primary, Braille/Print 

Chris learns the answers to some challenging questions about 
the Christmas story. 

 
BR-2963 Very First Christmas/The          Maier, Paul 



     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
God's plan to bring forgiveness and salvation to all.  

 
BR-3033 Very First Easter/The            Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Primary, Christian Faith 

Focus of Easter on the truth of God's story.  
 
BR-2962 Very First Easter/The            Maier, Paul 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

The true story of God's plan to bring forgiveness and salvation 
to all people through His Son, Jesus Christ. 

 
BR-3423 Veterans Way            Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Hart's Crossing; Book 2 of 4 

Widower Jimmy Scott returns to Hart's Crossing and meets his 
childhood sweetheart of 50 years ago. Could the friendship they 
are forming turn into something more? And how will their 
families react if it does? 

 
BR-3512 Violet Comes to Stay    Karon, Jan/Cecka, Melanie 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Mitford for Children 

The story of Cynthia Coopersmith's cat Violet and her antics in 
various situations. 
 

BR-2940 Visitor/The                 Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; English Garden Series;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Alexander Tate is left with bandaged eyes after a fall from a 
horse. His Aunt Harriat hires one of the Steele sisters to read to 
him and sparks new light in his heart.  

 
BR-3422 Vocation                 Hoover, Chad 

2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; Lutheran Spirituality Series/The 
Bible Study on our vocation.  

 
BR-1877 Vow of Silence                Hoff, B. J. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Witney Sharyn's past has driven her to the sanctuary of 
Shepherd Valley.  
 



BR-3579 Vow Unbroken/A             Rognlie, Amy 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Prairie Brides Book; 
     Book 4 of 4 
 
BR-1655 Voyage of the Dawn Treader/The      Lewis, C. S. 
     3 Volumes; Children; Chronicles of Narnia Series;  
     Book 5 of 7 
 
BR-1847 Wake Up America          Campolo, Anthony 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

A challenge to all Christians to involve themselves in grass-root 
ministries that work for change in America.   

 
BR-3399 Walk, Don't Run             Griffin, Pamela 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Tails of Love; Book 2 of 4 

A barking dog leads Jake to Kerry's rescue when she gets 
locked outside on a balcony. Kerry seeks a vet to help an 
injured dog and the vet turns out to be Jake. 

 
BR-3544 Walk/The                 Card, Michael 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

Woven throughout are accounts of how Jesus mentored His 
own disciples.  

 
BR-1029 Walking Among the Unseen     Hurnard, Hannah 
     3 Volumes; Biography 
 
BR-2771 Walking in Total God-Confidence    Partow, Donna 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

God-confidence is the absolute assurance that God can 
accomplish whatever He wants through whomever He chooses 
regardless of upbringing, circumstances or past failures. 

 
BR-2262 Walking with Christ in the Details of Life 
                         Morley, Patrick 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

How to put Christ first in every area of your life including job, 
finances, and relationships.  

 
BR-1738 Walking with My Lord - Poems     Sakuma, Stefanie 



     1 Volume; Poetry 
 
BR-2207 Walks the Fire            Whitson, Stephanie 

11 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Prairie 
Winds-Whitson; Book 1 of 3 
Jesse King starts the westward pioneer trip to Oregon but along 
the way loses her son and husband and is captured by the 
Lakota Indians on the Nebraska prairie.   

BR-3414 Wall of Fog            Gonzales, Thomas A. 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

As a man with blindness, Tom Gonzales shows how to cope 
with the challenge of life.  

 
BR-2762 War Paint                 Byrd, Sandra 
     2 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Secret Sisters; Book 6 of 8 

Should she compete in an all-out mural painting contest with 
secret sister Erin or run for "Miss Coronado?” 

 
BR-3047 Warrior/The              Rivers, Francine 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Sons of Encouragement;  
     Book 2 of 5 

Historical fiction about the life of Caleb, one of the men who 
scouted out the Promised Land. 

 
BR-2855 Waterfalls                 Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series;  
     Book 6 of 8 

When Meredith Graham, acquisitions editor for a publishing 
company, meets Jacob Wilde, actor, she loses her cool and 
ruins everything.  

 
BR-3455 Ways to Grow              Weisheit, Eldon 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
 
BR-2900 We Brake for Joy           Clairmont, Patsy/ 
           Johnson, Barbara/Meberg, Marilyn/Swindoll 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 
     90 devotions to add laughter, fun and faith to your life. 
 
BR-2454 Web of Deception              Peart, Jane 



8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Edgecliffe Manor Mysteries; Book 1 
of 2 

     Rachel Penniston is a governess in an isolated mansion. 
 
BR-1427 Weight of Glory/The            Lewis, C. S. 
     2 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-1511 Weird Soccer Match/The         Jenkins, Jerry 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Baker Street Sports Club 
Series 
It seems that the Baker Street Sports Club has everything 
stacked against them. A player who has never played before 
and angry parents and a referee who seems to hope they lose. 
Another adventure with the gang. 

 
BR-3056 Welcome to Fred          Whittington, Brad 
     6 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction 

When Mark Cloud's pastor father moved his family from a 
metropolitan area to small-town Fred, Texas, he faces culture 
shock and a whole new world of experiences. 

 
BR-3554 Westward the Dream   Pella, Judith/Peterson, Tracie 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Ribbons West; Book 1 of 3 

Amid the deadly conflict of the Civil War, a new generation sets 
forth to expand the railroad west. Will a dream to find gold turn 
into tragedy? Will a young Irish girl find romance along the 
way? 

 
BR-3563 What Do I Do Now, Lord?         Jones, Chris 
     1 Volume; Preteen, Devotion; Young Readers Series 

Story devotions for pre-teen boys about everyday growing up 
experiences applicable through the ages. 

 
BR-3375 What Happened to Merry Christmas?  

Baker, Robert C. 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children 

When Sam is invited to a "holiday" party he worries that the 
celebration of Jesus' birth has been lost. His mother helps him 
learn the real meaning of Christmas. 

BR-1612 What Happened When Grandma Died   Barker, Peggy 



     1 Volume; Children 
 
BR-2162 What Kids Need Most in a Mom     Rushford, Patricia 
     7 Volumes; Christian Life 

Tells what kids need most in a parent, not what the parent 
needs from the child.  

 
BR-2339 What More is There to Say...Amen  
                      Hoffman, Dr. Oswald 
     6 Volumes; Autobiography 

The autobiography of Dr. Oswald C. J. Hoffmann,  
 

BR-3560 What She Left for Me         Peterson, Tracie 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Jana McGuire is devastated by her husband's infidelity, her 
faith shaken and her future grim. But she finds a glimmer of 
hope and the promise of God's faithfulness. 

 
BR-2312 What to Do Until the Psychiatrist Comes  Phillips, Bob 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

Provides a step-by-step plan for working through problems on 
your own, using the Bible as your guide. It will help you 
overcome personal problems and regain a healthy view of life. 

 
BR-2315 What Would Jesus Do?          Sheldon, Morris 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A contemporary retelling of Charles M. Sheldon's classic IN HIS 
STEPS. 

 
BR-1487 Whatever Happened to Ordinary Christians 
                          Smoke, Jim 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Provides sound Biblical basis for the importance of self-esteem. 
BR-2154 Whatever Tomorrow Brings         Wick, Lori 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Californians Series;  
     Book 1 of 4 

Kaitlin Donovan and her family leave missionary life in Hawaii 
to bring her ill mother to California. She and her brother and 
sister are left alone to build a new life when her mother dies 
and her father returns to Hawaii. 



 
BR-3067 What's Happening to Grandpa?     Shriver, Maria 
     1 Volume; Primary, Christian Life 

Helping a young child understand the aging of a grandparent 
with Alzheimers. 

 
BR-3461 What's So Amazing About Grace?    Yancey, Philip 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Yancey takes a probing look at grace. 
 
BR-2113 Wheeler's Big Move           Schantz, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Wheeler's Adventures; Book 12 of 
12 
When Dad decides to accept a job offer in Kansas City, Sonny 
and Earnest team up to try to change his mind 

 
BR-1840 Wheeler's Special Gift          Schantz, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Wheeler's Adventures; Book 10 of 
12 
During a hot dry spell in July, the Wheeler family decides to 
celebrate Christmas. 

 
BR-2165 Wheeler's Swap             Schantz, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Wheeler's Adventures; Book 11 of 
12 
Sonny and Earnest show cousin Buddy the advantages of living 
in the country. 

 
 
BR-1820 Wheeler's Treasure           Schantz, Daniel 

1 Volume; Preteen, Children; Wheeler's Adventures; Book 9 of 
12 
The Wheeler brothers, Sonny and Earnest go to a nearby 
abandoned mining town to search for a treasure. 
 

BR-2683 When Addictions Threaten      Knippel, Charles T. 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; Christian Care Series 

How do you stop the stronghold of addiction from ruining your 
life, or the life of a loved one or church. 

 



BR-1209 When Breaks the Dawn          Oke, Janette 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Canadian West Series;  
     Book 3 of 6 

Having survived the harshness of their first year in the far 
Northwest, Elizabeth and Wynn now face new challenges, 
make new friends, and start a new school. 

 
BR-1234 When Calls the Heart           Oke, Janette 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Canadian West Series;  
     Book 1 of 6 

Nothing in her cultured East Coast upbringing prepared 
Elizabeth for a teaching position. 

 
BR-3297 When Can I Start Dating?      Watkins, James N. 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Christian Life; Why Files/The; Book 1 
of 3 
Helpful information about self and the opposite sex regarding 
dating.  

 
BR-2125 When Choice Becomes God       Smith, F Lagard 
     4 Volumes; Christian Life 

For the pro-choice generation, choice has become the supreme 
right. As a result, escalating divorce rates, rampant drug use, 
and abortion on demand now threaten our society. 

BR-1293 When Comes the Spring          Oke, Janette 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Canadian West Series;  
     Book 2 of 6 

Elizabeth's Royal Canadian Mountie had given her his heart, 
but could she care for it as tenderly and carefully as he cared 
for her? 

 
BR-2437 When Dreams Cross          Blackstock, Terri 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Second Chance Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Justin Pierce and Andi Sherman join forces in construction of 
an amusement park, Promised Land. But bitterness and love 
prove to be their greatest challenge. 

 
BR-2120 When God Doesn't Make Sense      Dobson, James 
     7 Volumes; Christian Life 



Deals with the troubling question of life.  
 
BR-2460 When God Weeps        Tada, Joni/Estes, Steve 
     5 Volumes; Bible Study 

The authors reveal a God big enough to understand our 
suffering; wise enough to allow it; and powerful enough to use it 
for a greater good than we can ever imagine. 

 
BR-1415 When Hearts Awaken           Bacher, June 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 3 of 6 
 
BR-1318 When Hope Springs New          Oke, Janette 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Canadian West Series;  
     Book 4 of 6 

Beth and Wynn move West and confront adventures. 
 
BR-2922 When I'm on My Knees     Donihue, Anita Corrine 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

A collection of prayers, devotional thoughts, poems and hymns 
as we turn to God in prayers of praise. 

BR-3371 When Jesus was Born          Hartman, Sara 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book 
 
BR-1657 When Life is Unfair           Richards, Larry 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Joni shows how God's constant presence can bring peace, 
perspective, and healing into the puzzling and even chaotic 
circumstances of your life. 

 
BR-1506 When Morning Comes Again        Bacher, June 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer Series; Book 5 of 6 

Courtney and Clint, tucked in with sorrows, experience joys that 
God has planned to strengthen their lives. 

 
BR-3318 When the Last Leaf Falls           Myers, Bill 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A celebration of family and faith filled with laughter and tears. 
 
BR-2671 When the Lilacs Bloom           Kirby, Susan 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Libby Watson Series 



Libby and her husband disagree about when to have a family. 
She helps him heal old wounds and they both realize there's 
nothing more important than a family. 

 
BR-2597 When things go Wrong         Rogness, Alvin 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; Book of Comfort Series 
     Words of assurance and encouragement in times of trial. 
 
BR-3048 When Tomorrow Comes          Oke, Janette 

5 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Canadian West Series; Book 
6 of 6 
Christine Delaney is recovering from a broken relationship and 
she is filled with uncertainties about life, her part in WW II 
efforts and memories of her youth that are interfering with her 
future. 

 
BR-3054 When Tragedy Strikes         Stanley, Charles 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life 

How to respond when tragedy strikes as it did Sept. 11, 2001. 
 
BR-2598 When You are Afraid           Rogness, Alvin 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; Book of Comfort Series 
     Words of assurance and encouragement in times of trial. 
 
BR-2651 When You are Suffering         Rogness, Alvin 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; Book of Comfort Series 
     Words of assurance and encouragement in times of trial. 
 
BR-2139 When You Can't Come Back      Drovecky, D. & J. 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

The story of struggle and courage shown by the Dravecky's 
when they found Dave's arm had to be amputated and there 
would not be a comeback into baseball.   

 
BR-2021 When You Can't See a Way        Burke, Theta 
     1 Volume; Adult, Poetry 
 
BR-2652 When You Have Doubts         Rogness, Alvin 

1 Volume; Adult, Christian Life; Book of Comfort Series; Book 4 
of 4 



     Words of encouragement and assurance in times of trial. 
 
BR-3606 When Your Baby Dies  
               Gamino, Louis A/Cooney, Ann Taylor 
     1 Volume; Adult, Christian Faith 

Handling the grief of losing a child and how to go on afterward. 
 
 

BR-2378 When Your Rope Breaks          Brown, Steve 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Pastor Brown uses Biblical examples as he grapples with the 
reality of pain in a fallen world. The Bible offers assurance that 
God hurts with His people, and some day He will end all 
suffering. 

 
BR-3312 Where Do Angels Sleep?         Strong, Cynda 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

This bedtime book answers important questions about angels 
and what they do. A wonderful explanation about our heavenly 
guardians that will delight and reassure children ages 4 and up. 

 
BR-2859 Where in the World is God?      Senkbeil, Harold 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Devotions for Christians searching for hope and healing in the 
rubble of their lives. 

 
BR-1484 Where the Brave Dare Not Go       Gilbert, Lela 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Biography 

This dramatic, inspiring story of answered prayer attests to the 
truth that God has the whole world in His hands. You will read 
about a man with severe learning disabilities who has 
performed miracles by trusting God's strength.   

 
BR-2266 Where the Wild Rose Blooms         Wick, Lori 

12 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Memories Series; 
Book 1 of 4 
Clayton Taggart dreams of the day when he can leave mine 
surveying to become a teacher. Then he meets Jackie 
Fontaine, whose strong-willed spirit causes friction from the 
start. Just as love ignites, tragedy strikes. 



 
 
BR-707  Where Two Ways Met       Hill, Grace Livingston 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 
 
BR-2158 Whirlwind/The               Myers, Bill 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Journeys to Fayrah Series; 
Book 3 of 5 
Three children find themselves caught in a cross-dimensional 
struggle between their new friends in the land of Fayrah who 
serve the good and loving Imager, and several evil beings. 

 
BR-2243 Whisper and a Wish/A           Gunn, Robin 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christy Miller Series; Book 2 
of 6 
When her family relocates to California, fifteen-year-old Christy 
Miller faces new dreams and disappointments as she decides 
what price she's willing to pay for making new friends. 

 
BR-2275 Whispers                 Gunn, Robin 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series;  
     Book 2 of 8 

Teri went to Maui hoping to start a relationship with one special 
man. But romance becomes much more complicated when she 
finds herself enjoying the attention of three. 

 
BR-3599 Whispers from Yesterday       Hatcher, Robin Lee 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Penniless after her father's suicide, socialite Karen Butler seeks 
refuge at the camp for at-risk boys owned by the grandmother 
she has never met. She's unhappy with her new life but the 
kindness and quiet faith of her grandmother, Sophia, and 
Dusty, the handsome director of the camp, touch her deeply. 

 
BR-3540 Whispers in the Valley          Wubbels, Lance 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Gentle Hills Series;  
     Book 2 of 4 
 
BR-2994 Whispers of Love              Cote, Lyn 

8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Blessed Assurance Series; 



Book 1 of 3 
Date 1871 the story of Jessie Wagstaff, a young widow, single 
mother in Chicago, coping with the loss of her husband.  

 
BR-2376 Whispers of Moonlight            Wick, Lori 

14 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Rocky Mountain Memories Series; 
Book 2 of 4 
A story of commitment, faith, and unconditional love between 
Rebecca Wagner and Travis Buchanan. 

 
BR-3614 Whispers of the Bayou       Clark, Mindy Stearns 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Follow one woman's search through hidden rooms of a bayou 
mansion 

 
BR-1278 White Flower/The         Hill, Grace Livingston 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A story of mystery, romance, and high adventure, as two young 
people try to escape. 

 
BR-1430 White Trail/The             Davoll, Barbara 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Children 
 
BR-2436 Who Brings Forth the Wind         Wick, Lori 
     14 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kensington Chronicles;  
     Book 3 of 4 

Stacy's visit to her aunt in London society catapults her into 
balls, teas, and an unexpected meeting with Lord Tanner 
Richardson.  

BR-2511 Who Kidnaped Jesus?        Erwin, Vicki Berger 
1 Volume; Young Adult, Fiction; Elizabeth Bryan Mysteries; 
Book 6 of 6 
As Elizabeth crafts the church Christmas play, she realizes that 
the kidnapper is following her, step by step. What does the next 
scene have in store for Elizabeth, the kidnapper, and Jesus? 

 
BR-2834 Who Says That?            Lloyd-Jones, Sally 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Children will have fun finding the surprises hidden throughout 
this whimsical Lift-the-Flap book as they meet some Bible 



friends and learn about how God loves and cares for us. 
 
BR-1277 Who Speaks for God?          Colson, Charles 

4 Volumes; Christian Life; Reflections on the moral and social 
issues of the 1980's. 

 
BR-1368 Who Switched the Price Tags?    Campolo, Anthony 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 
 
BR-2835 Who’s Hiding?             Lloyd-Jones, Sally 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

Children will have fun finding the surprises hidden throughout 
this whimsical Lift-the-Flap book as they meet some Bible 
friends and learn about how God loves and cares for us. 

 
BR-2690 Whoo! Moo! Cock-a-Doodle-doo! 
                   Tangvald, Christine Harder 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-1603 Who's in Charge Here?        Huffman, John Jr. 
     4 Volumes; Bible Study 
 
BR-2955 Who's the Greatest?           Bergt, Carolyn 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 

Jesus talks about greatness.  
 
BR-2535 Whose Nose? Whose Toes?      Reinertson, Debbie 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 

During the first few years, everything is a new discovery for 
children.  

 
BR-2102 Why America Doesn't Work 
                  Colson, Charles/Eckerd, Jack 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Colson and Eckerd show how the work ethic was stripped of its 
spiritual meaning and roots.  

 
BR-3049 Why I Am a Lutheran           Preus, Daniel 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Book explores the foundational teachings of the Christian 



church through Scriptural understandable explanations. 
 
BR-2800 Why I Love You, God     Adams, Michelle Medlock 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3284 Why I Praise You, God     Adams, Michelle Medlock 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3282 Why I Thank You, God     Adams, Michelle Medlock 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-3283 Why I Trust You, God     Adams, Michelle Medlock 
     1 Volume; Preschool, Braille/Print 
 
BR-2054 Why isn't God Giving Cash Prizes   Peterson, Lorraine 
     3 Volumes; Young Adult, Bible Study  

A thirteen-week program of devotional study exploring the 
existence and nature of God.  

BR-1880 Why You Should Believe in the Trinity 
                       Bowman, Robert Jr. 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

A simple and clearly written explanation of the Biblical basis for 
faith in a triune God. Offers concise and easily understood 
definition of often ambiguous terms and concepts. 

 
BR-3122 Why, God?              Swindoll, Charles 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Words of faith and hope from a renowned pastor who points us 
to Scriptures and eternal truths that can calm. 

 
BR-3427 Widow's Offering/The          Bader, Joanne 
     1 Volume; Primary, Arch Book; Arch Books 

Mark 12:41-44 and Luke 21:1-4 for children  
Emphasizes love and trust of the giver rather than the size of 
the gift.  

 
BR-2957 Wild Thing            Mackall, Dandi Daley 

3 Volumes; Preteen, Fiction; Winnie the Horse Gentler; Book 1 
of 6 
12-year-old Winnie Willis loves horses like her deceased 



mother. But since her death they've moved five times.  
 
BR-2878 Wildflowers                Gunn, Robin 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series;  
     Book 8 of 8 

Genevieve Adren's dream of owning a café is coming true, but 
with her pilot husband gone so much she is alone to make the 
decisions.  

 
BR-2740 Wind                   Miller, Calvin 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Snow Series; Book 2 of 4 

Isabel McCaslin determines to set an example for others by 
"doing God's business" even if it provokes wrath. 

BR-2236 Wind in the Wheat/The          Arvin, Reed 
     14 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

A young Gospel singer is discovered in a little Kansas church. 
He goes to Nashville to become a witness to the Lord through 
his music, but finds that the music becomes business rather 
than ministry. 

 
BR-1418 Winds of Autumn/The           Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Season of the Heart Series; 
     Book 2 of 4 

Continues the story of Josh and his aunt Lou. Grandpa and 
Charlie are overheard by josh talking about finding a fella for 
Lou and josh gets upsets and acts out instead of talking to 
someone about it. 

 
BR-2149 Winds of Catawba             Stahl, Laurie 
     8 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The Marston family has moved into their new plantation home 
in South Carolina. Kendra and Laurel Marston find that love and 
life are never easy, but that God's timing is always perfect. 

 
BR-2386 Winds of Graystone Manor          Hoff, B. J. 
     10 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; St. Clare Trilogy Series; 
     Book 1 of 3 

Amanda Fairchild owns a secluded resort hotel. A stranger, 
Roman St. Clare, arrives at a time of great mystery on the 
island. Niles Rutherford is a physician and Amanda's 



self-proclaimed protector. 
 
BR-2663 Wings of the Morning            Wick, Lori 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Kensington Chronicles;  
     Book 2 of 4 

Story of rival sea captains who learn how God can turn life's 
temporary misfortunes into lifelong blessings. 

 
BR-2842 Winning Friends for Christ        Sims, Carolyn 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study; New Life Series 

Shows you how to bring to your friends the Good News that 
they have been won by the blood of Jesus Christ. 

 
BR-1464 Winter is Not Forever           Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life; Season of the Heart Series; 
Book 3 of 4 
The story of a young man struggling through the decisions of 
what he thinks God wants him to do with his life. Some 
heartaches and some surprises are in store for him. 

 
BR-3564 Winterflight                Bayly, Joseph 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction  

Imagine an America where abortion is the rule for imperfect 
fetuses and euthanasia is mandatory at age 75. 

 
BR-1473 Winter's Promise/A           Gilge, Jeanette 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Pioneer; Book 1 of 3 
     Amid hardships, a mother of four finds strength in her faith in 

God and experiences the richness of His blessings when help 
finally comes and a young school teacher moves in with her 
family.  

 
BR-3327 Wise and Foolish Builders/The      Burgdorf, Larry 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
     A parable of Jesus about building on solid ground. 
 
BR-3583 Wishing Jar/The            Stokes, Penelope 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

The Wishing Jar. It's a family heirloom, with a magical legend 
attached. But Abby, Edith and Neal Grace know the Wishing 



Jar isn't really magic.  
 
BR-1988 Wishing Star/The             Wells, Marion 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Starlight Trilogy Series;  
     Book 1 of 3 

Jenny is a bright and inquisitive nineteenth-century girl.  
Surrounded by poverty and abuse, she escapes into the world 
of books.  

 
BR-2775 With Love from Bliss             Glover, Ruth 

6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saskatchewan Saga Series; Book 2 
of 5 
Karen Happuch Ferne travels to Bliss on a mission of revenge 
and takes Gladdy McBean as a companion. But when she finds 
the truth, it changes her whole outlook and renews her faith. 

 
BR-1642 With My Whole Heart           Mains, Karen 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life  

Presents a collection of true stories illustrating the values of 
honesty, love, faith, respect, compassion, and cooperation. 
Includes activities which reinforce the lessons learned in each 
story. 

 
BR-3421 With This Ring              Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 6 
of 12 
As Sierra journeys to California for Song and Tracy's wedding, 
she ponders first kisses, lifetime commitments and pledges of 
love. 

 
BR-2175 With Wings as Eagles          Schulte, Elaine 

5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; California Pioneer Series;  
     Book 4 of 4 

Betsy Talbot must leave her father's home for the wild 
California gold rush country. Believing the Lord can use her as 
a schoolteacher, she encounters danger, disappointment, and a 
relationship that threatens her. 

BR-2009 Within the Shadow           Chapin, Shelley 
     4 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Shelley Chapin is diagnosed with cancer and given 9-months to 



live. She survives, but with much pain and suffering.  
 
BR-3396 Without a Doubt              Gunn, Robin 

3 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Sierra Jensen Series; Book 5 
of 12 
Sierra leans that emotions can get very confused in 
relationships and only God can help sort them out.  

 
BR-3546 Witness              Schulz, Klaus Detlev 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Bible Study 
     Lutheran Spirituality Series/The 
 
BR-1064 Witness/The            Hill, Grace Livingston 

7 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Classic Series by Grace Livingston 
Hill; Book 10 of 14 

 
BR-1806 Woman Named Damaris/A         Oke, Janette 

4 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Women of the West Series; Book 4 
of 12 
Escaping an abusive and drunken father, Damaris leaves home 
with her two treasures - her grandmothers golden brooch and 
her grandfathers watch.  

 
BR-2172 Woman Who Cared/The        Drickamer, John 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

Centered around Leona, a widow with four children, these 
twenty-five chapters teach lessons in caring. 

 
BR-2529 Woman, Thou Art Loosed          Jakes, T. D. 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 

Many women who have been through trauma and adversity are 
seeking answers to find purpose. 

BR-2817 Woman's Journey to the Heart of God/A 
                         Heald, Cynthia 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Faith 

Puts our spiritual journey into perspective with the knowledge 
that the journey is a process. 

 
BR-3534 Woman's Place/A              Cox, Carol 
     1 Volume; Adult, Fiction; Yellow Roses Book; 



     Book 1 of 4 
 
BR-2415 Women at the Window          Jenkins, Jerry 
     6 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Margo Mysteries; Book 1 of 8 

Philip Spence finds a young woman about to jump to her death. 
Is his faith strong enough to give her a reason to live? Bit by bit 
Philip puts the pieces together and finds himself facing 
unexpected dangers. 

 
BR-2173 Women of Catawba/The          Stahl, Hilda 
     5 Volumes; Adult, Fiction 

Set in post-Revolutionary War days, this is a story of men and 
women whose faith, strength, and capacity to love are tested to 
the limit. This is Hilda Stahl's last novel before her death. 

 
BR-1890 Women of the New Testament    Kuyper, Abraham 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Devotion 

Gives 30 graphic character sketches that radiate scriptural 
insight. Each character study is based on a text. 

 
BR-1378 Women through the Bible        Taege, Marlys 
     3 Volumes; Bible Study 

48 devotions for Women’s Groups that invite them to put their 
feet in the sandals of women in the Old and New Testament. 
Each becomes a friend, not just a character. 

 
BR-3036 Woodlands                Gunn, Robin 
     9 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Glenbrooke Series;  
     Book 7 of 8 

Leah Hudson loves to give. But when others want to give back, 
it's another story. Can she trust Seth Edwards' motives or 
should she believe former classmate lawyer Collin Radcliffe in 
regard to her new inheritance. 

 
BR-1273 Words that Hurt, Words that Heal    Mayhall, Carole 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

A call to verbal purity that addresses such areas as bragging, 
carelessness, anger, complaining, slander. 

 
BR-646  World's ...Collection of Jokes        Phillips, Bob 



     3 Volumes; Christian Faith 
 
BR-2335 World's Fair/The              Tedrow, T. L. 

3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Days of Laura Ingalls Wilder Series; 
Book 5 of 8 
When Laura is assigned to report on the St. Louis World's Fair, 
she also writes about the Third Olympic Games in St. Louis. 

 
BR-2507 Worth of a Man/The     Dravecky, Dave/Neal, C. W. 
     7 Volumes; Adult, Christian Life 
     Family, Career, Financial stability. Good things to have. 
 
BR-1972 Year of the Grizzly/The  

Thoene, Bodie/Thoene, Brock 
3 Volumes; Adult, Fiction; Saga of the Sierras Series; Book 6 of 
7 
As American military and Mexican Bandits attempt to grab the 
wealth of central California's cattle ranches, Will Reed's family 
is caught in the middle.  

 
BR-2253 Yes, You Can, Heather!          Gray, Daphne 
     4 Volumes; Biography 

The story of Heather Whitestone, Miss America 1995, as told 
by her mother. A living example of faith, hope, and 
perseverance in overcoming the obstacles of deafness. 

 
BR-1572 Yet Will I Trust Him            Rankin, Peg 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

A compassionate guide that will help you yield to God's will 
even when it's hard to accept, and face life. 

 
BR-1725 You are Loved                Kern, Alma 
     2 Volumes; Adult, Poetry 

89 poems on love and Christian living. 
 
BR-2325 You are Precious               Kern, Alma 
     3 Volumes; Adult, Poetry; Religious poetry. 
 
BR-1793 You are Special               Kern, Alma 
     2 Volumes; Devotion 



     Meditation that will help you build your self-esteem. 
 
BR-2470 You are Special to Jesus       Dellinger, Annette 
     1 Volume; Primary, Fiction 
 
BR-1499 You are What You Say           Mains, Karen 
     3 Volumes; Christian Life 

How to diagnose mouth disease, prescribes rehabilitation 
steps, and gives measurements for recovery.  

 
BR-2164 You Gotta Keep Dancin'          Hansel, Tim 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

A story of how God worked in one man's physical and 
emotional suffering and helped him discover the real meaning 
of joy. Encourages people to more deeply understand the 
dignity of what can happen with pain. 

BR-854  You Say You're Depressed?       Deffner, Donald 
     2 Volumes; Christian Life 

Depression, God can make all the difference in overcoming it. 
 
BR-3457 Young Child's Garden of Christian Virtues/A 
                        Lawrence, Susan 
     2 Volumes; Preschool, Devotion 

To sow the seed of God's Word in your young children's hearts. 
 
BR-2069 Yours Forever               Gunn, Robin 

2 Volumes; Young Adult, Fiction; Christy Miller Series; Book 3 
of 6 
Christy Miller spends Christmas vacation back in California with 
her new friends from last summer. She has planned a romantic 
Christmas break and then learns it takes more than careful 
planning for a guy to promise. 

 
BR-2490 Zacchaeus                Kolbrek, Loyal 
     1 Volume; Primary, Children; Arch Books 
 
BR-2898 Zip, Zero, Zilch           Kindig, Tess Eileen 

1 Volume; Primary, Fiction; Slam Dunk Series; 
     Book 3 of 8 

Hoping to earn enough money to go see the Globetrotters, Mick 



agrees to babysit a rambunctious young girl. 
 


